The School Board of Broward County, Florida
Supply Management and Logistics Department

Bid No.: 25-090T Board Meeting: MARCH 15, 2005
Description: _FIRE ALARM SERVICES Notified: 574 Downloaded: 26
TERM CONTRACT Bids Rec'd: 5 No Bids: 0
For: PHYSICAL PLANT OPERATIONS Bid Opening: OCTOBER 6,2004
(School/Department)
Fund: DEPARTMENT’ OPERATING BUDGET Advertised Date: AUGUST 10, 2004
Award Amount: $4,000,000 PER CONTRACT PERIOD

POSTING OF BID RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: Bid Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in the Supply Management
and Logistics Department on DECEMBER 15,2004 @ 3:00P.M. , and will remain posted for 72 hours. Any person
desiring to protest the Bid Recommendation/Tabulation shall file, in writing, a notice of protest within - 72 hours after the time posted as stated herein,
and shall file a formal written protest within ten days after filing the notice of protest. Saturdays, Sundays, legal holidays and days during which the
school district administration is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period. Filings shall be at the office of the Director of
Supply Management and Logistics Department, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351. Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida
Statutes, states that “The formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based.” Any person who files
an action protesting and intended decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a bond, payable to The
School Board of Broward County, Florida, in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of the Board’s estimate of the total volume of the contract.

REVISED RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION

VENDOR NAME ITEM(S) AWARDED
BASS UNITED FIRE & SAFETY SYSTEMS PRIMARY VENDOR: ITEMS 1A, C,E F
2A,EF
] 3C,F, L
15T ALTERNATE: ID
2C
] 3A,B,D, LK
2N ALTERNATE: 2B,D
3E,]
FLORIDA STATE FIRE AND SECURITY PRIMARY VENDOR: ITEMS 1B,D
2B
31
15T ALTERNATE: ITEMS 1A, CEF
2A,D,EF
, 3CF G H,L
2P ALTERNATE:  ITEMS 2C
3A,B,D,JK
*  QUALITY COMMUNICATIONS 15T ALTERNATE: ITEMS 1B
(WHITE FEMALE M/WBE: FORT LAUDERDALE, FL) 2B
31
2¥P ALTERNATE: ITEMS 1 A,C,D,EF
2A,EF
3CF, G L
SIMPLEX-GRINNELL PRIMARY VENDOR: ITEMS 3 A,B.D,E, G H,J, K
2P ALTERNATE: IB
UNIVERSAL ELECTRIC PRIMARY VENDOR: ITEMS 2C,D

15T ALTERNATE: ITEMS 3E
2P ALTERNATE:  ITEMS 3 H

* CERTIFIED MWBE VENDOR



RECOMMENDATION/ TABULATION
BID 25-090T

FIRE ALRM SERVICES

PAGE 2

IN ORDER TO MEET THE NEEDS OF THE SCHOOL SYSTEM AND IN THE BEST INTEREST OF THE SCHOOL BOARD, THE ABOVE
ITEMS ARE RECOMMENDED TO BE AWARDED TO THE BIDDERS LISTED. THE LOW BIDDER FOR EACH ITEM WILL BE THE
SCHOOL BOARD’S PRIMARY VENDOR. IF THE LOW BIDDER IS UNABLE TO MEET THE BID REQUIREMENTS, THEN THE NEXT

BIDDER WILL BE UTILIZED.

CONTRACT PERIOD: MARCH 15, 2005 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2007

o 73“74{’ Date: DECEMBER 15, 2004
.

(Buyer/Purchasing Agent)

3/30/04 Equal Opportunity Employer, using Affirmative Action Guidelines



BOARD MEETING OF 11/9/04
Bid 25-090T Fire Alarm Services

summary

This is the first time that prequalification has been required for this bid.
The award of this bid has been delayed due to 2 pending protests. The
final outcome was that the vendor initiating the protest failed to post the
required bond in the established timeframe. The issue involved was
whether the bidders must go through the prequalification process and be
approved by the Board prior to the bid opening date. As a result of this
bid, the preqgualification verbiage has been revised to require that all
bidders be prequalified prior to bid opening.

The last time this bid was sent out, no quantities were used. Also, the items
were not broken down by manufacturer. The bid was awarded to all
respondents for all the items. SBBC locations contain primarily Simplex,
Notifier and FCI equipment. For that reason, the new bid broke out these
manufacturers so we could see clearly which company offered the best
pricing structure for each. bue to the competition and perhaps breaking
out the manufacturers, we will appreciate a savings on this bid of
approximately $30,870 for the term of the contract.

This bid is being awarded to the low bidder in each category. No rejections
were required. Each vendor who responded will receive a portion of the
items being awarded. All these vendors are reputable and have been used
by SBBC previously. As a result, no problems are anticipated.



Fire Alarm Services
Bid 25-090T
Summary of Coin Toss Outcomes

Item 1B

Tie bid received from two vendors. General Condition 47 states that when identical prices are received
from two or more vendors and all factors are equal, priority for award shall be given to the vendors in
sequence. Simplex Grinnell breaks the tie by winning the coin toss held in the Purchasing Department on
October 11, 2004 and becomes the second alternate awardee.

Item 1D

Tie bid received from two vendors. General Condition 47 states that when identical prices are received
from two or more vendors and all factors are equal, priority for award shall be given to the vendors in
sequence. Simplex Grinnell breaks the tie by winning the coin toss held in the Purchasing Department on
October 11, 2004 and becomes the primary awardee. Bass United Fire and Security Systems becomes the

first alternate.

Item 2B

Tie bid received from two vendors. General Condition 47 states that when identical prices are received
from two or more vendors and all factors are equal, priority for award shall be given to the vendors in
sequence. Bass United Fire and Security Systems breaks the tie by winning the coin toss held in the
Purchasing Department on October 11, 2004 and becomes the second alternate awardee.

Item 2D

Tie bid received from two vendors. General Condition 47 states that when identical prices are received
from two or more vendors and all factors are equal, priority for award shall be given to the vendors in
sequence. Florida State Fire and Security breaks the tie by winning the coin toss held in the Purchasing
Department on October 11, 2004 and becomes the first alternate awardee. Bass United Fire and Security
Systems becomes the second alternate.

Item 3E

Tie bid received from two vendors. General Condition 47 states that when identical prices are received
from two or more vendors and all factors are equal, priority for award shall be given to the vendors in
sequence. Universal Electric of Florida breaks the tie by winning the coin toss held in the Purchasing
Department on October 11, 2004 and becomes the first alternate awardee. Bass United Fire and Security
Systems becomes the second alternate.

Item 3G

Tie bid received from two vendors. General Condition 47 states that when identical prices are received
from two or more vendors and all factors are equal, priority for award shall be given to the vendors in
sequence. Quality Communications Fire and Safety breaks the tie by winning the coin toss held in the
Purchasing Department on October 11, 2004 and becomes the second alternate awardee.



Item 31

Tie bid received from two vendors. General Condition 47 states that when identical prices are received
from two or more vendors and all factors are equal, priority for award shall be given to the vendors in
sequence. Quality Communications Fire and Safety breaks the tie by winning the coin toss held in the
Purchasing Department on October 11, 2004 and becomes the first alternate awardee. Bass United Fire
and Security Systems becomes the second alternate. -

Bids were evaluated by:

7 74 770»:’

Kay Lloyd
Purchasing Agent
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BID TABULATION SHEET
BID NUMBER _ 25-090T OPEN DATE 10/06/04 BUYER Kay Lloyd
BID TITLE FIRE ALARM SERVICES
ITEM 1A JTEM 1B ITEM1C -  ITEM1D ITEM 1-E ATEM -1:F ITEM 2-A

|BIDDER'S NAME PER HOUR PER HOUR PER HOUR - PER HOUR - PER HOUR PER HOUR PERHOUR -
BASS UNITED FIRE & SECURITY SYSTEMS, INC. $210,000.00 $75,000.00 1P $210,000.00 }1 $55,000.00 $210,000.00 JP $52,000.00 $63,000.00
FLORIDA STATE FIRE & SECURITY $225,000.00 $55,000.00 } 1 $225,000.00 $55,000.00 1 1 $225,000.00 11 55.000.00}1 $67,500.00
QUALITY COMMUNICATIONS FIRE & SECURITY $250,000.00 ] 1 $70,000.00 ]2 $250,000.00 12 $70,000.00 § 2 $240,000.00 12} $68,000.00 §2 $69,000.00
SIMPLEX GRINNELL $275,000.00 12 $75,000.00 $275,000.00 $75,000.00 NO BID| NO BID $82,500.00
UNIVERSAL ELECTRIC OF FLORIDA NO BID NO BID! $255,000.00 $81,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

REMARKS:
BID DRAFT WAS APPROVED BY:

JOHN ARCESE, PHYSICAL PLANT OPE
BIDS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED BY: JOHN ARCESE, PHYSICAL PLANT O

PERATIONS, AND KAY LLOYD, C.P.M,, PURCHASIN

RATIONS, AND KAY LLOYD, C.P.M., PURCHASING A

RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE BIDDER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS, TERMS & CONDITIONS.

GENT, SUPPLY MANAGEMENT AND LOGISTICS.
G AGENT, SUPPLY MANAGEMENT AND LOGISITICS.

25.090 WORKSHEET REVISED 121404

Page 1

12/16/2004 8:53 AM



THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY
BiD NUMBER 25-090T OPEN DATE 10/06/04 BUYER____ Kaylltoyd

BID TABULATION SHEET BID TITLE Fire Alarm Services

ITEM ZB ITEM 2-C ITEM 2-D ATEM 2-E .lTEM Z-F ITEM 3-A o ITEM 3-B
BIDDER'S NAME PER HOUR- PER HOUR PER HOUR - - PER HOUR - -PER HOUR BID PRICE --BiD PRICE
BASS UNITED FIRE & SECURITY SYSTEMS i12 $18,750.00 }1 $63,000.00 }2 $13.750.00 §P] $63,000.00 {P $13,000.00 1 $66,000.00 § 1k $66,000.00
FLORIDA STATE FIRE & SECURITY P $13,750.00 ]2 $67.500.00 }1 $13,750.00 11 $67,500.00 § 1 $13.750.00 § 2 $71,500.00 | 2| $71,500.00
QUALITY COMMUNICATIONS 1 $15,750.00 $69,000.00 $15,750.00 12 $69,000.00 } 2 $15,750.00 - $88,550.00 $88,550.00
SIMPLEX GRINNELL $18,750.00 $82,500.00 $18,750.00 NO BID NO BID}P $40.700.00 $48,950.00
UNIVERSAL ELECTRIC OF FLORIDA NO BID| $51,000.00 P $13,500.00 NO BID NO BID)| NO BID $82,500.00

REMARKS:
25.090 WORKSHEET REVISED 121404 Page 2

12/16/2004 8:53 AM




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTYBID NUMBER 25-090T OPEN DATE 10/06/04 BUYER____ Kayliloyd

BID TABULATION SHEET [BiD TITLE FIRE ALARM SERVICES
ITEM 3-C ITEM 3-D ITEM 3-E. ITEM 3-F. ITEM 3G lTE_M 3H ,'TEM 3l
BIDDER'S NAME : S | BID PRICE BID PRICE - BID PRICE BID.PRICE - BID PRICE BID PRICE. BID PRICE
BASS UNITED FIRE & SAFETY SYSTEMS _ {P| $36,000.00 } 1 $35,200.00 $35,200.00 1P $15,400.00 $49,400.00 $49,400.00 }2 $22,800.00
FLORIDA STATE FIRE & SECURITY 1 $39,000.00 |2 $38,400.00 $38,400.00 {1 $16,800.00 $44,200.00 1 $44,200.00 1P $20,400.00
QUALITY COMMUNICATIONS 2 48,300.00 $46,800.00 $46,800.00 §2 $20,475.00 $49,400.00 $49,400.00 |1 $22,800.00
SIMPLEX GRINNELL NO BID! $17,560.00 $21,360.00 NO BID $19,240.00 IP $23,140.00 NO BID
UNIVERSAL ELECTRIC OF FLORIDA NO BID| NO BID $35,200.00 NO BID NO BID}2) $48,100.00 NO BID
REMARKS:
25.090 WORKSHEET REVISED 121404 Page 3

12/116/2004 8:53 AM



E SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY |BID NUMBER 25-090T OPEN DATE 10/06/04 BUYER Kay Lioyd
3 TABULATION SHEET !BID TITLE FIRE ALARM SERVICES

ITEM 3J ITEM 3K ITEM 3L
DDER'S NAME BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE
\SS UNITED FIRE & SAFETY SYSTEMS 1 $39,000.00 11 $33,800.00 JP| $15,600.00
_ORIDA STATE FIRE & SECURITY 2 $44,200.00 J2 $44,200.00 }1 $20,400.00
UALITY COMMUNICATIONS $49,400.00 $49,400.00 §2 $22,800.00
IMPLEX GRINNELL $19,240.00 P $23,140.00 NO BID

]

INIVERSAL ELECTRIC OF FLORIDA NO BID $48,100.00 NO BID

REMARKS:

25-090 WORKSHEET REVISED 121404

Page 4

12/16/2004 8:53 AM



BID : 25-090T
FIRE ALARM SERVICES
CONTRACT PERIOD: MARCH 15, 2005 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2007

ITEM DESCRIPTION PRIMARY 15T ALTERNATE 2P ALTERNATE
ITEM 1. | Labor charge per hour to provide service,
support functions, modifications, or repair to
new and existing fire alarm systems. Hourly
charge shall include travel time and expenses.
There are approximately 220 fire alarm
systems at various locations through out
SBBC.
SPECIAL NOTE: Nearly all work will be
performed between the hours of 3:00p.m. and
12:30 a.m. Hourly rates submitted need to
reflect this.
IA. Fire alarm installer rate Bass United Fire & Safety Florida State Fire & Security Quality Communications
(SIMPLEX EQUIPMENT) $42.00 per hour $45.00 per hour $50.00 per hour
1B. Fire alarm technician rate Florida State Fire & Security Quality Communications Simplex Grinnell
(SIMPLEX EQUIPMENT) $55.00 per hour $70.00 per hour $75.00 per hour
IC. Fire alarm installer rate Bass United Fire & Safety Florida State Fire & Security Quality Communications
(NOTIFIER EQUIPMENT) $42.00 per hour $45.00 per hour $50.00 per hour
D Fire alarm technician rate Florida State Fire & Security Bass United Fire & Safety Quality Communications

(NOTIFIER EQUIPMENT)

$55.00 per hour

$55.00 per hour

$70.00 per hour




BID : 25-090T
FIRE ALARM SERVICES
CONTRACT PERIOD: MARCH 15,2005 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2007

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

PRIMARY

15T ALTERNATE

NP ALTERNATE

ITEM 1.

Labor charge per hour to provide service,
support functions, modifications, or repair to
new and existing fire alarm systems. Hourly
charge shall include travel time and expenses.
There are approximately 220 fire alarm
systems at various locations through out
SBBC.

SPECIAL NOTE: Nearly all work will be
performed between the hours of 3:00p.m. and
12:30 a.m. Hourly rates submitted need to
reflect this.

1E.

Fire alarm installer rate
(FCI EQUIPMENT)

Bass United Fire & Safety
$42.00 per hour

Florida State Fire & Security
$45.00 per hour

Quality Communications
$48.00 per hour

1F.

Fire alarm technician rate
(FCI EQUIPMENT)

Bass United Fire & Safety
$52.00 per hour

Florida State Fire & Security
$55.00 per hour

Quality Communications
$68.00 per hour

ITEM 1:

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION:

Bass United Fire & Safety

1/2 hour fire alarm installer rate

1/4 hour fire alarm installer rate

Fire Alarm installer rate

$21.00
$11.00
FARADAY  $42.00 per hour

Fire Alarm technician rate FARADAY $47.00 per hour

Parts Cost: 31%

Specified MFG of Parts: Fire Control Instruments (FCI), Farady, Fire- Lite, Gamewell




BID : 25-090T
FIRE ALARM SERVICES
CONTRACT PERIOD: MARCH 15,2005 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2007

ITEM 1: ADDITIONAL INFORMATION:

Florida State Fire & Security 1/2 hour fire alarm installer rate  NA
1/4 hour fire alarm installer rate  NA

Fire Alarm installer rate NA
Fire Alarm technician rate NA
Parts Cost: 40% Specified MFG of Parts: Notifier, Fire Lite, Silent Knight

ITEM 1: ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

Quality Communications 1/2 hour fire alarm installer rate ~ $24.00
1/4 hour fire alarm installer rate  $12.00
Fire Alarm installer rate (FCI) $46.00 per hour
Fire Alarm technician rate (FCI) $68.00 per hour
Parts Cost: 35% Specified MFG of Parts: Fire Control Instrument (FCIH

Delivery: 3% of Equipment Cost

ITEM 1: ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

Simplex Grinnell 1/2 hour fire alarm installer rate ~ $27.50
1/4 hour fire alarm installer rate ~ $13.75
Fire Alarm installer rate Simplex /Notifier $55.00 per hour
Fire Alarm technician rate Simplex/ Notifier $75.00 per hour
Parts Cost: 30% Specified MFG of Parts: Simplex

Delivery: FOB Customer Site



BID : 25-090T
FIRE ALARM SERVICES
CONTRACT PERIOD: MARCH 15, 2005 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2007

ITEM 1: ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

Universal Electric 1/2 hour fire alarm installer rate
1/4 hour fire alarm installer rate
Fire Alarm installer rate
Fire Alarm technician rate
Parts Cost: 40% Specified MFG of Parts:

$41.00

$27.00

Notifier/Firelite $54.00 per hour
Notifier/Firelite $81.00 per hour
Notifier, Firelite

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

PRIMARY

15T ALTERNATE 2P AT TERNATE

ITEM 2.

(TO BE AWARDED BY LINE ITEM)
Labor charge per hour to provide services,
support functions, modifications or repair
to new and existing fire alarm systems.
Hourly charge shall include travel time and
expenses. There are approximately 220 fire
alarm systems at various locations
throughout SBBC.

SPECIAL NOTE: A minimal amount of
work will be performed between the hours of
7:00a.m. and 3:00p.m.

2A.

Fire alarm installer rate
(SIMPLEX EQUIPMENT)

Bass United Fire & Safety
$42.00 per hour

Florida State Fire & Security Quality Communications
$45.00 per hour $46.00 per hour




BID : 25-090T
FIRE ALARM SERVICES
CONTRACT PERIOD: MARCH 15,2005 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2007

ITEM 2. DESCRIPTION PRIMARY 15T ALTERNATE 2"° ALTERNATE
ITEM2. | (TO BE AWARDED BY LINE ITEM)

Labor charge per hour to provide services,
support functions, modifications or repair
to new and existing fire alarm systems.
Hourly charge shall include travel time and
expenses. There are approximately 220 fire
alarm systems at various locations
throughout SBBC.
SPECIAL NOTE: A minimal amount of
work will be performed between the hours of
7:00a.m. and 3:00p.m.

2B. Fire alarm technician rate Florida State Fire & Security Quality Communications Bass United Fire & Safety
(SIMPLEX EQUIPMENT) $55.00 per hour $63.00 per hour $75.00 per hour

2C. Fire alarm installer rate Universal Electric Bass United Fire & Safety Florida State Fire & Security
(NOTIFIER EQUIPMENT) $34.00 per hour $42.00 per hour $45.00 per hour

2D. Fire alarm technician rate Universal Electric Florida State Fire & Security Bass United Fire & Safety
(NOTIFIER EQUIPMENT) $54.00 per hour $55.00 per hour $55.00 per hour

2E. Fire Alarm installer rate Bass United Fire & Safety Florida State Fire & Security Quality Communications
(FCI EQUIPMENT) $42.00 per hour $45.00 per hour $46.00 per hour

2F. Bass United Fire & Safety Florida State Fire & Security Quality Communications

Fire alarm technician rate
(FCI1 EQUIPMENT)

$52.00 per hour

$55.00 per hour

$63.00 per hour




BID : 25-090T
FIRE ALARM SERVICES
CONTRACT PERIOD: MARCH 15,2005 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2007

ITEM2: ADDITIONAL INFORMATION:

Bass United Fire & Safety 1/2 hour fire alarm installer rate ~ $21.00
1/4 hour fire alarm installer rate ~ $11.00
Fire Alarm installer rate FARADAY _ $42.00 per hour
Fire Alarm technician rate  FARADAY_ _ $52.00 per hour
Parts Cost: 31% Specified MFG of Parts: Fire Control Instruments (FCI), Farady, Fire- Lite, Gamewell

ITEM2: ADDITIONAL INFORMATION:

Florida State Fire & Security 1/2 hour fire alarm installer rate  NA
1/4 hour fire alarm installer rate ~ NA

Fire Alarm installer rate NA
Fire Alarm technician rate NA
Parts Cost: 40% Specified MFG of Parts: Notifier, Fire Lite, Silent Knight

ITEM 2: ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

Quality Communications 1/2 hour fire alarm installer rate ~ $23.00
1/4 hour fire alarm installer rate ~ $11.50
Fire Alarm installer rate (FCI)_$46.00 per hour
Fire Alarm technician rate (FCI)_$63.00 per hour
Parts Cost: 35% Specified MFG of Parts:  Fire Control Instrument (FCI)

Delivery: 3% of Equipment Cost



BID : 25-090T
FIRE ALARM SERVICES
CONTRACT PERIOD: MARCH 15,2005 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2007

ITEM 2: ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

SIMPLEX GRINNELL 1/2 hour fire alarm installer rate ~ $27.50
1/4 hour fire alarm installer rate ~ $13.75 _
Fire Alarm installer rate (SIMPLEX/ NOTIFIER) $55.00 per hour
Fire Alarm technician rate (SIMPLEX/ NOTIFIER) $75.00 per hour
Parts Cost: 30% Specified MFG of Parts: SIMPLEX

DELIVERY: FOB CUSTOMER SITE

ITEM2: ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

UNIVERSAL ELECTRIC _1/2 hour fire alarm installer rate $41.00
1/4 hour fire alarm installer rate ~ $27.00

Fire Alarm installer rate NOTIFIER/FIRELITE _$54.00 per hour
Fire Alarm technician rate NOTIFIER/FIRELITE _$81.00 per hour

Parts Cost: 40% Specified MFG of Parts: NOTIFIER, FIRELITE




BID : 25-090T
FIRE ALARM SERVICES
CONTRACT PERIOD: MARCH 15,2005 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28,2007

ITEM 3.

DESCRIPTION
TO BE AWARDED BY LINE ITEM

PRIMARY

15T ALTERNATE

2" ALTERNATE

3A.

Provide annual testing, inspection and
certification of SIMPLEX alarm
systems for elementary schools
(average number of initiating devices is
150, to include the required 25% of all
heat detectors).

Pricing not to exceed $1,800 per
location.

Simplex- Grinnell
$740.00 each

Bass United Fire & Safety
$1200.00 each

Florida State Fire & Security
$1300.00 each

3B.

Provide annual testing, inspection and
certification of NOTIFIER alarm
systems for elementary schools
(average number of initiating devices is
150, to include the required 25% of all
heat detectors).

Pricing not to exceed $1,800 per
location.

Simplex- Grinnell
$890.00 each

Bass United Fire & Safety
$1200.00 each

Florida State Fire & Security
$1300.00 each

3C.

Provide annual testing, inspection and
certification of FCI alarm systems for
elementary schools (average number of
initiating devices 1s

150, to include the required 25% of all
heat detectors).

Pricing not to exceed $1,800 per
location.

Bass United Fire & Safety
$1200.00 each

Florida State Fire and Security
$1300.00 each

Quality Communications
$1610.00 each




BID : 25-090T
FIRE ALARM SERVICES
CONTRACT PERIOD: MARCH 15,2005 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28,2007

ITEM 3. DESCRIPTION PRIMARY 1" ALTERNATE 2"° ALTERNATE
TO BE AWARDED BY LINE ITEM
3D. Provide annual testing, inspection and Simplex- Grinnell Bass United Fire & Safety Florida State Fire & Security
certification of SIMPLEX alarm $1110.00 each $2200.00 each $2400.00 each
systems for middle schools (average
number of initiating devices is
250, to include the required 25% of all
heat detectors).
3E. Provide annual testing, inspection and Simplex- Grinnell Universal Electric Bass United Fire & Safety
certification of NOTIFIER alarm $1335.00 each $2200.00 each $2200.00 each
systems for middle schools (average
number of initiating devices is
250, to include the required 25% of all
heat detectors).
Provide annual testing, inspection and Bass United Fire & Safety Florida State Fire & Security Quality Communications
3F. $2200.00 each $2400.00 each $2925.00 each

certification of FCI alarm systems for
middle schools (average number of
initiating devices 1s

150, to include the required 25% of all
heat detectors).




BID : 25-090T
FIRE ALARM SERVICES
CONTRACT PERIOD: MARCH 15,2005 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2007

ITEM 3. DESCRIPTION PRIMARY 1" ALTERNATE 2"° ALTERNATE
TO BE AWARDED BY LINE ITEM
3G. Provide annual testing, inspection and Simplex- Grinnell Florida State Fire & Security Quality Communications
certification of SIMPLEX alarm $1,480.00 each $3,400.00 each $3,800.00 each
systems for high schools (average
number of initiating devices is
350, to include the required 25% of all
heat detectors).
3H. Provide annual testing, inspection and Simplex- Grinnell Florida State Fire & Security Universal Electric
certification of NOTIFIER alarm $1,780.00 each $3,400.00 each $3,700.00 each
systems for high schools (average
number of initiating devices is
350, to include the required 25% of all
heat detectors).
Provide annual testing, inspection and Florida State Fire & Security Quality Communications Bass United Fire & Safety
3L $3400.00 each $3,800.00 each $3,800.00 each

certification of FCI alarm systems for
high schools (average number of
initiating devices is

350, to include the required 25% of all
heat detectors).




BID : 25-090T
FIRE ALARM SERVICES
CONTRACT PERIOD: MARCH 15,2005 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2007

ITEM 3.

DESCRIPTION
TO BE AWARDED BY LINE ITEM

PRIMARY

15T ALTERNATE

28 ALTERNATE

3J.

Provide annual testing, inspection and
certification of SIMPLEX alarm
systems for adult/vocation, centers
and administrative sites (average
number of initiating devices is

350, to include the required 25% of all
heat detectors).

Simplex- Grinnell
$1,480.00 each

Bass United Fire & Safety
$3,000.00 each

Florida State Fire & Security
$3,400.00 each

3K.

Provide annual testing, inspection and
certification of NOTIFIER alarm
systems for adult/vocation, centers
and administrative sites (average
number of initiating devices is

350, to include the required 25% of all
heat detectors).

Simplex- Grinnell
$1,780.00 each

Bass United Fire & Safety
$2,600.00 each

Florida State Fire & Security
$3,400.00 each

3L.

Provide annual testing, inspection and
certification of FCI alarm systems for
adult/vocation, centers and

administrative sites (average number
of initiating devices is 350, to include

the required 25% of all heat detectors).

Bass United Fire & Safety
$2,600.00 each

Florida State Fire & Security
$3,400.00 each

Quality Communications
$3,800.00 each




BID : 25-090T
FIRE ALARM SERVICES
CONTRACT PERIOD: MARCH 15, 2005 THROUGH

ITEM 3. ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

BASS UNITED FIRE & SECURITY

A.

B.

e

IS

I

FEBRUARY 28, 2007

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification of FARADAY alarm systems for elementary schools (average
number of initiating devices is 150, to include the required 25% of all heat detectors). $900.00 each

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification of EDWARDS alarm systems for middle schools (average
number of initialing devices is 250, to include the required 25% of all heat detectors). $2600.00 each

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification of EDWARDS alarm systems for high schools (average
number of initiating devices is 350, to include the required 25% of all heat detectors).  $3,800.00 each

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification of FARADAY alarm systems for adult/vocation and centers

schools (average number of initialing devices is 350, to include the required

25% of all heat detectors).

2.600.00 each

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification of FIRE -LITE_alarm systems for portable/modular units

schools (average number of initialing devices is 80, to include the required 2

5% of all heat detectors).

990.00 each



BID : 25-090T
FIRE ALARM SERVICES
CONTRACT PERIOD: MARCH 15, 2005 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2007

ITEM 3. ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

FLORIDA STATE FIRE & SECURITY

A.

B.

e

IS

I

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification of FIRE-LITE/ NOTIFIER alarm systems for elementary schools
(average number of initiating devices is 150, to include the required 25% of all heat detectors). ~ $1,300.00 each

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification of FIRE-LITE/NOTIFIER alarm systems for middle schools (average
number of initialing devices is 250, to include the required 25% of all heat detectors).  $2,400.00 each

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification of FIRE-LITE/NOTIFIER alarm systems for high schools (average
number of initiating devices is 350, to include the required 25% of all heat detectors). $3.400.00 each

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification of FIRE-LITE/NOTIFIER alarm systems for adult/vocation and centers
schools (average number of initialing devices is 350, to include the required 25% of all heat detectors). $3.400.00 each

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification of FIRE _LITE/NOTIFIER alarm systems for portable/modular units
schools (average number of initialing devices is NA, to include the required 25% of all heat detectors).  $1.300.00 each




BID : 25-090T
FIRE ALARM SERVICES
CONTRACT PERIOD: MARCH 15,2005 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28,2007

ITEM 3. ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

QUALITY COMMUNICATION

A.

B.

le

IS

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification of FCU SIMPLEX/NOTIFIER/FIRELITE elementary
Schools (average number of initialing devices is 150, to include the required 25% of all heat detectors). $1600.00 each

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification of FCI/ SIMPLEX/NOTIFIER/FIRELITE alarm systems for middle
schools (average number of initialing devices is 250, to include the required 25% of all heat detectors). $2900.00 each

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification of FCI/ SIMPLEX/NOTIFIER/FIRELITE alarm systems for high schools
(average number of initiating devices is 350, to include the required 25% of all heat detectors). $3.800.00 each

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification of FC/IMPLEX/NOTIFIER/FIRELITE alarm systems for adult/

vocation and center (average number of initiating devices is 350, to include the required 25% of all heat detectors).
$3800.00 eAch

Provide annual testing, inspection and certification of FCI/SIMPLEX/NOTIFIER/FIRE-LITE alarm systems for portable/
modular units schools (average number of initialing devices is 35 to include the required 25% of all heat detectors).

$650.00 each

ITEM 3: ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

SIMPLEX GRINNELL, NA




BID : 25-090T
FIRE ALARM SERVICES
CONTRACT PERIOD: MARCH 15, 2005 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2007

ITEM 3. ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

UNIVERSAL ELECTRIC OF FLORIDA

A. Provide annual testing, inspection and certification of NOTIFIER alarm systems for elementary schools average
number of initialing devices is 150, to include the required 25% of all heat detectors). $1.800.00 ea

B. Provide annual testing, inspection and certification of NOTIFIER alarm systems for middle
schools (average number of initialing devices is 250, to include the required 25% of all heat detectors). $2,500.00 each
C. Provide annual testing, inspection and certification of NOTIFIER alarm systems for high schools (average number
of initiating devices is 350, to include the required 25% of all heat detectors). $4.000.00 each
D. Provide annual testing, inspection and certification of NOTIFIER alarm systems for adult/vocation and center
(average number of initiating devices is 350, to include the required 25% of all heat detectors). $4,000.00 each
E. Provide annual testing, inspection and certification of Fire Lite alarm systems for portable/ modular units schools

(average number of initialing devices is NA, to include the required 25% of all heat detectors). $1.000.00 each







BID : 25-090T
FIRE ALARM SERVICES
CONTRACT PERIOD: MARCH 15,2005 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2007

Bass United Fire & Security Systems, Inc.
Brad Higdon

1480 SW 3™ Street

Pompano Beach, Florida 33069

Tele#: 954 785-7800
Fax #: 954 785-7804

Florida State Fire & Security
Robert Wolk

3921 SW 47 Avenue, #1004
Davie, Florida 33314

Tele#: 954 791-1313 x22
Fax#. 954 791-0688

Quality Communications Fire & Security, Inc.
Andrew Carroll

3700 SW 30" Avenue

Fort Lauderdale, Florida 33312



BID : 25-090T
FIRE ALARM SERVICES
CONTRACT PERIOD: MARCH 15,2005 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2007

Tele#: 954 584-4111
Fax#: 954 584-7940

Simplex Grinnell

Al Diaz

10550 Commerce Parkway
Miramar, Florida 33025

Tele#t: 954 431-3700
Fax#: 954 435-6650

Universal Electric of Florida
Phillip L. Kroyman Jr.

5311 NW 22™ Avenue
Tamarac, Florida 33309

Tele#: 954 484-5233
Fax#: 954 484-5487




THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLO

RIDA

i 7720 WEST OAKLAND PARK BOULEVARD, SUITE 323 » SUNRISE, FLORIDA 33351-6704 « TEL 754-321-0505

DONNIE CARTER
Director of Supply Management and Logistics

Chair
Viee Chair

September 8, 2004
ADDENDUM NO. 1

Bid No. 25-090T
Fire Alarm Services

CALLED FOR 2:00 P.M., SEPTEMBER 25, 2004
TO ALL BIDDERS:

This amends the above referenced bid in the following particulars only:

'SCHOOL BOARD

CAROLE L. ANDREWS
STEPHANIE ARMA KRAFT, ESQ
JUDIE S. BUDNICK

DARLA L. CARTER

BEVERLY A. GALLAGHER

DR. ROBERT D. PARKS
MARTY RUBINSTEIN

LOIS WEXLER

BENJAMIN J. WILLIAMS

DR. FRANK TILL
Superintendent of Schools

1. The bid opening date has been postponed until further notice. Due to Hurricane Frances and the emergency repairs

on-going by district Maintenance Staff, an addendum with changes, responses to questi
date and will be announced via DemandStar as soon as possible.

Sincerely,

o

ons and a new bid opening

Kay Lloyd, C.P.M.
Purchasing Agent

Transforming Education: One Student at A Time

Broward County Public Schools Is An Equal Opportunity/Equal Access Employer



~ THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA

e el 7720 WEST OAKLAND PARK BOULEVARD, SUITE 323 « SUNRISE, FLORIDA 33351-6704 « TEL 754-321-0505

" DONNIE CARTER SCHOOL BOARD

Director of Supply Management and Logistics
Chair  CAROLE L. ANDREWS
Vice Chair  STEPHANIE ARMA KRAFT, ESQ

JUDIE 8. BUDNICK
DARLA L. CARTER
BEVERLY A. GALLAGHER
DR. ROBERT D. PARKS
MARTY RUBINSTEIN
LOIS WEXLER
BENJAMIN J. WILLIAMS

September 23, 2004 © DRFRANKTILL

Superintendent of Schools

ADDENDUM NO. 2
Bid No. 25-090T
Fire Alarm Services

CALLED FOR 2:00 P.M., (ADDENDUM 1 POSTPONED THE BID OPENING DATE)
TO ALL BIDDERS:

This amends the above referenced RFP in the following particulars only:

1. Answers to questions received.

2. Delete Cover Page and Pages 4, 7, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13,14, 15,17, 19, and 21 of 24 Pages
Insert Cover Page and Pages 4, 7, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14,15, 17, 19, and 21 of 24 Pages -
REVISED -

Insert New Pages 12A, 13A, 14A, 14B of 24 Pages
3. NEW BID OPENING DATE WILL BE OCTOBER 1, 2004 AT 2:00 P.M.

By virtue of signing the “Invitation to Bid”, Page 1 of Bid 25-090T, bidder certifies acceptance of this

Addendum.
Sincerely,
Kay Lloyd, C.P.M.
Purchasing Agent
Attachments

Transforming Education: One Student at A Time

Broward County Public Schools Is An Equal Opportunity/Equal Access Employer



QUESTION #1: ;

Page 12, 10,000 labor hours. How is this to be broken down? 10,000 hours per A and B or 5,000 hours (each) for A
and B? ;

ANSWER TO QUESTION #1:

The bid summary sheet has been revised to show each item by manufacturer. Award will be made per item. The

approximate number of hours is indicated for each item.

QUESTION #2:
How many vendors will be considered for award? Total low bid or by facility?

ANSWER TO QUESTION #2:
Award will be made per item by manufacturer.

QUESTION #3:
Will there potentially be more than one (lowest) bidder awarded the contract?

ANSWER TO QUESTION #3:
Awards will be made to a primary, 1stand 2nd glternate as appropriate.

QUESTION #4:
What criteria will determine awardees other than lowest bidder?

ANSWER TO QUESTION #4:
Award will be made per item by manufacturer based on lowest price.

Bid No. 25-090T - Addendum 2



ITB 25-090T FIRE ALARM SERVICES

IMPORTANT NOTICE TO ALL BIDDERS

Notice is hereby given that The School Board of Broward County, Florida (SBBC), pursuant to School Board Policy 7011,
will be receiving applications for all contractors interested in bidding on this contract. Please be advised that on July 14,
July 21 and July 28, 2004, by Public Announcement, SBBC will be announcing that in order for bids for this project to be
accepted by SBBC, the bidder must have submitted a Pre-Qualification Application by the deadline of 2:00 p.m., on
August 18, 2004, or have been notified that the Contractor Prequalification Review Committee has recommended or
SBBC has approved the firm as pre-qualified. Bids submitted from firms not in compliance with these requirements will

not be considered.

All interested parties shall obtain Pre-Qualification Application material through one of the following three locations:

1. http://www.broward.k1 2 | us/constructioncontracts/ CPQRC/00462%20Pre-Qual%20Application%2002-11-03.pdf

or

http://www.browardschools.com then click on departments on left side of web site.

Find Facilities and Construction Management and click on it

Under “important Links” in the right column, click on “construction contracts” and look for
“Print the Pre-Qualification Application” link and click - Adobe will open and then you can print

2. SBBC Facilities and Construction Management Division
1700 SW 14 Court
Fort Lauderdale, Florida 33312
(954) 765-6390

The materials are available immediately and shall be delivered by the applicant according to the instructions including in the
Pre-Qualification Application materials on or before the following date at the location indicated below:

2:00 p.m. on August 18, 2004
SBBC Facilities and Construction Management Division

1700 SW 14 Court
Fort Lauderdale, Florida 33312

To obtain a copy of the full text of School Board Policy 7011, please go to the following hypertext:

hitp://www.broward.k12.fl.us/sbbepolicies




36. PROTESTING OF BID CONDITIONS/SPECIFICATIONS: Any person desiring to
protest the conditions/specifications in this bid, or any Addendum subsequently
released thereto, shall file a notice of protest, in writing, within 72 consecutive hours
after the receipt of the bid or Addendum and shall file a formal written protest within
ten calendar days after the date the notice of protest was filed. The time provided for
filing a notice of protest shall be based upon whenever a person receives this bid, or
any Addendum released thereto. Receipt of a copy of this bid, or any Addendum
released thereto, which is received in accordance with Chapter 119, Florida
Statutes, or School Board Policy 1343, as currently enacted or as amended from
time to time, shall not be used as a basis for filing a notice of protest as described
herein. Saturdays, Sundays, legal holidays and days during which the school district
administration is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72 consecutive
hours. If the tenth calendar day falls on a Saturday, Sunday, legal holidays and days
during which the school district administration is closed, the formal written protest
must be received on or before 5:00 p.m. of the next calendar day that is not a
Saturday, Sunday, legal holiday and days during which the school district
administration is closed. Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes, as currently enacted
or as amended from time to time, states that “The formal written protest shall
state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based”.

Failure to file a notice of protest or to file a formal written protest within
the time prescribed by Section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, shall constitute a
waiver of proceedings under School Board Policy 3320 and Chapter 120,
Florida Statutes. The failure to post the bond required by School Board
Policy 3320, Part VI, within the time prescribed by School Board Policy
3320, Part V1, as currently enacted or as amended from time to time, shall
constitute a waiver of proceedings under School Board Policy 3320 and
Chapter 120, Florida Statutes. Notices of protest, formal written protests,
and the bonds required by School Board Policy 3320, Part VI, shall be filed
at the office of the Director of Supply Management and Logistics, 7720
West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351 (fax 754-
321-0936). Fax filing will not be acceptable for the filing of bonds required
by School Board Policy 3320, Part VL.

3. POSTING OF BID RECOMMENDATIONS/TABULATIONS: Bid Recommendations
and Tabulations will be posted in the Supply Management and Logistics Department
on OCTOBER 7. 2004 at 3:00 p.m., and will remain posted for 72 consecutive
hours. Any change to the date and time established herein for posting of Bid
Recommendations/Tabulations shall be posted in the Supply Management and
Logistics Department and/or at www.demandstar.com (under the document section
for this ITB). In the event the date and time of the posting of Bid
Recommendations/Tabulations is changed, it is the responsibility of each bidder to
ascertain the revised date of the posting of Bid Recommendations/Tabulations. Any
person desiring to protest the intended decision shall file a notice of protest, in
writing, within 72 consecutive hours after the posting of the bid tabulation (or receipt
of written notice of intended decision) and shall file a formal written protest within ten
calendar days after the date the notice of protest was filed. A written notice of
intended decision shall only apply when the Supply Management and Logistics
Department gives notice of an intended decision about this bid. A written notice of
intended decision received in accordance with Chapter 119, Florida Statutes, or
Schoot Board Policy 1343, as currently enacted or as amended from time to time,
shall not be used as a basis for fiing a notice of protest as described herein.
Saturaa:\.y.ls, Sundays, legal holidays and days during which the school district
administration is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72 consecutive
hours. If the tenth calendar day falls on a Saturday, Sunday, legal holidays and
days during which the school district administration is closed, the formal written
protest must be received on or before 5:00 p.m. of the next calendar day that is nota
Saturday, Sunday, legal hofiday and days during which the school district
administration is closed. No submissions made after the bid opening amending or
supplementing the bid shall be considered. Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes,
as currently enacted or as amended from time to time, states that “The formal
written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the
protest is based”. Any person who files an action protesting an intended decision
shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a
pond, payable to The School Board of Broward County, Florida, in an amount equal
to one percent (1%) of the Board's estimate of the total volume of the contract. The
School Board shall provide the estimated contract amount to the vendor within 72
hours, excluding Saturdays, Sundays and other days during which the School Board
administration is closed, of receipt of notice of intent to protest. The estimated
contract amount shall be established on the award recommendation as the "contract
award amount’. The estimated contract amount is not subject to protest pursuant to
Section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes. The bond shall be conditioned upon the
payment of all costs which may be adjudged against the protestant in an
Administrative Hearing in which the action is brought and in any subsequent
appefiate court proceeding. In fieu of a bond, the School Board may accept a
cashier's check, official bank check or money order in the amount of the bond. If,
after completion of the Administrative Hearing

37.

38.

39.

40.

41.

{Continued): process and any appellate court proceedings, the School Board prevails,
and then the School Board shall recover all costs and charges which shall be included
in the Final Order or judgment, including charges made by the Division of
Administrative Hearings, but excluding attorney's fees. Upon payment of such costs
and charges by the protestant, the bond shall be retumed. If the protestant prevails,
then the protestant shali recover from the Board all costs and charges which shall be
inctuded in the Final Order or judgment, exciuding attorey's fees.

Failure to file a notice of protest or to file a formal written protest within the time
prescribed by Section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, shall constitute a waiver of
proceedings under School Board Poticy 3320 and Chapter 120, Florida Statutes.
The failure to post the bond required by School Board Policy 3320, Part Vi,
within the time prescribed by School Board Policy 3320, Part VI, as currently
enacted or as amended from time to time, shall constitute a waiver of
proceedings under School Board Policy 3320 and Chapter 120, Florida Statutes.
Notices of protest, formal written protests, and the bonds required by School
Board Policy 3320, Part VI, shall be filed at the office of the Director of Supply
Management and Logistics, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323,
Sunrise, Florida 33351 (fax 754-321-0936). Fax filing will not be acceptable for
the filing of bonds required by School Board Policy 3320, Part V1.

SUBMITTAL OF BIDS: All bidders are reminded that it is the sole responsibility of the
BIDDER to assure that their bid is time stamped in the SUPPLY MANAGEMENT AND
LOGISTICS DEPARTMENT on or before 2:00 p.m. on date due. The address for bid
submittal, including hand delivery and overnight courier delivery, is indicated as: 7720
West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351. The bidder is fully
and completely responsible for the payment of all delivery costs associated with the
delivery of their bid or related material. The Supply Management and Logistics
Department will not accept delivery of any bid or related material requiring the School
Board to pay for any portion of the delivery cost or the complete delivery cost. Prior to
bid submittal, it is the responsibility of the bidder to be certain that all addendum
released have been received, that all addendum requirements have been completed,
and that all submittals required by the addendum have been timely filed. {See General
Condition 1.)

PACKING SLIPS: It will be the responsibility of the awardee to attach all packing slips
to the OUTSIDE of each shipment. Packing slip must reference SBBC purchase order
number/control number. Failure to provide packing slip attached fo the outside of
shipment will result in refusal of shipment at vendor's expense.

USE OF OTHER CONTRACTS: SBBC reserves the right to utilize any other SBBC

contract, any State of Florida Confract, any contract awarded by any other city or
county governmental agencies, other school board, other community college/state
university system cooperative bid agreement, or to directly negotiate/purchase per
School Board policy and/or State Board Rule 6A-1.012, as currently enacted or as
amended from time to time, in lieu of any offer received or award made as a result of
this bid if it is in its best interest to do so.

INDEMNIFICATION:

a) SBBC agrees to be fully responsible for its acts of negligence, or its-agents' acts
of negligence when acting within the scope of their employment and agrees to be
liable for any damages resulting from said negligence. Nothing herein is intended
to serve as a waiver of sovereign immunity by SBBC. Nothing herein shall be
construed as consent by SBBC to be sued by third parties in any matter arising
out of any contract.

b)  VENDOR agrees to indemnify, hold harmless and defend SBBC, its agents,
servants and employees from any and all claims, judgments, costs and
expenses including, but not limited to, reasonable attorney’s fees, reasonable
investigative and discovery costs, court costs and all other sums which SBBC,
its agents, servants and employees may pay or become obligated to pay on
account of any, alt and every claim or demand, or assertion of liability, or any
claim or action founded thereon, arising or alleged to have arisen out of the
products, goods or services furnished by the VENDOR, its agents, servants or
employees; the equipment of the VENDOR, its agents, servants or employees
while such equipment is on premises owned or controlled by SBBC; or the
negligence of VENDOR or the negligence of VENDOR's agents when acting
within the scope of their employment, whether such claims, judgments, costs
and expenses be for damages, damage to property including SBBC's
property, and injury or death of any person whether employed by the
VENDOR, SBBC or otherwise.

Revised 7/14/2004

Broward County Public Schools Is An Equal Opportunity/Equal Access Employer

Page 4 - REVISED -




Bid No. 25-090T
Page 7 of 24 Pages

BID PROPOSAL - REVISED -

VENDOR NAME:

KL/l

ECTION 4, SPECIAL CONDITIONS

INTRODUCTION AND SCOPE: The School Board of Broward County, Florida (hereinafter referred to as “SBBC)
desires bids on FIRE ALARM SERVICES as specified herein. Prices quoted shall include inside delivery and
services at various schools, departments and centers within Broward County, Florida. The awardee(s) will receive
individual purchase orders specifying the school’s name and ship to address. SBBC locations may issue open
(blanket) purchase orders as required. Receipt of open orders does not authorize the release or shipment of any
goods or service. For all open orders, parts and services will be ordered on an as needed basis through the use of
an order form. Shipments received as a result of an open order, where an order form has not been released, will
not be accepted and no cost shall be incurred by SBBC as a result.

TERM: The award of this bid shall establish a contract for the period beginning December 1, 2004 and

continuing through February 28, 2007. Bids will not be considered for a shorter period of time. All prices quoted
must be firm throughout the contract period. tems will be ordered on an as needed basis.

PRE-QUALIFICATION APPLICATION: Notice is hereby given that SBBC, pursuant to School Board Policy 7011,
will be receiving applications for all contractors interested in bidding on this contract. Please be advised that on
July 14, July 21 and July 28, 2004, by Public Announcement, SBBC will be announcing that in order for bids for this
project to be accepted by SBBC, the bidder must have submitted a Pre-Qualification Application by the deadline of
2:00 p.m. on August 18, 2004, or have been notified that the Contractor Prequalification Review committee has
recommended or SBBC has approved the firm as pre-qualified. Bids submitied from firms not in compliance
with these requirements will not be considered.

AWARD: In order to meet the needs of the school system and SBBC, each LINE ITEM shall be awarded up to one
primary and up to two alternate responsive and responsible bidders meeting specifications, terms and conditions.
The lowest awardee in an item or group shall be considered the primary vendor and should receive the largest
volume of work. SBBC reserves the right to procure goods from the second and third lowest bidders if: a) the
lowest bidder cannot comply with delivery requirements or specifications; b) the lowest bidder is not in compliance
with delivery requirements or specifications on current or previous orders; ¢) in cases of emergency; d) it is in the
best interest of SBBC to do so regardless of reason.

After award of this bid, any bidder receiving an award who violates any specification, term or condition of this bid
can be found in default of its contract, have its contract canceled, be subject to the payment of liquidated damages,
and be removed from the bid list and not be eligible to do business with this School Board for two years, as
described in General Conditions 3, 23 and 24.




Bid No. 25-090T
Page 9 of 24 Pages
The School Board of Broward County, Florida -REVISED -
FIRE ALARM SERVICES ,

SECTION 4, SPECIAL CONDITIONS (Continued)

11.  ADDING OR DELETING SITES: SBBC may, during the term of the contract, add or delete service, wholly or in
part, at any District site. In the event that a site listed herein is deleted, the quoted cost for the services being
deleted shall be removed from the monthly invoice amount. In the event that a site not listed herein is added to the
contract, the bidder shall invoice the same amount as prices quoted herein for similar services.

12. MANUFACTURER’S CERTIFICATION: It is preferred that bidder(s) are an authorized dealer to sell, warranty
and service that manufacturer(s)' product. If so, the manufacturer(s) must execute the applicable part of the
certification document and bidder must also execute applicable part. The certification must be returned with the bid

or upon request.

13. COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE: Bidder(s) must indicate in the space provided on the Bid Summary Sheet the
name, address and telephone number of the representative who could make scheduled visits to SBBC locations
and who will be available upon request to resolve any issues.

14. INVOICES: Delivery copies, packing slips and invoices to SBBC MUST include the following to permit SBBC to
verify prices with this contract and expedite the use of material. FAILURE OF AN AWARDEE TO PROVIDE THIS
INFORMATION WILL RESULT IN EITHER THE INVOICE BEING RETURNED FOR CLARIFICATION OR A
DELAY IN PROCESSING SAID INVOICE FOR PAYMENT. Invoices are to be mailed to District Maintenance,
3810 N. W. 10th Avenue, Fort Lauderdale, Florida 33309.

Material release number OR the control number

Purchase order number

Complete description of the items

[temized list prices

Total dollar amount will be net

moow»>

15.  PROTECTION OF WORK, PROPERTY AND PERSONNEL: The awardee(s) shall at all times guard against
damage and/or loss to the property of the School Board, and shall replace and/or repair any loss or damages
unless caused by the School Board. The School Board may withhold payment or make such deductions, as it
might deem necessary, to insure reimbursement for loss and/or damages to the property through negligence of the
awardee(s). The awardee(s) shall take the necessary safety precautions to protect both personnel and property
while the work is in progress.

16.  ACCEPTANCE OF MATERIALS: The material delivered under this bid shall remain the property of the seller until
a physical inspection and actual usage of this material is made and thereafter accepted to the satisfaction of SBBC
and must comply with the terms herein, and be fully in accord with specifications. In the event the material supplied
to SBBC is found to be defective or does not conform to specifications, SBBC reserves the right to cancel the order
upon written request to the seller and return the product to seller, at seller’s expense.

VENDOR NAME:
Kl/le




Bid No. 25-090T

Page 10 of 24 Pages
The School Board of Broward County, Florida - REVISED -
FIRE ALARM SERVICES
SECTION 4, SPECIAL CONDITIONS (Continued)
17. WARRANTY: The awardee shall fully guarantee the cost of parts and labor (except for abusive or operator

incurred damage which could have been avoided by referring to instructional manual) for a period of one year for
all items after date of delivery and installation to provide SBBC with an “on-site” warranty. In the event a dispute
on requested repairs between school/department/center and the bidder, the decision of the Owner (SBBC) shall be

final and binding on both parties.
Awardee may or may not include manufacturer's warranty; however, it will be the responsibility of the awardee(s) to

warrant all new purchases for one year “on-site” after date of delivery and installation at no additional charge to
SBBC. Failure to furnish full one-year warranty as specified shall result in disqualification of bid

submitted.

18. REFERENCES AND STANDARDS: All fire alarm services shall be governed by the following references and
standards:

a) Florida Fire Prevention Code, 2001, or as amended from time to time
b) National Electrical Code (NEC)

c) Local Protective Signaling Systems

d) Life Safety Code, National Fire Protection Association, NFPA-101

e) State Fire Marshal Rule 69A - 48, Florida Administrative Code (FAC)
f) The Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA)

19. LICENSING/CERTIFICATION: Awardee(s) fire alarm staff must meet the following professional standards criteria.
Copies of licenses and certificates of competency, indicated below, must be submitted with the bid or upon
request.

a) A current Florida county-issued Certificate of Competency as a Electrical Master/Journeyperson or an
Electrical Specialty Master/Journeyperson in the Fire alarm Category.
OR

b)  State of Florida EF or EC license as a Fire Alarm Contractor.
AND

c) Certificate from the National Institute for Certification in Engineering Technologies (NICET) Alarm Level I
or higher in fire alarm

d) Fire Alarm Systems Agent badge.

e) Florida County Occupational License

Any change in the awardee(s)' occupational license, qualifier or qualified personnel status shall be reported in

writing to SBBC's authorized representative within five working days of its occurrence.

20. EQUIPMENT: Fire alarm equipment at SBBC locations is primarily Simplex, Notifier and FCI. Firelight equipment
is used in the portable units.

VENDOR NAME:

KLl/lc




Bid No. 25-090T
Page 11 of 24 Pages

The School Board of Broward County, Florida - REVISED -
FIRE ALARM SERVICES

20.

21.

22.

23.

24.

25.

26.

VENDOR NAME:

KLl/lc

SECTION 4, SPECIAL CONDITIONS (Continued)

TECHNICIAN/INSTALLER REQUIREMENTS: In addition to having the necessary licenses and certifications, all
technicians and installers who work on SBBC equipment shall be full time employees, working a minimum of 35
hours per week for the awardee(s).

PARTS AND SERVICE: Replacement parts will be only OEM or other approved parts when servicing equipment.
Any bidder submitting a bid including other than OEM parts, must show that its source of supply is from a company
normally involved in the distribution of components for fire alarm systems. Bidder must submit with the bid or
upon request, a single catalog referencing the bid item(s) in question and showing that the proposed alternate
source of supply includes at least 50% of the parts normally associated with the fire alarm system described by that

bid item.

PRICE LIST: Awardee(s) shall fumnish their current parts price list for models and brands of equipment being
bid with the bid or upon request. All repairs and/or service is prohibited by the School Board until price lists are
received and approved by District Maintenance. One copy of the price list must be forwarded to District
Maintenance, Supervisor, Evening Fire Alarm Services, 3810 NW 10t Avenue, Fort Lauderdale, Florida
33309, PRIOR to the issuing of any purchase order.

CANCELLATION: Any contract awarded as a result of this bid will be subject to cancellation at any time by SBBC

for one or more of the following reasons:

a) Failure to respond or schedule services requested within agreed-upon time frames.

b Use of service personnel that are not qualified to perform services specified by this contract.

Unsatisfactory workmanship, unprofessional behavior or appearance.

Failure to maintain and/or fumish required records on equipment repaired and/or serviced.

Excessive labor and/or parts cost in conjunction with installation of replacement parts on specific serial-

numbered equipment being serviced.

f Failure to schedule emergency calls for repair within agreed<ns1:XMLFault xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat"><ns1:faultstring xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat">java.lang.OutOfMemoryError: Java heap space</ns1:faultstring></ns1:XMLFault>