
THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA
BID TABULATION SHEET

BID NUMBER 22-076X OPEN DATE 6/28/01 BUYER GEORGE TOMAN
BID TITLE PICNIC TABLES, BENCHES AND TRASH RECEPTACLES

ITEM 1 ITEM 2 ITEM 3 ITEM 4 ITEM 5 ITEM 6
BIDDER'S NAME BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE
BTW INDUSTRIES NO BID NO BID NO BID 101,598.98$    NO BID 25,486.00$           

BLISS PRODUCTS & SERVICES INC. 38,538.00$          NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

BUY RITE OFFICE FURNITURE 26,712.00$          NO BID 36,736.00$          INCOMPLETE INCOMPLETE NO BID

CONTRACT CONNECTION, INC. 23,726.34$           3,712.50$             38,040.32$           NO BID 56,917.00$       NO BID

GERBER CORPORATION, THE 22,230.00$      3,025.00$        44,672.00$           NO BID 82,500.00$           29,670.00$           

GOLF VENTURES, INC. NO BID NO BID NO BID INCOMPLETE NO BID 25,805.33$          

KAY PARK RECREATION 30,294.00$          3,855.00$            62,464.00$          NO BID 122,820.00$        NO BID

PREEMINENCE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 85,074.00$          NO BID

RECYCLED PLASTIC MAN, INC. NO BID NO BID NO BID 121,142.00$        NO BID 25,800.00$          

SOUTHERN RECREATION, INC. 22,410.00$           3,025.00$             41,984.00$      NO BID 98,632.00$           NO BID

ULTRA PLAY SYSTEMS 20,826.00$           3,140.00$             31,872.00$           NO BID 73,066.00$           24,445.50$      

W. W. GRAINGER 25,194.24$          4,422.60$            49,628.16$          168,235.00$        107,843.13$        NO BID

BID DRAFT WAS APPROVED BY:  CHRIS YEATMAN,  SAFETY SPECIALIST, RISK MANAGEMENT  
BIDS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED BY:  JIM HEASLEY, RISK MANAGEMENT   

RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDERS MEETING SPECIFICATIONS, TERMS & CONDITIONS.

REMARKS:
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