


School	THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA BID TABULATION SHEET	Description	H.A. CONTRACTING CORPORATION		J.I.J.CONSTRUCTION CORPORATION		PIONEER CONSTRUCTION MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC.		PRIME DRYWALL AND PAINTING, INC.		ROOF PAINTING BY HARTZELL		S.A. CONSULTANTS, L.L.C.	
			PRICE		PRICE		PRICE		PRICE		PRICE		PRICE	
1		Deerfield Beach High	\$ 346,000.00	NO BID		\$ 374,550.88	NO BID			NO BID		\$ 297,500.00	NO BID	
2		Plantation High	\$ 396,000.00	\$ 477,000.00	\$ 430,295.01	\$ 396,400.00	\$ 382,500.00	\$ 417,000.00				\$ 255,000.00	\$ 279,000.00	
3		J.P. Taravella High	\$ 295,000.00	\$ 329,000.00	\$ 309,153.25	\$ 245,600.00								

 THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA BID TABULATION SHEET		TRAUTMAN'S PAINTING-- FLORIDA					
School	Description	PRICE					
1	Deerfield Beach High	NO BID					
2	Plantation High	\$ 286,300.00	96,200				
3	J.P. Taravella High	\$ 189,600.00	56,000				
REMARKS: BID DRAFT WAS APPROVED BY: KEVIN JACKSON, SUPERVISOR, PAINTING, PHYSICAL PLANT OPERATIONS BIDS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED BY: KEVIN JACKSON, SUPERVISOR, PAINTING, PHYSICAL PLANT OPERATIONS DEPARTMENT AND MARK ALAN, PURCHASING AGENT III, SUPPLY MANAGEMENT AND LOGISTICS DEPARTMENT RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDERS MEETING SPECIFICATIONS TERMS AND CONDITIONS.							