



**The School Board of Broward County, Florida  
Facilities and Construction Management Division**  
1700 SW 14th Court  
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33312

(754) 321-1500

00 JUL 19 PM 3:36

**Bid Tabulation Form**

**Bid No:** 2007-11-FC      **Bid Opening Date and Time:** June 5<sup>th</sup>, 2008 @ 2PM  
**Project Title:** Const. Services Minor Proj. (Paving, Landscaping, Int. & Recreational Services)      **Posting Date:** June 12<sup>th</sup>, 2008 by 4 PM  
**Facility Name:** Various Locations      **Posting Date:** June 19<sup>th</sup>, 2008 by 4PM  
**Number of Addenda:** 4

Name of Bidder(s)	Paving and Drainage Services						Landscaping Services					
	#1	#2	#3	#4	#5	#6	#1	#2	#3	#4	#5	#6
ABC Construction, Inc.	0.882	0.882	0.882	0.882	0.882	0.882	0.882	0.882	0.882	0.882	0.882	0.882
Florida Blacktop, Inc.	0.861	0.861	0.861	0.861	0.861	0.861	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Grace & Naeem Uddin, Inc.	0.800	0.800	0.730	0.730	0.720	0.720	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800
James B. Pirtle Const. Co., Inc.	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800
West Construction, Inc.	0.86	0.86	0.86	0.85	0.84	0.83	0.86	0.86	0.86	0.85	0.84	0.83

Name of Bidder(s)	Interior Contracting (including, but not limited to repair and/or replacement of interior finished such as walls, ceilings, doors, white boards etc.)						Recreational and Playground Construction Services					
	#1	#2	#3	#4	#5	#6	#1	#2	#3	#4	#5	#6
ABC Construction, Inc.	0.882	0.882	0.882	0.882	0.882	0.882	0.882	0.882	0.882	0.882	0.882	0.882
Florida Blacktop, Inc.	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Grace & Naeem Uddin, Inc.	0.800	0.720	0.720	0.720	0.720	0.720	0.835	0.740	0.730	0.730	0.730	0.730
James B. Pirtle Const. Co., Inc.	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800
West Construction, Inc.	0.86	0.86	0.86	0.85	0.84	0.83	0.86	0.86	0.86	0.85	0.84	0.83

**Witnessed by:** Denis Herrmann - Director, Kevin Bellamy - Construction Purchasing Agent, Angela Bromell - Clerk Specialist IV, John Hodge - Tasked Assigned, & Zaida Riollano - Construction Purchasing Agent III.

The School Board of Broward County, Florida received identical Bids from Grace & Naeem Uddin, Inc. and James B. Pirtle Construction Co., Inc. in the following:

- Items #1 and #2 for Paving and Drainage Services
- Items #1 through #6 for Landscaping Services
- Item #1 for Interior Contracting

Per Document 00800, Article 2, 6 criteria were applied to indicate a priority for award. Application of the 6 criteria indicates a priority for award to the Broward County Certified Minority/Women Business Enterprise contractor/vendor, Grace & Naeem Uddin, Inc.

Angela Bromell  
 Clerk Specialist IV



**The School Board of Broward County, Florida  
Facilities and Construction Management Division**

1700 SW 14th Court  
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33312

(754) 321-1500

---

**Bid Tabulation Form**

---

**Recommendation:**

The Facilities and Construction Management Division intends to recommend that The School Board of Broward County, Florida, at the School Board meeting on **August 19, 2008**.

1. Reject the bids from Grace & Naeem Uddin, Inc.
  - a. Item #6 for Landscaping Services
  - b. Items #4-6 for Interior Contracting
  - c. Items #3-6 for Recreational and Playground Construction Services  
for an additional award would exceed Bidder's Contractor Pre-Qualification Aggregate Limit per Document 00410 Bid Form.
  
2. Award a contract to the low bidder meeting bid specifications;
  - a. **Grace & Naeem Uddin, Inc.**
    - i. Items #1-6 for Paving and Drainage Services
    - ii. Items #1-5 for Landscaping Services
    - iii. Items #1-3 for Interior Contracting
    - iv. Items #1-2 for Recreational and Playground Construction Services
  
  - b. **James B. Pirtle Construction Co., Inc.**
    - i. Item #6 for Landscaping Services
    - ii. Items # 4-6 for Interior Contracting
    - iii. Items # 3-6 for Recreational and Playground Construction Services

All bidders are currently pre-qualified

Any Bidder objecting to such action must comply with Florida Statutes, Chapter 120.57(3). Failure to file a protest at the Facilities and Construction Management Division, 1700 SW 14th Court, Fort Lauderdale, Florida 33312, within the time described in s.120.57(3), Florida Statutes, shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes. Section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, states that the formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based.