



The School Board of Broward County, Florida
 Facilities and Construction Management Division
 1700 SW 14th Court
 Fort Lauderdale, FL 33312

REVISED

(754) 321-1500

Bid Tabulation Form

Bid No: 2007-09-FC
 Project Title: Construction Services Minor Projects (Painting, Plastering, & Stucco Services)
 Facility Name: Various Locations
 Bid Opening Date and Time: June 5th, 2008 @ 2PM
 Early Posting Date: June 12th, 2008 by 4 PM
 Revised Posting Date: June 23rd, 2008 by 4 PM
 Number of Addenda: 1

Name of Bidder(s)	Painting, Plastering, & Stucco Services					
	Item #1	Item #2	Item #3	Item #4	Item #5	Item #6
ABC Construction, Inc.	0.882	0.882	0.882	0.882	0.882	0.882
Brigcon Consulting Services, LLC dba Brigcon Const. Services	0.880	0.880	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Decon Environmental & Engineering, Inc.	0.765	0.744	0.689	0.727	0.774	0.796
FHP Tectonics Corp. dba F.H. Paschen, S.N. Nielsen Associates	0.823	0.823	0.823	0.810	0.810	0.810
Grace & Naeem Uddin, Inc.	0.880	0.880	0.800	0.800	0.730	0.730
H.A Contracting Corporation	.97	.95	.94	.94	.94	.94
James B. Pirtle Construction Company, Inc.	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800	0.800
MAC Construction, Inc.	.9800	.9700	.9700	.9700	.9700	.9700
West Construction, Inc.	0.85	0.85	0.84	0.84	0.83	0.83

Witnessed by: Denis Herrmann - Director, Kevin Bellamy - Construction Purchasing Agent, Angela Bromell - Clerk Specialist IV, & John Hodge - Tasked Assigned.

Recommendation:
 The Facilities and Construction Management Division intends to recommend that The School Board of Broward County, Florida, at the School Board meeting on **August 19th, 2008**, award a contract to the low bidder meeting bid specifications, **Decon Environmental & Engineering, Inc.** for Items 1-4 for Painting, Plastering, & Stucco Services and **Grace & Naeem Uddin, Inc.** for Items 5 and 6 for Painting, Plastering, & Stucco Services.

The contract awards are the shaded boxes.

Award Rules identified in Document 00410 Bid Form:

- Awards shall be by Item up to the Aggregate Limit approved by The School Board of Broward County, Florida and stated in the current Contractor Pre-Qualification Certificate for the Bidder
- Bidder must be pre-qualified for the Work Category to be Awarded Items within that Work Category
- Bids shall be considered first by Work Category then by Item within that Work Category; as outlined in the table to follow.

The School Board of Broward County, Florida
 Bid Tabulation Form
 June 11, 2001

Angela Bromell

EXHIBIT



The School Board of Broward County, Florida
Facilities and Construction Management Division
1700 SW 14th Court
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33312

REVISED

(754) 321-1500

Bid Tabulation Form

- When a Bidder's Contractor Pre-Qualification Aggregate Limit amount is Awarded, or an additional award would cause the Pre-Qualified Aggregate Limit to be exceeded, then no further Awards to the Bidder shall be considered

All bidders are currently pre-qualified.

Any Bidder objecting to such action must comply with Florida Statutes, Chapter 120.57(3). Failure to file a protest at the Facilities and Construction Management Division, 1700 SW 14th Court, Fort Lauderdale, Florida 33312, within the time described in s.120.57(3), Florida Statutes, shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes. Section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, states that the formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based.

Cynthia Buonomo
Senior Project Manager