

The School Board of Broward County, Florida
Supply Management and Logistics Department

Bid No.: <u>29-033X</u>	Board Meeting: <u>AUGUST 19, 2008</u>
Description: <u>ROCK, FILL, SAND AND CLAY FOR GROUNDS MAINTENANCE TERM CONTACT</u>	Notified: <u>383</u> Downloaded: <u>19</u>
For: <u>PHYSICAL PLANT OPERATIONS</u> (School/Department)	Bids Rec'd: <u>7</u> No Bids: <u>1</u>
Fund: <u>DEPARTMENT'S OPERATING BUDGET</u>	Bid Opening: <u>MAY 27, 2008</u>
	Awarded Date: <u>APRIL 17, 2008</u>
	Award Amount: <u>\$12,000,000 (PER CONTRACT PERIOD)</u>

POSTING OF BID RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: Bid Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in the Supply Management and Logistics Department and www.demandstar.com on JUNE 24, 2008 @ 3:00 PM, and will remain posted for 72 hours. Any person desiring to protest the Bid Recommendation/Tabulation shall file, in writing, a notice of protest within 72 hours after the time posted as stated herein, and shall file a formal written protest within ten days after filing the notice of protest. Saturdays, Sundays, legal holidays and days during which the school district administration is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period. Filings shall be at the office of the Director of Supply Management and Logistics Department, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351. Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes, states that "The formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based." Any person who files an action protesting and intended decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a bond, payable to The School Board of Broward County, Florida, in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of the Board's estimate of the total volume of the contract. Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed by Section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, or a failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, Florida Statutes.

RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION

VENDOR NAME

ITEM(S) AWARDED

AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING, INC.	1, 2, 5, 7, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 21, 22, 33, 34, 35, 36
GOVEA TRUCKING	19, 29
* MULLINGS ENGINEERING SERVICES (AFRICAN/AMERICAN M/WBE: SUNRISE, FL)	31, 32
RITZ BUILDING & GARDEN	4, 30
TARGET TRUCKING	3, 6, 8, 9, 10, 18, 20, 23, 24

*CERTIFIED M/WBE VENDOR

IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT FOR THE REASONS STATED ON THE ATTACHED BID REJECTION SHEET, THE BIDS AS STATED, EITHER IN THEIR ENTIRETY OR FOR THE PARTICULAR ITEM LISTED, BE REJECTED FOR NOT COMPLYING WITH BID REQUIREMENTS.

ITEMS 25, 26, 27 AND 28: NO ACCEPTABLE BIDS RECEIVED. ITEMS WILL BE REBID AT A LATER DATE.

RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDERS MEETING SPECIFICATIONS, TERMS AND CONDITIONS.

CONTRACT PERIOD: DECEMBER 1, 2008 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2013



By: _____ Date: JUNE 18, 2008
(Buyer/Purchasing Agent)

The School Board of Broward County, Florida, prohibits any policy or procedure which results in discrimination on the basis of age, color, disability, gender, national origin, marital status, race, religion, or sexual orientation. Individuals who wish to file a discrimination complaint, may call the Director of Equal Educational Opportunities (EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) may call the Director of Equal Educational Opportunities (EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA BID											
TABULATION SHEET											
Item	Description	Qty.	Unit	AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING, INC		FLORIDA POTTING SOILS		FLORIDA SILICA SAND CO.		GOVEVA TRUCKING, INC.	
				Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
1	Mason Sand, by ton, delivered	32,500	ton	\$ 19.75	\$ 641,875.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 23.75	\$ 771,875.00
2	Mason Sand, by ton, pick-up	1,000	ton	\$ 19.75	\$ 19,750.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 23.75	\$ 23,750.00
3	Mason Sand, by cubic yard, delivered	100	cu yd	\$ 28.99	\$ 2,899.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 29.65	\$ 2,965.00
4	Mason Sand, by cubic yard, pick-up	100	cu yd	\$ 28.99	\$ 2,899.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 29.65	\$ 2,965.00
5	Clean Fill, by cubic yard, delivered	2,500	cu yd	\$ 12.20	\$ 30,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 13.50	\$ 33,750.00
6	Clean Fill, by cubic yard, pick-up	100	cu yd	\$ 9.00	\$ 900.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 13.50	\$ 1,350.00
7	Red Clay, by ton, delivered	5,000	ton	\$ 27.95	\$ 139,750.00	\$ 22.45	\$ 112,250.00	\$ 32.75	\$ 163,750.00	\$ 31.75	\$ 158,750.00
8	Red Clay, by ton, pick-up	100	ton	\$ 30.00	\$ 3,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 32.75	\$ 3,275.00	\$ 31.34	\$ 3,175.00
9	Red Clay, by cubic yard, delivered	5,000	cu yd	\$ 37.28	\$ 186,400.00	\$ 26.88	\$ 134,400.00	\$ 43.56	\$ 217,800.00	\$ 42.50	\$ 212,500.00
10	Red Clay, by cubic yard, pick-up	100	cu yd	\$ 39.80	\$ 3,980.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 43.56	\$ 4,356.00	\$ 42.50	\$ 4,250.00
11	FDOT-Certified Code 17 Pea Rock, by ton, delivered	100	ton	\$ 24.80	\$ 2,480.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 43.35	\$ 4,335.00	\$ 27.70	\$ 2,770.00
12	FDOT-Certified Code 17 Pea Rock, by ton, pick-up	100	ton	\$ 21.10	\$ 2,110.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 36.25	\$ 3,625.00	\$ 27.70	\$ 2,770.00
13	FDOT-Certified Code 5 3/4 Rock, by ton, delivered	5,000	ton	\$ 24.40	\$ 122,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 43.35	\$ 216,750.00	\$ 27.70	\$ 138,500.00
14	FDOT-Certified Code 5 3/4 Rock, by ton, pick-up	500	ton	\$ 20.90	\$ 10,450.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 36.25	\$ 18,125.00	\$ 27.70	\$ 13,850.00
15	FDOT-Certified Code 3 Concrete Screening Sand, by ton, delivered	2,500	ton	\$ 23.35	\$ 58,375.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 43.95	\$ 109,875.00	\$ 31.75	\$ 79,375.00
16	FDOT-Certified Code 3 Concrete Screening Sand, by ton, pick-up	500	ton	\$ 19.85	\$ 9,925.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 36.85	\$ 18,425.00	\$ 31.75	\$ 15,875.00
17	Clean Lawn Sand, by ton, delivered	12,500	ton	\$ 10.60	\$ 132,500.00	\$ 18.75	\$ 234,375.00	\$ 23.30	\$ 291,250.00	\$ 10.75	\$ 134,375.00
18	Clean Lawn Sand, by ton, pick-up	100	ton	\$ 10.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 8.75	\$ 875.00	\$ 19.60	\$ 1,960.00	\$ 10.75	\$ 1,075.00
19	Clean Lawn Sand, by cubic yard, delivered	2,500	cu yd	\$ 14.00	\$ 35,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 30.99	\$ 77,475.00	\$ 13.50	\$ 33,750.00
20	Clean Lawn Sand, by cubic yard, pick-up	100	cu yd	\$ 12.00	\$ 1,200.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 26.07	\$ 2,607.00	\$ 13.50	\$ 1,350.00
21	FDOT-Certified Code 1 Crushed Rock, by ton, delivered	2,500	ton	\$ 15.34	\$ 38,350.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 18.25	\$ 45,625.00
22	FDOT-Certified Code 1 Crushed Rock, by ton, pick-up	500	ton	\$ 14.00	\$ 7,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 18.25	\$ 9,125.00
23	Topsoil, by cubic yard, delivered	5,000	cu yd	\$ 31.45	\$ 157,250.00	\$ 24.50	\$ 122,500.00	\$ 32.32	\$ 161,600.00	NO BID	NO BID
24	Topsoil, by cubic yard, pick-up	100	cu yd	\$ 27.65	\$ 2,765.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 24.19	\$ 2,419.00	NO BID	NO BID
25	Natural Uncrushed Limeless Trap Sand, by ton, delivered	2,000	ton	\$ 28.75	\$ 57,500.00	\$ 24.60	\$ 49,200.00	\$ 27.65	\$ 55,300.00	\$ 34.75	\$ 69,500.00
26	Natural Uncrushed Limeless Trap Sand, by ton, pick-up	375	ton	\$ 24.75	\$ 9,281.25	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 23.95	\$ 8,981.25	\$ 34.75	\$ 13,031.25
27	Natural Uncrushed Limeless Trap Sand, by cubic yard, delivered	2,000	cu yd	\$ 39.00	\$ 78,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 35.91	\$ 71,820.00	\$ 41.70	\$ 83,400.00
28	Natural Uncrushed Limeless Trap Sand, by cubic yard, pick-up	75	cu yd	\$ 38.00	\$ 2,850.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 31.85	\$ 2,388.75	\$ 41.70	\$ 3,127.50
29	Grade A Cypress Mulch, by bag, delivered	42,000	bag	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 2.95	\$ 123,900.00
30	Grade A Cypress Mulch, by bag, pick-up	4,200	bag	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 2.95	\$ 12,390.00
31	Grade A Cypress Mulch, by cubic yard, delivered	1,000	cu yd	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 45.00	\$ 45,000.00
32	Grade A Cypress Mulch, by cubic yard, pick-up	250	cu yd	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 45.00	\$ 11,250.00
33	Double Crushed Road Rock, by ton, delivered	5,000	ton	\$ 15.95	\$ 79,750.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 23.75	\$ 118,750.00
34	Double Crushed Road Rock, by ton, pick-up	500	ton	\$ 15.00	\$ 7,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 23.75	\$ 11,875.00
35	FDOT-Certified Code 10 #57 Rock, Washed, by ton, delivered	2,500	ton	\$ 25.40	\$ 63,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 43.35	\$ 108,375.00	\$ 27.50	\$ 68,750.00
36	FDOT-Certified Code 10 #57 Rock, Washed, by ton, pick-up	50	ton	\$ 21.90	\$ 1,095.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 36.25	\$ 1,812.50	\$ 27.50	\$ 1,375.00

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA BID									
TABULATION SHEET									
Item	Description	Qty.	Unit	MULLINGS ENGINEERING SERVICES		RITZ BUILDING & GARDEN		TARGET TRUCKING	
				Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension
1	Mason Sand, by ton, delivered	32,500	ton	\$ 28.00	\$ 910,000.00	\$ 26.50	\$ 861,250.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 780,000.00
2	Mason Sand, by ton, pick-up	1,000	ton	\$ 28.00	\$ 28,000.00	\$ 24.50	\$ 24,500.00	\$ 20.85	\$ 20,850.00
3	Mason Sand, by cubic yard, delivered	100	cu yd	\$ 40.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 27.50	\$ 2,750.00	\$ 28.70	\$ 2,870.00
4	Mason Sand, by cubic yard, pick-up	100	cu yd	\$ 40.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 25.50	\$ 2,550.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 2,800.00
5	Clean Fill, by cubic yard, delivered	2,500	cu yd	\$ 16.50	\$ 41,250.00	\$ 17.25	\$ 43,125.00	\$ 12.75	\$ 31,875.00
6	Clean Fill, by cubic yard, pick-up	100	cu yd	\$ 16.00	\$ 1,600.00	\$ 15.25	\$ 1,525.00	\$ 7.75	\$ 775.00
7	Red Clay, by ton, delivered	5,000	ton	\$ 35.00	\$ 175,000.00	\$ 41.00	\$ 205,000.00	\$ 28.75	\$ 143,750.00
8	Red Clay, by ton, pick-up	100	ton	\$ 35.00	\$ 3,500.00	\$ 39.00	\$ 3,900.00	\$ 28.75	\$ 2,875.00
9	Red Clay, by cubic yard, delivered	5,000	cu yd	\$ 49.00	\$ 245,000.00	\$ 42.00	\$ 210,000.00	\$ 37.00	\$ 185,000.00
10	Red Clay, by cubic yard, pick-up	100	cu yd	\$ 49.00	\$ 4,900.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 37.00	\$ 3,700.00
11	FDOT-Certified Code 17 Pea Rock, by ton, delivered	100	ton	\$ 31.00	\$ 3,100.00	\$ 31.50	\$ 3,150.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 2,800.00
12	FDOT-Certified Code 17 Pea Rock, by ton, pick-up	100	ton	\$ 30.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 29.50	\$ 2,950.00	\$ 25.75	\$ 2,575.00
13	FDOT-Certified Code 5 3/4 Rock, by ton, delivered	5,000	ton	\$ 30.00	\$ 150,000.00	\$ 30.45	\$ 152,250.00	\$ 25.90	\$ 129,500.00
14	FDOT-Certified Code 5 3/4 Rock, by ton, pick-up	500	ton	\$ 30.00	\$ 15,000.00	\$ 28.45	\$ 14,225.00	\$ 22.25	\$ 11,125.00
15	FDOT-Certified Code 3 Concrete Screening Sand, by ton, delivered	2,500	ton	\$ 29.00	\$ 72,500.00	\$ 31.65	\$ 79,125.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 67,500.00
16	FDOT-Certified Code 3 Concrete Screening Sand, by ton, pick-up	2,500	ton	\$ 29.00	\$ 72,500.00	\$ 29.65	\$ 74,125.00	\$ 23.25	\$ 58,125.00
17	Clean Lawn Sand, by ton, delivered	12,500	ton	\$ 12.00	\$ 150,000.00	\$ 16.25	\$ 203,125.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 150,000.00
18	Clean Lawn Sand, by ton, pick-up	100	ton	\$ 12.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 14.25	\$ 1,425.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 1,000.00
19	Clean Lawn Sand, by cubic yard, delivered	2,500	cu yd	\$ 18.00	\$ 45,000.00	\$ 17.25	\$ 43,125.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 37,500.00
20	Clean Lawn Sand, by cubic yard, pick-up	100	cu yd	\$ 18.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 15.25	\$ 1,525.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 1,000.00
21	FDOT-Certified Code 1 Crushed Rock, by ton, delivered	2,500	ton	\$ 22.00	\$ 55,000.00	\$ 23.25	\$ 58,125.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 55,000.00
22	FDOT-Certified Code 1 Crushed Rock, by ton, pick-up	500	ton	\$ 18.50	\$ 9,250.00	\$ 21.25	\$ 10,625.00	\$ 19.05	\$ 9,525.00
23	Topsoil, by cubic yard, delivered	5,000	cu yd	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 36.75	\$ 183,750.00	\$ 26.00	\$ 130,000.00
24	Topsoil, by cubic yard, pick-up	100	cu yd	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 34.75	\$ 3,475.00	\$ 19.50	\$ 1,950.00
25	Natural Uncrushed Limeless Trap Sand, by ton, delivered	2,000	ton	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 34.00	\$ 68,000.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 54,000.00
26	Natural Uncrushed Limeless Trap Sand, by ton, pick-up	375	ton	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 32.00	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 10,125.00
27	Natural Uncrushed Limeless Trap Sand, by cubic yard, delivered	2,000	cu yd	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 35.00	\$ 70,000.00	\$ 37.80	\$ 75,600.00
28	Natural Uncrushed Limeless Trap Sand, by cubic yard, pick-up	75	cu yd	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 33.00	\$ 2,475.00	\$ 37.80	\$ 2,835.00
29	Grade A Cypress Mulch, by bag, delivered	42,000	bag	\$ 3.00	\$ 126,000.00	\$ 3.13	\$ 131,460.00	NO BID	NO BID
30	Grade A Cypress Mulch, by bag, pick-up	4,200	bag	\$ 3.00	\$ 12,600.00	\$ 2.90	\$ 12,180.00	NO BID	NO BID
31	Grade A Cypress Mulch, by cubic yard, delivered	1,000	cu yd	\$ 28.00	\$ 28,000.00	\$ 32.15	\$ 32,150.00	NO BID	NO BID
32	Grade A Cypress Mulch, by cubic yard, pick-up	250	cu yd	\$ 28.00	\$ 7,000.00	\$ 32.15	\$ 8,037.50	NO BID	NO BID
33	Double Crushed Road Rock, by ton, delivered	5,000	ton	\$ 30.00	\$ 150,000.00	\$ 25.50	\$ 127,500.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 110,000.00
34	Double Crushed Road Rock, by ton, pick-up	500	ton	\$ 30.00	\$ 15,000.00	\$ 23.50	\$ 11,750.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 11,000.00
35	FDOT-Certified Code 10 #57 Rock, Washed, by ton, delivered	2,500	ton	\$ 27.00	\$ 67,500.00	\$ 29.95	\$ 74,875.00	\$ 25.90	\$ 64,750.00
36	FDOT-Certified Code 10 #57 Rock, Washed, by ton, pick-up	50	ton	\$ 27.00	\$ 1,350.00	\$ 27.95	\$ 1,397.50	\$ 22.25	\$ 1,112.50

REMARKS:
 BID DRAFT WAS APPROVED BY: RON EGGENBERGER, MANAGER I, CUSTODIAL/GROUNDS MAINTENANCE, PHYSICAL PLANT OPERATIONS DEPARTMENT
 BIDS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED BY: MARK ALAN, PURCHASING AGENT III, SUPPLY MANAGEMENT AND LOGISTICS DEPARTMENT AND RON EGGENBERGER, MANAGER I, CUSTODIAL/GROUNDS MAINTENANCE, PHYSICAL PLANT OPERATIONS DEPARTMENT
 RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDERS MEETING SPECIFICATIONS TERMS AND CONDITIONS.

Bid 29-033X
Rock, Fill, Sand and Clay for Grounds Maintenance
Summary of Bid Rejections and Coin Toss Results

Reject bid from Florida Potting Soils. General Condition 1a states that it is the responsibility of the bidder to be certain that all numbered pages of the bid and all attachments thereto are received and all addenda released. All bids are subject to the conditions specified herein on the attached bid documents and on any addenda issued thereto. Addendum 1 states that it is required that the addendum be acknowledged by executing it and attaching this signed page to the bid. No bid will be considered unless this addendum is completed, executed and returned. Only pages 11, 12 and 13 of 20 pages –revised- will be acceptable as the Bid Summary Sheets. Bidder failed to return, the correct set of Bid Summary Sheet pages included with Addendum 1 released on May 7, 2008 and is not in compliance with General Conditions 1a or Addendum 1.

Bid Item 18

Tie bid received from two vendors. General Condition 46 states that when identical prices are received from two or more vendors and all factors are equal, priority for award shall be given to the vendors in sequence. Target Trucking breaks the tie with a coin toss.

Items 25-28

Reject items from Florida Silica Sand Co. and Ritz Building and Garden. Special Condition 10 as modified in Addendum 1 issued on May 7, 2008 states that bidders must provide with the bid or upon request prior to evaluation, a one pound sample of natural uncrushed limeless trap sand, labeled and delivered to the Supply Management and Logistics Department to be evaluated by an SBBC-chosen independent laboratory in order to obtain a written sieve analysis for compliance with the Bid Specifications. Bidders did not submit their samples of trap sand by the due date of June 2, 2008 and are not in compliance with Special Condition 10 as issued on Addendum 1.

Reject items from Austin Tupler Trucking, Inc., Govea Trucking, Inc. and Target Trucking. Special Condition 10 as modified in Addendum 1 issued on May 7, 2008 states that bidders must provide with the bid or upon request prior to evaluation, a one pound sample of natural uncrushed limeless trap sand, labeled and delivered to the Supply Management and Logistics Department to be evaluated by an SBBC-chosen independent laboratory in order to obtain a written sieve analysis for compliance with the Bid Specifications. Bidders' samples were evaluated by A&L Southern Agricultural Laboratories, L.L.C. and none of the bidders' samples met all of the parameters of the Bid Specifications and are not in compliance with Special Condition 10 as issued on Addendum 1. The items will be rebid at a later date.