The School Board of Broward County, Florida
Supply Management and Logistics Department

Bid No.: 28-016H Board Meeting: JUNE 19, 2007
Description: _MUSICAL INSTRUMENT REPAIR Notifted: 4] Downloaded: 12
TERM CONTRACT Bids Rec'd: 7 No Bids: 2
For: PHYSICAL PLANT OPERATIONS Bid Opening: APRIL 30, 2007
{School/Departiment)
Fund: DEPARTMENT’S OPERATING BUDGET Advertised Date: MARCH 16, 2007
Award Amount: $1,245,000 {PER CONTRACT PERIOD)

POSTING OF BID RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: Bid Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in the Supply Management
and Logistics Department and www.Demandstar.com on  MAY 22, 2007 @ 3:00 P.M. , and will remain posted for
72 hours. Any person desiring to protest the Bid Recommendation/Tabulation shall file, in writing, a notice of protest within 72 hours after the time
posted as stated herein, and shall file a formal written protest within ten days after filing the notice of protest. Saturdays, Sundays, legal holidays and
days during which the school district administration is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period. Filings shall be at the
office of the Director of Supply Management and Logistics Department, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351,
Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes, states that “The formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is
based.” Any person who files an action protesting and intended decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written
protest, a bond, payable to The School Board of Broward County, Florida, in an amount equal to one percent (1%4) of the Board’s estimate of the total
volume of the confract.

RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION

YENDOR NAME ITEM(S) AWARDED

MANUEL PEREZ WOODWIND REPAIRS 5,6,15,59,60,69

MUSIC ARTS ENTERPRISES 45,48,49,50,51,53,54,96,97,98

MUSIC TECH STUDIOS, INC. 3,4,7,8,9,10,11,12,13,14,20,21,57,58,61,62,63,64,65,06,67,68,74,75
SUMMER ARTS SESSIONS INTERNATIONAL - 39,40,41,42,44

WELLINGTON MUSIC SUPPLIERS 1,2,16,17,18,19,22,23,24,25,26,27,28,29,30,31,32,33,34,35,36,37,38,43 46,
. ' 47,52,55,56,70,71,72,73,76,77,78,79,80,81,82,83,84,85,86,87,88,89,90,91,
92,93,94,95,99

RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TC THE ABOVE LOW BIDDERS MEETING SPECIFICATIONS, TERMS AND CONDITIONS.

IN ADDITION, IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT THOSE BIDS IDENTIFIED ON THE ATTACHED BID REJECTION SHEET BE REJECTED FOR
THE GROUNDS STATED. '

CONTRACT PERIOD: JULY 1, 2007 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2010.

By: Date:

5/15/07

(Buyer/Purchasing Agent)

9/8/00 Broward County Public Schools is An Equal Opportunity Employer



Bid No.: 28-016H
Buyer: Roni Evans

Bid Title: Musical Instrument Repair

Bid Opened: 04/30/2007

== [ THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA BID :
fv’&% MANUEL PEREZ MUSIC ARTS MUSIC TECH STUDIOS
TABULATION SHEET ALL COUNTY MUSIC, INC. WOODWIND REPAIRS ENTERPRISES INC.
item Description ] Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Hourly Rate

Bidder 1o state hourly rates for following
equibment to perform GENERAL REPAIRS:
WOODWIND: .

1 Clarinets {plastic) NQ BID 3 45.00 $ 50.00

2 Clarinets (wood) NO BID $ 45.00 ] 50.00

3 Flute ; NO BID 5 45.00 $ 50.00

4 |Flute {open hola) NO BID $ 45.00 $ 50.00

5 Piccolo {metal) NO BID 15 b 50.00

[ Piccolo (plastic) NO BID $ 50.00

7 Piccolo (wood) NO BID $ 50.00

8 Oboe {(modified-plastic)’ NO BID 3 50.00

9 Oboe {modified-wood) NO BID $ 50.00

10 jOboe (full conservatory-plastic) NO BID $ 50.00

11 |Oboe (full conservatory-wood) NO BID 3 50.00

12 |Alto Saxophone - NO BID $ 50.00

13  {Tenor Saxophone | NO BID $ 50.00°

14 |Soprang Saxophone 4%  195.00 $ 50.00

15 |Baritone Saxophone NO BID - 3 50.00

16 __ |Bass Clarinet (plastic) NO BID $ 50.00

17  |Bass Clarinet {wood) NO BID $ 50.00

18  jAlo Clarinet {plastic) NO BB 5 50.00

19 |Alo Clarinet {(wood) NO BID $ 50.00

20 |Bassoon (plastic) NQ BID % 50.00

21 Bassoon {wood) NO BID $ 50.00
BRASS:

22 |Trumpet / Comet . NO BID b 45.00 $ 50.00

23 |Flugel Horn NG BID 3 45.00 ) 50.00

24  |Trombane {tenor) NO BID $ 45.00 3 50.00

25  |Trombone {w/F attach single rotor) NO BID $ 45.00 $ 50.00

26 |Trombone (bass single rotor) NO BID : 5 45.00 $ 60.00

27___|Trombone (bass double rotor} 5 195.00 b 45.00 $ 50.00

28  |Trombone {valve) NO BID ’ $ 45.00 $ 50.00

29  |Single French Horn NO BID 3 45.00 3 50.00

30 |Double French Horn NO BID ] 45.00 $ 50.00

31 __ |Baritone / Euphonium / Alto Homn (3 valve) ‘NO BID $ 45.00 3 50.00

32  |Baritone / Euphonium / Alto Hom (4 valve) NO BID 5 45.00 $ 50.00

33 |Tuba (3 valve piston) NQ BID $ 45,00 b 50.00

34 |Tuba (4 valve piston) NO BID 3 45.00 $ 50.00

35 |Tuba (3 valve rotary) NO BID $ 45.00 $ 50.00

36 |Tuba (4 valve rotary) NO BID $ 45,00 $ 50.00

37 _|Sousaphone (metal) NO BID $ 45.00 % 50.00

38  |Sousaphone (fiber / composite} NG BID 3 45.00 $ 50.00
STRING;

39 |Violin NOC BID NO BID 3 50.00 NO BID

40 Viola NO BID NO BID $ 50.00 NO BID

41 1Cello NO BID NQ BID $ 50.00 NO BID

42 {Double Bass NO BID NO BID ] 50.00 NQ BID

43 |Acoustical Guitar NQ BID NO BID $ 50.00 NO BID
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Bid No.: 28-016H
Buyer: Roni Evans

Bid Title: Musical instrument Repalr

Bid Opened: 04/30/2007

E}% THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA BID- MANUEL PEREZ MUSIC ARTS MUSIC TECGH STUDIOS
M TABULATION SHEET ALL COUNTY MUSIC, INC. WOODWIND REPAIRS ENTERPRISES INC.
ltem Description Hourly Rate - Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Hourly Rate
44 |Bows (mechanism, stick hair) NO BID NO BID $ 50.00 NO BID
PERCUSSION:
45  |Percussion Auxillary NO BID NO BID NO BID
45 {Percussion Drums (snare drum & toms) NO BID NQ BID NQ BID
47 {Percussion Drums (bass drum concert) NO BID NO BID NO BID
48  |Timpani NO BID NO BID NO BID
49 {Keyboard Percussion (bell kits & concert bells) NO BID NO BID NO BID
50 |Keyboard Percussion (large-xylophone & marimba) NOQ BID 'NO BID NO BID
51  |Keyboard Percussion (large-vibraphone) NO BID NO BID NO BID
ELECTRICAL:
52  |Electric Guitars ‘| NOBID NO BID NO BID
53  |Electric / Electronic Keyboards NO BID NO BID NO-BID
- ICASES:
54 |Cases NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bidder to state hourly rates for following -
equipment to perform MAJOR REPAIRS AND
OVERHAULS: o ]
WOODWIND: :
55 - |Clarinets (plastic) NO BIiD $ 45.00 $ 50.00 NO BID
56 |Clarinets (wood) NQ BID $ 45.00 $ 50.00 NO BID
57 {Flute NQ Bib $ 45.00 $ 50.00
58 |Flute {open hole) NG BID $ 45,00 $ 50.00
59 |Piccolo {metal) NO BID 1 $ 50.00 NQ BID
60 {Piccolo {plastic) NO BID S 45100 $ 50.00
61 Piccolo {wood) $ 195.00 $ 45.00 $ 50.00
62 |Oboe (modified-plastic) NO BID 3 45.00 3 50.00
€63  [Oboe (modified-wood) NO BID % 45.00 3 50.00
64 |Oboe (full conservatory-plastic) NO BID $ 45.00 $ 50.00
65 |Oboe {full conservatery-wood) NO BID $ 45.00 3 50.00
66 |Alto Saxophone NO BID $ 45.00 5 50.00
67 |Tenor Saxophone NO BID & 45.00 $ 50.00
68 Soprano Saxophone $ 195.00 $ 45.00 $ 50.00
69 |Baritone Saxophone NO BID 15:00; 5 £0.00
70 [Bass Clarinet (plastic} 5 195.00 $ 50.00
71 Bass Clarinet (wood) b 195.00 3 50.00
72 lAlto Clarinet (plastic) $ 195.00 $ 50.00
73 {Alo Clarinet (wood) $ 185.00 $ 50.00
74  [Bassoon (plastic) $ 186.00 $ 50.00
75  iBassoon (wood) b 195.00 $ 50.00
BRASS:
76 |Trumpet / Comet NO BID $ 45.00 $ 50.00 NG BID
77 Flugel Horn $ 195.00 5 45.00 $ 50.00 NO BID
78 _ |Trombone (tenor) NG BIB $ 45.00 b 50.00 NO BID
79 |Trombone {(w/F attach single rotor) $ 195,00 $ 45,00 $ 50.00 NQ BID
80 |Trombone (bass single rotor) 5 185.00 $ 45.00 $ 50.00 NQ BID
81 |Trombone (bass double rotor) $ 195.00 $ 45,00 3 50.00 1 NO BID
20f6 5/14/2007 10:26 AM .

28-016H WORK SHEET .xls



Bid No.: 28-016H
Buyer: Roni Evans

Bid Title: Musical Instrument Repair

Bid Opened: 04/30/2007

S%& THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA BID

vﬁ MANUEL PEREZ MUSIC ARTS MUSIC TECH STUDIOS
TABULATION SHEET ALL COUNTY MUSIC, INC. WOODWIND REPAIRS ENTERPRISES INC..
ftem Description Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Hourly Rate
82 {Trombone (valve) $ 195.00 & 45.00 § 50.00 NO BID
83 Single French Hom NOQ BiD 5 45.00 4 50.00 NO BID
84 |Double French Horn NO BID $ 45.00 % 50.00 NO BID
85  |Baritone / Euphonium / Alto Horn (3 valve) | NO BID $ 45,00 $ 50.00 NG BID
86 |Baritone / Euphonium / Alto Horn (4 valve) NO BID 5 45.00 $ 50.00 NO BID
87 Tuba (3 valve piston) NO BID 5 45.00 ) 50.00 NO BID
88 Tuba (4 valve piston) NO BID b 45.00 5 50.00 NO BID
89 |Tuba (3 valve rotary} NO BID b 45.00 $ 50.00 NQ BID
80  |Tuba {4 valve rotary) NC BID $ 45.00 . 50.00 NO BID
91  |Sousaphone (meial) NO BID $ 45.00 $ 50.00 NO BID
92 _ |Sousaphone (fiber / composite) NC BID 5 45.00 $ 50.00 NO BID
MARBCHING BRASS: '
93 |Valve Trombones NC BID $ 45.00 $ 50.00 NO BID
94 iBaritones NO BID $ 45.00 $ 50.00 NO BID
95 French Homs / Meilaphones F and Bb NO BID $ 45.00 $ 50.00 NO BID
{MARCHING PERCUSSION: S
86 ITrtoms NO BID NO BID NO BID
97 tQuads $ 195,00 NO BID NQ BID
98 JQuints $ 195.00 NO BID NQ BID
99 jBass Drums - all sizes $ 195.00 NO BiD - NO BID

REMARKS:
BID DRAFT WAS APPROVED BY: JOE LUECHAUER, CURRICULUM SPECIALIST, MUSIC

BIDS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED 8Y: JOE LUECHAUER, CURRICULUM SPECIALIST, MUSIC, VERONICA K. EVANS, BUYER, SUPPY MANAGEMENT & LOGISTICS DEPARTMENT
! AND ANTOINETTE SETAIR, PROJECTS COORDINATOR CONTRAT SERVICES, PHYSICAL PLANT OPERATIONS
RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDER(S) MEETING SPECIFICATIONS TERMS AND CONDITIONS. SEE ATTACHED BID REJECTION SHEET
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Bid No.: 28-016H
Buyer: Roni Evans

Bid Title: Musical Instrument Repair

Bid Opened: 04/30/2007

MICHAEL BASSICHIS

4%__1_ THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA BiD
“@'@% SUMMER ARTS SESSIONS WELLINGTON MUSIC
TABULATION SHEET INTERNATIONAL SUPPLIERS
Item Deascription Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Hourly Rate
Bidder to state hourly rates for following
equipment to perform GENERAL REPAIRS:
. |WOODWIND:
1 Clarinets {plastic) NO BID i |2:00
2 Clarinets {woocd) NO BID 50 14208
3 Flute NO BID 3 42.00
4 Flute (open hole) NO BID $ 42.00
5 Piccolo (metal) NO BID $ 48.00
8 _ |Piccolo (plastic) NC BID $ 48.00
7 Piccolo (woad) NO BID $ 48.00
8 Cboe {modified-plastic) . NO BID b 48.00
9 Cboe (modified-wood) NO BID $- 48.00
10 iOboe (full conservatory-plastic) NO BID $ 48.00
11 |Oboe (full conservatory-wood) NO BID 5 48.00
12 |Alto Saxophone NQ BID ] 42.00
13 ITenor Saxophone NOBID - 3 42.00
14~ {Soprano Saxophone NC BID $ 42.00
15 (Batritone Saxophone NO BID $ 48.00
16  {Bass Clarinet (plastic) NO BID :
17  {Bass Clarinet (wood) NO BID
18  [Alto Clarinet (plastic) NO BID
19  lAito Clarinet (wood) NO.BID
20  {Bassoon {plastic) NO BID
21 jBassoon (wood) NO BID
BRASS:
22 [Trumpet / Comet 47.00 &
23  jFiugel Homn $ 47.00 {
24  [Trombone {tenor) $ 47.00
25  |Trombone (w/F attach single rotor) $ 47.00-
26 |Trombone (bass single rotor) 3 47.00
27 [Trombone (bass double rotor) - $ 47.00 ]
28  |Trombone {valve) $ 47.00
29 |Single French Hormn $ 47.00 el
30 tDouble French Horn . $ 47.00 3
31 |Basitone / Euphonium / Alte Hom (3 valve) $ 47.00 E
32 |Barifone / Euphonium / Alte Hom (4 valve) $ 47.00
33 |Tuba (3 valve piston) $ 47.00 H5)
34 |Tuba {4 valve piston) $ 47.00
35  [Tuba (3 valve rotary) $ 47.00 2:
36 |Tuba {4 valve rotary} $ 47.00 {
37  |Sousaphone {metal) 5. 47.00
38  |Sousaphone (fiber / composite) [ 47.00
STRING:
39 |Violin $ 48.00
40  |Viola $ 48.00
41 Cello b 48.00
42  |Double Bass $ 48.00
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Bid No.: 28-016H
Buyer: Roni Evans

Bid Title: Musical Instrument Repair-

Bid Opened: 04/30/2007

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA BID MICHAEL BASSICHIS
SUMMER ARTS SESSIONS WELLINGTON MUSIC
TABULATION SHEET INTERNATIONAL - SUPPLIERS
Description ] ‘Hourly Rate M Hourly Rate

43 |Acoustical Guitar NC BID G R0
44  |Bows {mechanism, stick hair} - : $ 48.00

PERCUSSION:
45  |Percussion Auxillary NO BID
46  |Percussion Drums {share drum & toms) NOQ BID
47  |Percussion Drums {bass drum concert) NO BID
48  |Timpani NO BID
49  |Keyboard Percussion (bell kits & concert bells) NO BID
50 _ |Keyboard Percussion (large-xytophone & marimba) NO BID
51 Keyboard Percussicn {large-vibraphone) NO BID

ELECTRICAL:
52 |Electric Guitars NQ BID
53 |Electric / Electronic Keyboards NQ BID

CASES: .
54 |Cases NQ BID NO BID

Bidder to state hourly rates for following

equipment to perform MAJOR REPAIRS AND

OVERHAULS:

WOODWIND:
55  |Clarinets (plastic) NO BID
56 |Clarinets (wood) NO BID
57 {Flute ‘ NO BID 5 42.00
58  iFlute (open hole} - NO BID - $ 42.00
59  iPiccolo (metal) NQO BID $ 48.00
60 {Piccolo (plastic) NQ BID & 48.00
61 jPiccolo (wood) NO BID K 48.00
62 _10boe (modified-plastic) NO BID 8 48.00
63 1Oboe (modified-wood) NQ BID $ 48.00
64 iOboe (full conservatory-plastic) NQ BID - $ 48.00
65 |Oboe (full conservatory-wood) NO BID 5 48.00
66 |Alto Saxgphone NO BID b 42,00
87 |Tenor Saxophone NO BID 42.00
68 - |Soprano Saxophone NO BID 3 42,00
69 |Baritone Saxophong NO BID $ 48.00
70  Bass Clarinet {plastic) NO BID S A2
71  |Bass Clarinet (wood) NO BID
72  |Alto Clarinet (plastic) NO BID
73  |Alto Clarinet {wood) NO BID A0
74 |Bassogn {plastic) NQ BID 3 48.00
75 |Bassoon {(wood) NQ BID 3 48.00

BRASS:
76  |Trumpet/ Cornet 3 47.00 ;
77  |Flugel Horn $ 47.00
78 |Trombone {tenor) $ 47.00
79  |Trombone {w/F attach single rotor) [ 47.00
80 |Trombone {(bass single rotor) $ 47.00
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Bid No.: 28-016H
Buyer: Roni Evans

Bid Title: Musical Instrument Repair

Bid Opened: 04/30/2007

5_"" THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA BID MIGHAEL BASSICHIS
5% SUMMER ARTS SESSIONS WELLINGTON MUSIC
TABULATION SHEET INTERNATIONAL SUPPLIERS
Iltem Description . Hourly Rate ) Hourly Rate
81  |Trombone (bass double rotor) $ 47.00
82 |Trombone {valve) $ 47.00
83 |Single French Horn $ 47.00
84 |Double French Horn $ 47.00
86  |Baritone / Euphonium / Alto Horn (3 valve) B 47.00
86 |Baritone / Euphonium / Alto Horn (4 valve) $ 47.00
87 |Tuba {3 valve piston) $ 47.00
88  |Tuba {4 valve pisian) b 47.00
89  |Tuba (3 valve rotary) $ 47.00
90  |Tuba (4 valve rotary) b 47.00
91 Sousaphone {metal) $ 47.00
92 |Sousaphone (iiber / composite) 3 47.00 |
MARCHING BRASS:
93  |Valve Trombones $ 47.00
94  [Baritones $ 47.00
98  {French Horns / Mellaphones F and Bb $ 47.00
IMARCHING PERCUSSION:
96  jTritoms ) NO BID
97  [Quads NO BID
98 |Quints | NO BID
9% |Bass Drums - all sizes NO BID
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Bid 28-016H
Musical Instrument Repair
Bid Rejection Sheet

A conditional bid was received but rejected from Music Education Center for the following reasons:

Section 1, Bidder Acknowledgement of this bid states: “I agree to complete and unconditional acceptance of this
bid, all appendices and contents of any Addenda released hereto: 1 agree to be bound to all specifications, terms
and conditions contained in this ITB and failure to comply will result in disqualification of bid or bid item.”

General Condition 2e) states “Bid conditions and specifications shall not be changed, altered or conditioned in any
way. The Board specifically reserves the right to reject any conditional bid.”

General Condition 24 states “Payment will be made a minimum of 30 days after delivery, authorized inspection
and acceptance.”

Special Condition 12 states “Awardees must pick up instruments within 48 hours of notification unless specifically
needed for a special occasion in which immediate repair is required. Turnaround time will be three weeks
maximum for general repair and six weeks maximum for major repairs and overhauls.”

This company has included a letter with their bid stating the following conditions which are not acceptable:

1. Hourly Labor cost for any instrument repairs requiring less than 3 week turnaround shall be $200.00 per
hour.

2. No school shall be provided service with any outstanding due balance over 30 days. The School Board of
Broward County shall not consider the basis of default as the refusal of service for any school as the result
of the school having a balance amount that is due that is over 30 days.

3. Illness of any member of the workforce resulting in delays shall not be considered for default of contracted
services.

Evaluated by:

I/

Igé Luechauer, Curriculum Specialist, Music

lhriokl Y.

Veronica K. Evans, ]éu‘yer, Supply Management & Logistics

(B oD

Antoinette Setair, Projects ‘Coordinator Contract Services, Physical Plant Operations






