The School Board of Broward County, Florida
Supply Management and Logistics Department

Bid No.: 28-014B Board Meeting: JUNE 19, 2007
Description: _CAN LINERS AND COMPACTOR BAGS Notified: __ 80 Downloaded: 25
TERM CONTRACT Bids Rec'd: 8 No Bids: 2
For: VARIOUS LOCATIONS Bid Opening: MAY 2, 2007
(School/Department)
Fund: VARIOQUS FUNDS Advertised Pate: APRIL 2, 2007
Award Amount: $975,000 (PER CONTRACT PERIOD)

POSTING OF BID RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: Bid Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in the Supply Management
and Logistics Department and www.Demandstar.com on  MAY 17, 2007 @ 3:00 P.M. , and will remain posted for
72 hours. Any person desiring to protest the Bid Recommendation/Tabulation shall file, in writing, a notice of protest within 72 hours after the time
posted as stated herein, and shall file a formal written protest within ten days after filing the notice of protest. Saturdays, Sundays, legal holidays and
days during which the school district administration is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period. Filings shall be at the
office of the Director of Supply Management and Logistics Department, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351,
Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes, states that “The formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is
based.” Any person who files an action protesting and intended decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written
protest, a bond, payable to The School Board of Broward County, Florida, in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of the Board’s estimate of the total
volume of the contract. :

RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION

VENDOR NAME " ITEM(S} AWARDED
CALICO INDUSTRIES, INC. 1,2
CENTRAL POLY CORP. 3

*  PABCO INDUSTRIES, LLC 4,5

(WHITE FEMALE M/WBE: NEWARK, NJ}
* CERTIFIED M/WBE VENDOR .
RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDERS MEETING SPECIFICATIONS, TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
CONTRACT PERIOD: JULY [, 2007 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2009

IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT FOR THE REASON STATED ON THE ATTACHED BID REJECTION SHEET, THE BIDS AS STATED EITHER
IN THEIR ENTIRETY OR FOR THE PARTICULAR ITEM LISTED, BE REJECTED FOR NOT COMPLYING WITH BID REQUIREMENTS,

/4

3/30/04 Equal Opportunity Emplover, using Affirmative Action Guidelines

By: Date: MAY 15, 2007

{Buyer/Purchasing Agent)



Bid No. 28-014B _
Buyer/Purchasing Agent:Charles High

Bid Title:Can Liners and Compactor Bags

Bid Opened:5/2/07

%é:r%, THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA BID
w TABULATION SHEET All American Poly Calico Industries Central Poly Corp. Dade Paper & Bag Co.
Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extenston Unit Price { Extension
1 Can Liner, Light Duty, 10 Gallsons, Star Seal 11,500,000|Bag $ 000966|% 111,090.00 i LS 94780007 $ 0.010680 [ $ 121,900.00 NC BID NO BID
2 Can Liner, Medium Duty, 33 Gallons, Flat Seal 7,500,000|Bag $ 0.08735|% 655,125.00 it | 25600 $ 0.04120 | § 309,000.00 $ 0.11900 | $ 892,500.00
3A  |Can Liner, High Density, 60 Gallon, Star Seal 100,000|Bag $ 011540 |$§ 11,540.00 $ 010270 |$  10,270.00 NO BID NO BID
3B |Can Liner, High Density, 60 Gallon, Star Seal 60,000|Bag $ 009795 $% 5,877.00 $ 0.08710 | $ 5,226.00 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL 3A&B $ 17,417.00 il 15,496.00 NO BID
4 Can Liner, Heavy Duty, 20 Gaflons, Flat Seal 250,000}Bag $ 007332]8% 18,330.00 $ 0.07300] 35 18,250.00 $ 0.07120|$ 17,800.00 $ 0.24200] $ 60,500.00
5 _ICompactor Bags 400,000|Bag $ 031180[% 124,720.00 $ 03088016 123,520.00 $ 032800 |8 131,200.00 NOBID NO BID
3 - $ - $ - $ -
$ - $ - $ - $ -
5 - 5 - 5 - $ -
$ - $ - $ - $ -
g $ $ - $ -
$ $ ] - 3 -
b $ $ - 3 -
§ - $ 3 $ -
$ - § - $ $ -
$ - $ - 3 $ -
$ - $ - $ $ -
g - 3 - $ - b -
§ - $ - $ - $ -
$ - 3 - $ - $ -
$ - $ - $ - $ -
i) - $ - $ - $
5 - 8 - $ - $
$ - 5 - $ - $
5 - $ - $ - $
$ - $ - $ - $
$ 3 - § - $ -
§ $ 5 - $ -
$ $ 5 - b -
3 - % 5 - $ -
5 - $ 3 - $ -
$ - $ 8 - 5 -
$ - $ - $ - 3 B
5 - $ - $ - $ -
$ . $ - $ - $ -
g - $ - $ - 5 -
$ - § - § $ -
$ - 5 - $ $ -
$ - $ - $ $ -
REMARKS:

BID DRAFT WAS APPROVED BY: ROY NORTON, SUPERVISOR - CUSTODIAL GROUNDS AND MAINTENANCE
BIDS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED BY: CHARLES V. HIGH, PURGHASING AGENT Il - SUPPLY MANAGEMENT & LOGISTICS

RBRECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDER(S) MEETING SPECIFICATIONS TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
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Bid No. 28-014B Bid Titie:Can Liners and Compactor Bags Bid Opened:5/2/67
Buyer/Purchasing Agent:Charles High

__;t‘éf-’-‘___aa_ THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA BID
TABULATION SHEET ideal Supply, Inc. Interboro Packaging Pabco Industries LLC Rex Chemical Corp.
item Description Quﬂntitv Unit Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price | Extension
1 Can Liner, Light Duty, 10 Gallsons, Star Seal 11,500,0001Bag $ 0.008830|% 101,545.00 $0.009480 | §  109,020.00 $0.008250 { § 94,875.00 $0.010100 | $ 116,150.00
2 Can Liner, Medium Duty, 33 Gallons, Flat Seal 7.,500,000{Bag $ 0.083400 | % 625,500.00 $0.098600 | $  739,500.00 $0.081000 | §  607,500.00 NC BID NQ BID
3A |Can Liner, High Density, 60 Gallon, Star Seai 100,000]|Bag $ 0.103550 | § 10,355.00 $0.102400 | § 10,240.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOQ BID
3B__[Can Liner, High Density, 60 Gallon, Star Seal 60,000{Bag $ 0.083700} % 5,622.00 $0.087400 | $ 5,244.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL 3A&B $ 15,977.00 $ 15,484.00 NOQ BID NO BID NO BID
4 |Can Liner, Heavy Duty, 20 Gallons, Flat Seal 250,000|Bag $ 0.088500{%  22,125.00 NO BID NO BID 'S 0068000 16 1172500t NO BID NO BID
| ]

5 Compactor Bags 400,000|Bag $ 05038003 201,520.00 NO BID NO BID S 0. 2950060 15 NO BID NO BID

$ - $ - % - $ -

$ - $ - 5 - 3 -

$ - b - 3 - $ -

$ - $ - $ - $ -

$ - $ - $ - $ -

3 - 3 - 5 - $ B

5 - $ - 5 - $ u

$ - $ - $ - $ -

$ - $ - $ - $ -

3 - 3 - $ - $ -

$ - 3 - $ - § -

$ - $ $ - & -

$ - $ 3 - $ -

$ - $ $ - b -

$ - $ $ - $ -

$ - $ $ - $ -

$ $ $ - 3 -

$ $ - b 5 -

8 3 - 3 5 -

5 3 - 5 3 -

$ - $ - $ 3 -

$ - $ - 3 5 -

$ - b - b $ -

5 - 3 - b 3 -

$ - $ - $ 5 -

S - $ - $ 5 -

5 - 5 - 3 3 -

$ - $ - $ 5 -

5 - $ - $ - 3 -

3 - $ - b - 5 -

$ - $ - 3 3 -

g - $ - b 5 -

$ - - $ 5 -

REMARKS:

BID DRAFT WAS APPROVED BY:
BIDS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED BY:

RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDER(S) MEETING SPECIFICATIONS TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
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BID 28-014B
CAN LINERS AND COMPACTOR BAGS
BID REJECTION SHEET

ITEM 2:

Reject bid from Central Poly Corporation: General Condition 6 states that the School Board reserves the right to
reject any bid received. Bidder withdrew this bid item due to a clerical error of the unit price.




