The School Board of Broward County, Florida
Supply Management and Logistics Department

Bid No.: 26-147X Board Meeting: JUNE 6, 2006
Description: _FERTILIZERS, PESTICIDES AND RELATED Notified: 134 Downloaded: 21
LAWN CHEMICALS TERM CONTRACT Bids Rec'd: 13 No Bids: 1
For: PHYSICAL PLANT OPERATIONS Bid Opening: MARCH 30, 2006
(School/Department)
Fund: DEPARTMENT'S OPERATING BUDGET Advertised Date: MARCH 8, 2006
Award Amount: $300,000 (PER CONTRACT PERIOD)

POSTING OF BID RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: Bid Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in the Supply Management
and Logistics Department and www.Demandstar.com on APRIL 18, 2006 @ 3:00 P.M. , and will remain posted for
72 hours. Any person desiring to protest the Bid Recommendation/Tabulation shall file, in writing, a notice of protest within 72 hours after the time
posted as stated herein, and shall file a formal written protest within ten days after filing the notice of protest. Saturdays, Sundays, legal holidays and
days during which the school district administration is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period. Filings shall be at the
office of the Director of Supply Management and Logistics Department, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351.
Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes, states that “The formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is
based.” Any person who files an action protesting and intended decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written
protest, a bond, payable to The School Board of Broward County, Florida, in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of the Board's estimate of the total
volume of the contract.

RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION

VENDOR NAME ITEM(S) AWARDED
ALENZA 17

ATLANTIC FEC FERTILIZER & CHEMICAL COMPANY 2,512

DIAMOND R FERTILIZER CO., INC. 13,22

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY : 14,15, 16, 34

LESCO, INC. 6, 8, 10, 19, 23, 27, 29, 30, 33
PROSOURCE ONE 7,9, 20, 25,35

REGAL CHEMICAL COMPANY 3,4, 11

RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC. 18, 26, 28, 31

UNIVAR USA, INC. (ORLANDO) 32,36

UAP DISTRIBUTION, INC. 1,21,24

IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT FOR THE REASONS STATED ON THE ATTACHED BID REJECTION SHEET, THE BIDS AS STATED,
EITHER IN THEIR ENTIRETY OR FOR THE PARTICULAR ITEM LISTED, BE REJECTED FOR NOT COMPLYING WITH BID
REQUIREMENTS.

RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDERS MEETING SPECIFICATIONS, TERMS AND CONDITIONS.

CONTRACT PERIOD: JULY 1, 2006 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2007

(Buyer/Purchasing Agent)

By: Date: _APRIL 20, 2006

3/30/04 Equal Opportunity Employer, using Affirmative Action Guidelines



Bid No.: 26-147X Bid Title: FERTILIZERS, PESTICIDES AND RELATED LAWN CHEMICALS Bid Opened: 3/30/06
Buyer/Purchasing Agent: GEORGE TOMAN

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA BID
ATLANTIC FEC FERTILIZER DIAMOND R FERTILIZER
TABULATION SHEET ALENZA & CHEMICAL CO. CO., INC. GOLF VENTURES, INC.
Description Qty. Unit Unit Price Exten:ﬁm Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price | Extension
1 Liquid Chelated iron (CH-0000125) non-staining 100]galions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 0-0-22 SUL-PO-MAG (CH-0000110) 50}tons NO BID NO BID $ -.308.0018%  15,300.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 0-0-28 Potassium sulfate plus (CH-0000107) 30jtons NO BID NO BID b 560.00]$  16,800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 6-2-0 Mulorganite classic (CH-0000130) 50}tons NO BID NO BID 3200018 16.000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 12-0-24 Fertitizer (CH-0000301) 40itons NO BID NO BID b~ 398.00 1 $. - 15,920.00 NO BID NO BID $ 41375]% 16,550.00
6 12-2-14 Southern ornamental and landscape 30jtons NO BID NO BID 5 610.001$ 18,300.00 NO BID NO BiID $ 564251% 16,927.50
fertilizer (CH-0000152)
7 20-2-20 with Ronstar (CH-0000158) 50ltons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,387.46 1% 69,373.00
8 21-0-0 Ammondium Sulfate (CH-0000105) 40{tons NO BID NO BID $ 3408018% 13,632.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 19-2-19 Fertilizer (CH-0000159) 100}tons NO BID NO BID $ 548.00|%  54,800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 22-2-11 Fertilizer Plus Atrazine 0.90 1o 1.05% 15]tons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
11 26-2-11 Fertilizer (CH-0000146) 100}tons NO BID NO BID $ 532.00|% 53,200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 Monohydrated Manganese Sulphate Tecmangan 2}tons NO BID NO BID $  958801%  1,917.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 Amdro (CH-0000212) 12,000]pounds NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 48518 - 58,200.00 NO BID NO BID
14 Allectus SC (CH-0000203) NO SUBSTITUTION 20}gallons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15 Armada 50 WP Fungicide (CH-0000256) 3jcases NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 Award (CH-0000278) 12,000{pounds NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
17 Banvel (CH-0000253) 25}gallons $ - 48.03]8% 1,200.75 NO BID NO BID $ 70201% 1,755.00 NO BID NO BID
18 Barricade 4FL Herbicide, Selective Premergence 40]gallons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO 8ID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Herbicide (CH-0000249)

19 Chemical Neutralizer Soap (CH-0000262) 30]gallons NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 Certainty Turf Herbicide (CH-0000296) 80}bottles 3 81.5418% 6,523.20 NO BID NO BID NOBID - NO BID NO BID NO BID
21 Drive 75 DF Herbicide (CH-0000288) 120|pounds NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
22 Liquid Antifoam/Defoamer (CH-0000202) 60}bottles $ 60118 360.60 $ 62518 375.00 $ 24518 147.00 NO BID NO BID
23 Lontrel Turf and Omamental Herbicide {CH-0000237) 80]quarts NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BiD
24 M S M A 6.66 (CH-0000252) 120}gallons $ 14.50 | $ 1,740.00 NO BID NO BID $ 165019% 1,980.00 NO BID NO BID
25 Orthene Turf, Tree and Ormamental Spray 97 200}pounds NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BiD
26 QUIKPRO Herbicide Non seceltive herbicide 60}jugs $ 719518 4,317.00 $ B0O6{S 4,803.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
27 QuickSilver T & O Herbicide (CH-0000232) 60]containers| NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
28 Round-up PRO (CH-0000250) 400]gallons $ 134518 5,380.00 $ 24171% 9,668.00 $ 138018 5520.00 NO BID NO BID
29 Revolver Herbicide (CH-0000254) 200]quarts NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 Sencor 75 D.F. (CH-0000280) 30]pounds NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
31 Talstar ONE Insecticide (CH-0000240) 60lgalions NO BID NO BID NO BIiD NO BID $ 89371% 5362.20 NO BID NO BID
32 Triad Granular Bait (CH-0000305) 12,000} pounds NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
33 Chipco Top Choice Granular Insecticide (CH-0000208)] 12,000{pounds NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
34 Weedar 64 (CH-0000244) 60]gallons $ 1265138 759.00 NO BID NO BID $ 113718 682.20 NO BID NO BID
35 Varsity {CH-0000299) 12,000}pounds NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 6.561% 78,720.00 NO BID NO BiD
36 Concnetrated Wetting Penetrating Agent 40}gallons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

REMARKS:

BID DRAFT WAS APPROVED BY: RANDALL STEBBINS, SUPERVISOR Il, GROUNDS DEPARTMENT

|BIDS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED BY: RANDALL STEBBINS, SUPERVISOR i, GROUNDS DEPARTMENT

RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDER(S) MEETING SPECIFICATIONS TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
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Bid No.: 26-147X
Buyer/Purchasing Agent: GEORGE TOMAN

Bid Title: FERTILIZERS, PESTICIDES AND RELATED LAWN CHEMICALS

Bid Opened: 3/30/06

- THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA
%”ﬁ : HELENA CHEMICAL PHOENIX
BID TABULATION SHEET COMPANY LESCO, INC. PROSOURCE ONE ENVIRONMENTAL CARE
item Description Qty. Unit Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price |  Extension
1 Liquid Chelated lron (CH-0000125) non-staining 100]gallons NO BID NO BID $ 5701 8% 570.00 $ 21801 $ 2,180.00 NO BID NO BiD
2 0-0-22 SUL-PO-MAG (CH-0000110) 50ltons NO BID NO BID $ 3700018 18,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 0-0-28 Potassium sulfate plus (CH-0000107) 30jtons NO BID NO BID $  762.00 22,860.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 6-2-0 Mulorganite classic (CH-0000130) 50itons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 320001 % 16,000.00 NO BID NO BID
5 12-0-24 Fertilizer (CH-0000301) 40jtons NO BID NO BID $ 456.001% 18,240.00 $ 433.101 % 17,324.00 NO BID NO BiD
6 12-2-14 Southem omamental and landscape 30}tons NO BID NO BID $ 8340018 16,020.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
fertilizer (CH-0000152)
7 20-2-20 with Ronstar (CH-0000158) 50ltons NO BID NO BID $ 1,458.00 72,900.00 1,351.80 $ 6759500 NO BID NO BID
8 21-0-0 Ammondium Sulfate (CH-0000105) 40]tons NO BID NO BID $ 328008 . 13120.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 19-2-19 Fertilizer (CH-0000159) 100jtons NO BiD NO BID b 464.00] 3 46,400.00 $ 4295018 < 42,950.00 NO BID NO BID
10 |22-2-11 Fertilizer Plus Atrazine 0.90 to 1.05% 15{tons NO BID NO BID $ - 686001% 10,290.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
11 26-2-11 Fenrtilizer (CH-0000146) 100]tons NO BID NO BID $ 3980018 39,800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 |Monohydrated Manganese Sulphate Tecmangan 2jtons NO BID NO BID $ 86800}1% 1,736.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 |Amdro (CH-0000212) 12,000]pounds b 550 % 66,000.00 $ 5971% 71,640.00 $ 580 1% 69,600.00 NO BID NO BID
14  |Allectus SC (CH-0000203) NO SUBSTITUTION 20]gallons b - 212.00 4.240.00 $ 2495018 4,990.00 $ 21680 % 4,336.00 NO BID NO BID
15 Armada 50 WP Fungicide (CH-0000256) 3]cases 286.721% . 860.16 $ 355.001]% 1,065.00 $ 297601 $ 892.80 NO BID NO BID
16  |Award (CH-0000278) 12,000]pounds 656 1%  78,720.00 $ 597 | % 71,640.00 3 6.70 | $ 80,400.00 NO BID NO BID
17 Banvel (CH-0000253) 25]gallons $ 8264 |3 2.066.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
18 Barricade 4FL Herbicide, Selective Premergence 40{gallons $ 225101% 9,004.00 NO BID NO BID 3 23514189 9,405.60 NO BID NO BiD
Herbicide (CH-0000249)
19 Chemical Neutralizer Soap (CH-0000262) 30}gallons $ 26.921 % 807.60 $ 20.90 E 600,00 NO BiD NO BID NO BID NO BID
20  |Certainty Turf Herbicide (CH-0000296) 80]bottles $ 84601% 6,768.00 84.50 6,760.00 $ - 691518 5,532.00 NO BID NO BID
21  |Drive 75 DF Herbicide (CH-0000288) 120}pounds $ 66.97 | $  8,036.40 $ 75.001 % 9,000.00 $ 68.80 | $ 8,256.00 NO BID NO BID
22 Liquid Antifoam/Defoamer (CH-0000202) 60|bottles $ 3581% 214.80 b 33418% 200.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NGO BID
23 Lontrel Turt and Ornamental Herbicide 80lquarts $ 126.901$% 10,152.00 $ - 1254218 10,033.60 $ 128.40 | § 10,272.00 NO BID NO BID
24 M S M A 6.66 (CH-0000252) 120]gallons $ 14241% 1,708.80 $ 16.00( $ 1,920.00 14,_23 $ 1,704.00 NOBID NO BID
25 |Orthene Turf, Tree and Omamental Spray 97 200|pounds $ 91.521$% 18,304.00 $ 83318 1,666.00 $ 12701 $ 2,540.00 NO BID NO BID
26 |QUIKPRO Herbicide Non seceltive herbicide 60}jugs $ 74191%  4,451.40 $ 82.50 | ¢ 4,950.00 b 74601 % 4,476.00 NO BID NO BID
27  lQuickSilver T & O Herbicide (CH-0000232) 60jcntrs $ 103.74]|% 622440 $ 992518 +5,855.00 $ 105.101 % 6,306.00 NO BID NO BID
28 Round-up PRO (CH-0000250) 400|gallons $ 12241$%  4,896.00 g 38.00 | § 15,200.00 3 13.20 | $ 5,280.00 NO BID NO BID
29 Revolver Herbicide (CH-0000254) 200jquarts $ 167.401$ 33,480.00 S 1647819 32,956.00 $ 165.60 | § 33,120.00 NO BID NO BID
30 |Sencor 75 D.F. (CH-0000280) 30]pounds $ 3708]8% 1,112.40 ] 368518 7 1,105.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 Talstar ONE Insecticide (CH-0000240) 60}gallons $ 11200(% 6,720.00 5 173751 % 10,425.00 $ 86.00 | $ 5,160.00 $ 82501% 4,950.00
32 ITriad Granular Bait (CH-0000305) 12,000{pounds NO BID NO BID 3 1.85 19,800.00 $ 19818 23,760.00 NO BID NO BID
33 |Chipco Top Choice Granular Insecticide 12,000}pounds g 2.50 30,000.00 $ 24 $ 209,280.00 $ 265613 31,800.00 NO BID NO BID
34  |Weedar 64 (CH-0000244) 60]galions $ 10.60 1 $ 636.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
35  jVarsity (CH-0000299) 12,000} pounds NO BID NO BID $ 5971% 71,640.00 $ 8.251% 75,000.00 NO BID NO BID
36 Concnetrated Wetting Penetrating Agent 40|gallons $ 19.9318% 797.20 $ 27161 % 1,086.40 b 210019 840.00 NO BID NO BID
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Bid No.: 26-147X Bid Title: FERTILIZERS, PESTICIDES AND RELATED LAWN CHEMICALS Bid Opened: 3/30/06
Buyer/Purchasing Agent: GEORGE TOMAN

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA BID
REGAL CHEMICAL RED RIVER SPECIALTIES,
TABULATION SHEET REGAL CHEMICAL COMPANY COMPANY ALT. INC. UNIVAR USA (TAMPA)
Description Quantity | Unit Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price | Extension

1 Liquid Chelated iron (CH-0000125) non-staining 100]gallons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 7501$ 750.00 NO BID NO BID

0-0-22 SUL-PO-MAG (CH-0000110) 50jtons $  345.00 ] 9 17,260.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 0-0-28 Potassium suilate plus (CH-0000107) 30jtons § 710.00 1§ - 21,300.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 6-2-0 Mulorganite classic (CH-0000130) 50[tons b - 310001 8% 15,600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 12-0-24 Fertilizer (CH-0000301) 40}tons 5 422.001% 16,880.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 12-2-14 Southermn ornamental and landscape 30}tons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

fertilizer (CH-0000152)
7 20-2-20 with Ronstar (CH-0000158) 50]tons $ 13900018 69,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 21-0-0 Ammondium Suifate (CH-0000105) 40}tons $ 3200018 12,800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 1,180.00 | $ 47,200.00
9 19-2-19 Fentilizer (CH-0000159) 100}tons 626.00$ 62,600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 |22-2-11 Fertilizer Pius Atrazine 0.90 to 1.05% 15}tons NO BID ﬂ(_) BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BiD
11 26-2-11 Fertilizer (CH-0000146) 100}tons $ 71400 ] $  71,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 |Monchydrated Manganese Sulphate Tecmangan 2ltons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 |Amdro (CH-0000212) 12,0001;)3unds $ 61518 73,800.00 3 5501%  66,000.00 $ 5901% 70,800.00 NO BID NO BID
14 |Allectus SC (CH-0000203) NO SUBSTITUTION 20]gallons $ 2290018 4,580.00 NO BID NQO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15 |Armada 50 WP Fungicide (CH-0000256) 3]cases $ 3270018 981.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 |Award (CH-0000278) 12,000]pounds $ 67518 81,000.00 NO BID NO BID 3 7101 $ 85,200.00 NO BID NO BID
17 Banvel (CH-0000253) 25|gallons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID g 60.00 1 $ 1,500.00 NO BID NO BID
18 Barricade 4FL Herbicide, Selective Premergence 40}gallons $ 1599018 6,396.00 NO BID NO BID b 225000 % -9,000.00 NO BID NO BID

Herbicide (CH-0000249)
19 |Chemical Neutralizer Soap (CH-0000262) 30}gallons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
20  |Cenainty Turf Herbicide (CH-0000296) 80]bottles 3 85701 $ 6,856.00 NO BID NO BID $ 88401% 707200 NO BID NOQ BID
21 Drive 75 DF Herbicide (CH-0000288) 120]pounds 5 67.001 8 8,040.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
22 |Liquid Antifoam/Defoamer (CH-0000202) 60]bottles $ 50018 300.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
23 Lontrel Turf and Omamental Herbicide (CH-0000237) 80jquarts $ 14900]$% 11,920.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 M S M A 6.66 (CH-0000252) 120]gallons $ 18951 % 2,274.00 NO BID NO BID $ 147518 1,770.00 NO BID NO BID
25 Orthene Turd, Tree and Omamental Spray 97 200ipounds $ 14171 8% 2,834.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
26  |QUIKPRO Herbicide Non seceltive herbicide 60}jugs 3 875018 5,250.00 NO BID NO BID $ 69.001%  4,140.00 NO BID NO BID
27 lQuickSilver T & O Herbicide (CH-0000232) 60jcontainers NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID _ NO BID NO BID NO BID
28 Round-up PRO {CH-0000250) 400}gallons $ 24001 % 9,600.00 NO BID NO BID $ - 12.751% . 6,100.00 NO BID NO BID
29 Revolver Herbicide (CH-0000254) 200}quarts $ 175501% 35,100.00 NO BID NO BID NO BiD NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 Sencor 75 D.F. (CH-0000290) 30|pounds $ 474518 1,423.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
31 Talstar ONE Insecticide (CH-0000240) 60}gallons $ 1250018 7.500.00 NO BID NO BID $ 80.001$ - 4,800.00 NO BID NO BIiD
32 |Triad Granular Bait (CH-0000305) 12,000]{pounds NO BID NO BID NO BID NQO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
33 |Chipco Top Choice Granular Insecticide (CH-0000208 12,000]pounds $ 28018 33,600.00 NO BID NO BID $ 2951% 3540000 NO BID NO BID
34 |Weedar 64 (CH-0000244) 60}gallons $ 19101 8% 1,146.00 NO BID NO BID $ 120018 720.00 NO BID NO BID
35  |Varsity (CH-0000299) 12,000|pounds NO BiD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36 |Concnetrated Wetting Penetrating Agent 40}gallons $ 235018 940.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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Bid No.: 26-147X
Buyer/Purchasing Agent: GEORGE TOMAN

Bid Title: FERTILIZERS, PESTICIDES AND RELATED LAWN CHEMICALS

Bid Opened: 3/30/06

=

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA BID

UNIVAR USA, INC.

TABULATION SHEET (ORLANDO) UAP DISTRIBUTION, INC.
item Description Quantity | Unit Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price | Extension
1 Liquid Chelated lron (CH-0000125) non-staining 100]gallons NO BID NO BID $ 180013  1,800.00
2 0-0-22 SUL-PO-MAG (CH-0000110) 50}tons NO BID NO BID $ 4200018 21,000.00
3 0-0-28 Potassium sulfate plus (CH-0000107) 30itons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BiD
4 6-2-0 Mulorganite classic (CH-0000130) 50]tons NO BID NO BID $ 3600018% 18,000.00
5 12-0-24 Fertilizer (CH-0000301) 40jtons NO BID NO BID $ 840001 % 33,600.00
6 12-2-14 Southermn omamental and landscape 30itons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
fertilizer (CH-0000152)
7 20-2-20 with Ronstar (CH-0000158) 50jtons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 21-0-0 Ammondium Sulfate (CH-0000105) 40jtons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 19-2-19 Fertilizer (CH-0000159) 100jtons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 22-2-11 Fertilizer Plus Atrazine 0.90 to 1.05% 15jtons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
11 26-2-11 Fertilizer (CH-0000146) 100]tons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 Monohydrated Manganese Sulphate Tecmangan 2jtons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 Amdro (CH-0000212) 12,000]pounds $ 6.301% 75,600.00 NO BID NO BID
14 Allectus SC {CH-0000203) NO SUBSTITUTION 20}gallons $ 221351 8% 4,427.00 $ 2190018 4,380.00
15 Armada 50 WP Fungicide (CH-0000256) 3jcases $ 208881 9% 896.64 $ 288.0018% 864.00
16 Award {CH-0000278) 12,000]pounds 5 6901 % 82,800.00 $ 7.001 % 84,000.00
17 Banvel (CH-0000253) 25]gallons NO BID NO BID $ 8600]8% 2,150.00
18 Barricade 4FL Herbicide, Selective Premergence 40lgalions $ 243001 % 9,720.00 $ 240.0018% 9,600.00
Herbicide (CH-0000249)
19 Chemical Neutralizer Soap (CH-0000262) 30jgallons NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 Certainty Turf Herbicide {CH-0000296) 80}bottles $ 89.3418% 7,147.20 3 75.81 6,064.80
21 Drive 75 DF Herbicide (CH-0000288) 120]pounds $ 73501 $ 8,820.00 $ 660018% - 7,920.00
22 Liquid Antifoam/Defoamer (CH-0000202) 60]bottles NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
23 Lontrel Turf and Omamental Herbicide (CH-0000237) 80iquarts NO BID NO BID 5 128.001 $ 10,240.00
24 M S M A 6.66 (CH-0000252) 120]gallons $ 14601 % 1,752.00 $ 13501 % 1,620.00
25 Orthene Turd, Tree and Omamental Spray 97 200}pounds $ 13461 9% 2,692.00 b 12801 $ 2,560.00
26 QUIKPRO Herbicide Non seceltive herbicide 60}iugs $ 822018% 4,932.00 $ 816018 4,896.00
27 QuickSilver T & O Herbicide (CH-0000232) 60jcontainers $ 107.20 1 $ 6,432.00 $ 104001 3% 6,240.00
28 Round-up PRO (CH-0000250) 400}gallons $ 43361 8% 17,344.00 $ 20001% 8,000.00
29 Revoiver Herbicide (CH-0000254) 200]quants $ 168.151 9% 33,630.00 $ 170001$ 34,000.00
30 Sencor 75 D.F, (CH-0000290) 301pounds $ 38.251% 1,147.50 $ 389018% 1,167.00
31 Taistar ONE Insecticide (CH-0000240) 60jgalions $ 98.001 % 5,880.00 $ 129601 % 7,776.00
32 Triad Granular Bait (CH-0000305) 12,000]pounds $ 16018 19&00.00 NO BID NO BID
33 Chipco Top Choice Granular Insecticide (CH-0000208 12,0001pounds b 2.781% 33,360.00 $ 28118 33,720.00
34 Weedar 64 (CH-0000244) 60{gallons $ 15431 % 925.80 $ 10901 % 654,00
35 Varsity (CH-0000299) 12,000}pounds NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36  |Concnetrated Wetting Penetrating Agent 40}gallons $ 88619% 354.40 $ 440019 1,760.00
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26-147X
Fertilizers, Pesticides and Related Lawn Chemicals
Bid Rejection Sheet

Item 1

Reject bids from Lesco, Inc. and Red River Specialties, Inc. Product offered did not comply
with our specifications. Bidders offered differed formulation than what was specified.

Item 3

Reject bid from Atlantic FEC Fertilizer & Chemical Company. Product offered did not
comply with our specifications. Bidder offered differed formulation than what was specified.

Item 8

Reject bid from Regal Chemical Company. Product offered did not comply with our
specifications. Bidder offered differed formulation than what was specified.

Item 11

Reject bids from Lesco, Inc. and Atlantic FEC Fertilizer & Chemical Company. Product

offered did not comply with our specifications. Bidders offered differed formulation than what
was specified.

Item 12

Reject bid from Lesco, Inc. Product offered did not comply with our specifications. Bidder
offered differed formulation than what was specified.

Item 16

Reject bid from Lesco, Inc. Product offered did not comply with our specifications. Bidder
offered differed formulation than what was specified. '

Item 18

Reject bid from Regal Chemical Company. Product offered did not comply with our
specifications. Bidder offered differed formulation than what was specified.

Item 25

Reject bid from Lesco, Inc. Product offered did not comply with our specifications. Bidder
offered differed formulation than what was specified.



26-147X

Fertilizers, Pesticides and Related Lawn Chemicals
Bid Rejection Sheet

Page 2

Item 28

Reject bid from Helena Chemical Company Product offered did not comply with our
specifications. Bidder offered differed formulation than what was specified.

Item 35

Reject bid from Lesco, Inc. Product offered did not comply with our specifications. Bidder
offered differed formulation than what was specified.

Bid was evaluated by:

-

Randall Stebbins, Supervisor II, District Grounds Maintenance

ey



26-147X
Fertilizers, Pesticides and Related Lawn Chemicals

Statement of No Bid Summary

Number of Bidders submitting “No” Bid Statements: 1

The following is a summary of the reasons, submitted by Bidders, for not submitting bids
in response to this Invitation to Bid: .

v | Summary of Bidders Reasons for “NO” Bid:

Unable to comply with product or service specifications.

Unable to comply with scope of work.

Unable to quote on all items in the group.

Insufficient time to respond to the Invitation to Bid.

1 | Unable to hold prices firm through the term of the contract period.

Our schedule would not permit us to perform.

Unable to meet delivery requirements.

Unable to meet bond requirements.

Unable to meet insurance requirements.

Could not bid competitive prices

Being bid by their subsidiary




