
The School Board of Broward County, Florida, prohibits any policy or procedure which results in discrimination on the basis of age, color, disability, gender expression, 
national origin, marital status, race, religion, sex or sexual orientation.  Individuals who wish to file a discrimination complaint, may call the Executive Director, Benefits & EEO 

Compliance at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) may call the Equal Educational Opportunities 
(EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

REVISED: 5/19/2017 

RECOMMENDATION TABULATION 

ITB #: FY21-110 Tentative Board Meeting Date*: TBD 

ITB Title: FIRE EXTINGUISHER AND SYSTEMS # Notified: 101 # Downloaded:   4 

# of Responses Rec’d: 1 # of “No Bids”: 0 

For: PPO ITB Opening Date: 7/1/2020 
(School/Department) 

Fund: TBD Advertised Date: 6/10/2020    

POSTING OF ITB RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: ITB Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in the Procurement & 
Warehousing Services and www.Demandstar.com on 7/7/2020 @ 3:00 pm and will remain posted for 72 hours.  Any person who is adversely affected 
by the decision or intended decision shall file a notice of protest, in writing, within 72 hours after the posting of the notice of decision or intended decision. 
The formal written protest shall be filed within ten (10) days after the date the notice of protest is filed. Failure to file a notice of protest or failure to file 
a formal written protest shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under this chapter. Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes, states that “The formal written 
protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based.” Saturdays, Sundays, state holidays and days during which the 
District is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period provided. Filings shall be at the office of the Director of Procurement 
& Warehousing Services, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351. Any person who files an action protesting an intended 
decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a bond, payable to The School Board of Broward County, 
Florida, (SBBC), in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of the estimated value of the contract. Failure to post the bond required by SBBC Policy 3320, 
Part VIII, Purchasing Policies, Section N, within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of the right to protest. 

(*) The Cone of Silence, as stated in the ITB / RFP / RFQ / HARD BID, is in effect until it is approved by SBBC.  The Board meeting 
date stated above is tentative.  Confirm with the Purchasing Agent of record for the actual date the Cone of Silence has concluded.  

RECOMMENDATION TABULATION 

VENDORS ITEMS 

CITY FIRE INCORPORATED ENTIRE BID 

IN ORDER TO MEET THE NEEDS OF THE SCHOOL SYSTEM AND IN THE BEST INTEREST OF THE SCHOOL BOARD, 
THE ABOVE ITEMS ARE RECOMMENDED TO BE AWARDED TO THE BIDDER LISTED. 

CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2020 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2021. 

By: Date: 7/7/2020 
(Purchasing Agent) 
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FY21-110 Fire Extinguisher and Systems

Company Name City Fire Inc.
Company Representative Gerard Stumm, Jr.
Email Address jr@cityfireinc.com
Phone Number 954-987-1338
Fax Number 954-987-6989
Website Address www.cityfireinc.com
Street Address 5708 SW 25th Street
City Hollywood
State FL
Zip Code 33023
After Hours Contact 954-987-1338
M/WBE Certification*
Agency Issuer* Miami Dade County Schools

Summary Sheet Instructions:

2.) All Fields in the Bidder Information box (above) should be filled in
Thank you for your cooperation!

Bidder Info

*Review General Condition 52 prior to completing

1.) This form is to be filled out electronically, no handwritten summary sheets will be
accepted 
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FY21-110 Fire Extinguisher and Systems

Annual 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Description  Unit Cost 
Total Annual 

Cost
100 Each Dry Chemical Systems (50 x 2 inspections) 40.00$           4,000.00$       
300 Each CO2 Systems (150 x 2 inspections) 88.00$           26,400.00$     

300 Each Wet Agent Systems (Karbaloy or other, 150 x 2 inspections) 144.00$         43,200.00$     

Annual 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Recharging Dry Chemical - Stored Pressure Type  Unit Cost 
Total Annual 

Cost
1 Each 10 Pounds 1.00$             1.00$               
2 Each 20 Pounds 1.00$             2.00$               

25 Each 25 Pounds 1.00$             25.00$             
4 Each 50 Pounds 1.00$             4.00$               

Annual 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Recharging Dry Chemical - Cartridge Operated Type  Unit Cost 
Total Annual 

Cost
1 Each 10 Pounds 1.00$             1.00$               
2 Each 20 Pounds 1.00$             2.00$               
5 Each 30 Pounds 1.00$             5.00$               

Annual 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Recharging Carbon Dioxide  Unit Cost 
Total Annual 

Cost
5 Each 50 Pounds 25.00$           125.00$           

100 Each 75 Pounds 37.50$           3,750.00$       
5 Each 100 Pounds 50.00$           250.00$           

Annual 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Recharging Wet Agent System  Unit Cost 
Total Annual 

Cost
5 Each 1.4 gallon 1.00$             5.00$               

35 Each 1.5 gallon 80.00$           2,800.00$       
10 Each 2.4 gallon 100.00$         1,000.00$       
5 Each 2.5 gallon 100.00$         500.00$           

65 Each 3 gallon 75.00$           4,875.00$       
30 Each 4 gallon 25.00$           750.00$           
10 Each 5.5 gallon 25.00$           250.00$           
5 Each 9 gallon 25.00$           125.00$           

Annual 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Hydrostatic Testing Systems as Installed  Unit Cost 
Total Annual 

Cost
50 Each Dry Chemical 1.00$             50.00$             

150 Each Carbon Dioxide 10.00$           1,500.00$       
15 Each Wet agent 10.00$           150.00$           
50 Each Existing System Hoses 10.00$           500.00$           

150 Hours Hourly Rate for Repairs 66.00$           9,900.00$       

Semi-Annual System Inspection (per Specification A, Location schedules, type and QTY)

Recharging Services. To be requested as needed.
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FY21-110 Fire Extinguisher and Systems

Annual 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Testing Services  Unit Cost 
Total Annual 

Cost

6000 Each

ABC and/or BC Dry Chemical Extinguishers, five pound. Units 
are to be tested, tagged and labeled, in accordance with all 
applicable NFPA codes and state laws.  Includes hydro testing 
and recharging when required.  Warranty:  One year. There will 
be no additional charges.  (See Bid Specification for Group 2)

6.88$             41,280.00$     

4000 Each

ABC Dry Chemical Extinguishers, ten pound.  Units are to be 
tested, tagged and labeled, in accordance with all applicable 
NFPA codes and state laws.  Includes hydro testing and 
recharging when required.  Warranty:  One year.  There will be 
no additional charges. (See Bid Specification for Group 2)

7.88$             31,520.00$     

300 Each

BC Dry Chemical Extinguishers, ten pound. Units are to be 
tested, tagged and labeled, in accordance with all applicable 
NFPA codes and state laws.  Includes hydro testing and 
recharging when required.  Warranty:  One year.  There will be 
no additional charges.  (See Bid Specification for Group 2)

7.88$             2,364.00$       

100 Each

C02 Extinguishers, 15 pound.  Units are to be tested, tagged 
and labeled in accordance with all applicable NFPA codes and 
state laws.  Includes hydro testing and recharging when 
required.  Warranty:  One year. There will be no additional 
charges.  (See Bid Specification 1.C., page 39 for Items 2 and 3)

28.88$          2,888.00$       

100 Each

Class K Extinguishers, 12 11/16 pound.  Units are to be tested, 
tagged and labeled in accordance with all applicable NFPA codes 
and state laws.  Includes hydro testing and recharging when 
required.  Warranty:  One year. There will be no additional 
charges.  (See Bid Specification for Group 2)

38.88$          3,888.00$       

Annual 
Quantity

Unit of 
Measure

Description  Unit Cost 
Total Annual 

Cost

50 Each

Hose cut to 50 foot length.  To be assembled by Awardee with 1-
1/2 inch brass and/or Pyro Lite fittings.  Per NFPA specifications. 
(See Section 6, Bid Specifications.) 75.00$          3,750.00$       

50 Each
Fire Hose, 50 foot, to be hydro tested. Per NFPA specifications. 
(See Section 6, Bid Specifications.) 10.00$          500.00$          

75 Each

Disposal of Halon Extinguishers, nine pound. Units are to be 
neutralized and disposed of in accordance with all NFPA codes, 
EPA regulations and state laws -$               -$                

Group 1

Group 2

100,170.00$              
44,910.00$                

Total
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FY21-110 Fire Extinguisher and Systems

Item Manufacturer
 Single Fixed 

Percentage Disocunt 
1 World Fire 20%
2 Buckeye 20%
3 Amerex 20%
4 General 20%
5 Kidde 20%
6 Premal 20%
7 Badger 20%

Unit of 
Measure

Description  Rate 

Half Hour Weekends and Holiday Labor Rate 75.00$  
Hour Weekends and Holiday Labor Rate 125.00$  

Unit of 
Measure

Description  Price per Calibration 

Each Accu-Weigh Bench Scale, Model #301TADA54, Serial #1MT32181 no bid
Each Small Digital Scale, Office Depot, Model #ODES11 no bid

Unit of 
Measure

Description  Price per Calibration 

Each Ashcroft Test Gauge, 4.5" diameter, Serial #001 no bid
Each Ashcroft Test Gauge, 4.5" diameter, Serial #002 no bid
Each Ashcroft Industial Duralife Test Gauge, 2.5" diameter, Model #Q8962 no bid

Indicate discount percentage from manufacturer’s list price

Hourly Labor Rate

Annual Scale Calibration - for Fire Extinguisher Lab

Semi-Annual Pressure Gauge Calibration - for Fire Extinguisher Lab
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