Speech Pathologist

FY21-007

Speech-Language Pathology and Audiology Services

Cost Comparison

SBBC FY21-007 Miami-Dade % Variance higher

Cost/hr, Includes SBBC 18-001V ITB-18-031 CM Miami-Dade ITB-18-031-CM Palm Beach between Palm Beach
Vendor Name Evaluation Current RFP Cost/hr only Additional Cost per Evaluation RFP 17C-80B Cost/hr and SBBC
Academic Staffing S 58.00 No Bid No Bid
Amplio Speech S 58.00 No Bid No Bid
Ardor Health Solutions S 59.00 | S 58.00 S 60.00 1.7%
Boca Speech Center S 5875 | S 59.00 S 64.00 1.6%
Community Rehab Associates S 59.00 | S 59.50 S 64.75 1.5%
Comprehensive Therapy Consultants S 59.00 | $ 59.00 S 65.00 1.5%
Creative Solutions Companion Care S 58.75 No Bid No Bid
EBS Healthcare Staffing Solutions S 59.00 | $ 60.00 S 65.00 1.5%
EDU Healthcare S 59.00 | $ 59.00 S 63.50 1.6%
The Execu-Search Group S 59.00 | S 57.50 S 63.75 1.6%
Global Speech Rehab Services S 57.25 No Bid S 57.25 $110.00 per evaluation No Bid
HealthPro Pediatrics S 59.00 No Bid No Bid
Innovative Employee Solutions S 59.00 No Bid Miami-Dade Schools only awarded to a single vendor. No Bid
Invo Healthcare Associates S 59.00 | S 59.00 The cost per evaluation is additional to the hourly cost. S 66.50 1.5%
MG Therpy S 59.00 | S 59.00 No Bid
Orange Tree Staffing S 59.00 | S 60.00 S 65.00 1.5%
Pediatric Developmental Services S 58.00 No Bid No Bid
RCM Technologies/RCM Healthcare S 58.50 | $ 60.00 No Bid
Speech Rehab Services S 5875 | S 59.00 S 65.00 1.5%
Sunbelt Staffing S 59.00 | $ 59.85 No Bid
Therapro Staffing S 58.00 No Bid No Bid
Therapy Source S 58.00 No Bid No Bid

Average Variance
and Cost Avoidence

1.6%




