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i=— Procurement & Warehousing Services

\(" 4 Broward County Public Schools RECOMMENDATION TABULATION

ITB #: FY21-080 Tentative Board Meeting Date*: JUNE 23, 2020

- Playground Equipment, Surfacing, and Fabric Shade # Notified: 798 # Downloaded: 33
ITB Title: Structures

# of Responses Rec’d: 9 # of “No Bids”: 0
For: Physical Plant Operations ITB Opening Date : 4/16/2020
(School/Department)

Fund: Physical plant Operations operating budget Advertised Date: 3/20/2020

POSTING OF Select One RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: Select One Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in the Procurement
& Warehousing Services and www.Demandstar.com on April 30, 2020 @ 3:00 pm and will remain posted for 72 hours. Any person who is adversely
affected by the decision or intended decision shall file a notice of protest, in writing, within 72 hours after the posting of the notice of decision or intended
decision. The formal written protest shall be filed within ten (10) days after the date the notice of protest is filed. Failure to file a notice of protest or
failure to file a formal written protest shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under this chapter. Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes, states that “The
formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based.” Saturdays, Sundays, state holidays and days during
which the District is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period provided. Filings shall be at the office of the Director of
Procurement & Warehousing Services, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351. Any person who files an action protesting
an intended decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a bond, payable to The School Board of Broward
County, Florida, (SBBC), in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of the estimated value of the contract. Failure to post the bond required by SBBC Policy
3320, Part VIII, Purchasing Policies, Section N, within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of the right to protest.

(*) The Cone of Silence, as stated in the ITB / RFP / RFQ / HARD BID, is in effect until it is approved by SBBC. The Board meeting
date stated above is tentative. Confirm with the Purchasing Agent of record for the actual date the Cone of Silence has concluded.

RECOMMENDATION TABULATION

VENDOR(S) NAME(E) GROUP(S) AWARDED
ADVANCED RECREATIONAL CONCEPTS INC. GROUP 1,2 &3
INDUSTRIAL SHADEPORTS INC. GROUP 1,2 & 3
LANIER PLANS INC. DBA KORKAT GROUP 1,2 & 3
LEADEX CORPORATION GROUP 1,2 &3
PLAYCORE WISCONSIN DBA GAMETIME GROUP 1,2 &3
PLAYMORE WEST INC. GROUP 1,2 &3
PLAYPOWER LT FARMINGTON INC. GROUP 1,2 &3
PLAYSPACE SERVICES INC. GROUP2 & 3
ROBERTSON INDUSTRIES INC. GROUP 2

IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE BIDDERS (PER ATTACHED AWARD
RECOMMENDATION DETAILS), MEETING TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND BE ADDED TO THE EXISTING AWARDED
POOL OF VENDORS.

CONTRACT PERIOD: JULY 1, 2020 OR ON THE DATE OF ITS APPROVAL BY SBBC (WHICHEVER DATE IS LATER)

THROUGH MIDNIGHT ON JUNE 30, 2023 (OR AT MIDNIGHT THREE YEARS AFTER ACTUAL DATE OF
COMMENCEMENT), WITH AN OPTION FOR TWO (2) ADDITIONAL ONE (1) YEAR RENEWAL PERIODS.

By:  Edgoar Lugo- Date:  4/30/2020

(Purchasing Agent)

The School Board of Broward County, Florida, prohibits any policy or procedure which results in discrimination on the basis of age, color, disability, gender expression,
national origin, marital status, race, religion, sex or sexual orientation. Individuals who wish to file a discrimination complaint, may call the Executive Director, Benefits & EEO
Compliance at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) may call the Equal Educational Opportunities
(EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

REVISED: 5/19/2017
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Bid No. FY21-080

Bid Title: Playground Equipment, Surfacing,

Purchasing Agent: Edgar Lugo

and Fabric Shade Structures

Bid Opened: 4/16/2020

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY,
M |- LorRDA
BID TABULATION SHEET
GROUP 1 - Playground Equipment, Parts, and Repairs. Manufacturer & Percentage Discount of the List Price
Percentage
BIDDER Manufacturer Discount Will Quote
Playcraft Systems 1% Yes
SRP R3 1% Yes
Playtopia 1% Yes
Freenotes Harmony 1% Yes
Dynamo 1% Yes
Sports Play 1% Yes
Childforms 1% Yes
SRP Grounds For Play 1% Yes
Id Sculpture 1% Yes
Advanced Recreational Concepts, LLC Gt Grandstands 1% Yes
Bison 1% Yes
Jaypro 1% Yes
Kaypark 1% Yes
Action Fit 1% Yes
Paris 1% Yes
SRP Amenities 1% Yes
Ultrasite 1% Yes
Ultrplay 1% Yes
Park Catalog 1% Yes
Industrial Shadeports, Inc. Industrial Shadeports, Inc. 60% Yes
SRP Components 5% Yes
SRP Site Amenities 5% Yes
SRP Shade 5% Yes
. SRP Freenotes Harmony 5% Yes
Lanier Plans, Inc. dba Korkat SRP Grounds for Play 5% Yes
Big Toys 5% Yes
Dynamo 5% Yes
Tot Turf 5% Yes
BCI Burke 8% Yes
Leadex Corporation Greenfield Outdoor Fithess 0% Yes
Triactive USA Fitness Equipment 0% Yes
PlayCore Wisconsin dba GameTime GameTime 10% Yes
Playworld 5% Yes
Playmore West, Inc. Berliner 3% Yes
ExoFit 3% Yes
Playpower LT Farmington, Inc. PlayPower Little Tikes 40% Yes
Play Space Services, Inc. No Bid N/A N/A
Robertson Industries, Inc. No Bid N/A N/A
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Bid No. FY21-080
Purchasing Agent:

Bid Title: Playground Equipment, Surfacing,

Edgar Lugo

and Fabric Shade Structures

Bid Opened: 4/16/2020

GROUP 2 - Playground Surfacing and Borders (Poured-in-place, Artificial Turf, Pressure treated lumber wood border and

concrete borders). Product Manufacturer; Will Quote

BIDDER Manufacturer - If applicable Will Quote

Advanced recreational Concepts, LLC Playcraft Systems/Robert;on Industries Yes
Playspace Services Yes
Industrial Shadeports, Inc. N/A Yes
Lanier Plans, Inc. dba Korkat Top Turf Yes
Leadex Corporation Su_rface America_ Yes
Synthetic Turf International Yes
PlayCore Wisconsin dba GameTime GameTime - GTImpax Yes
Playmore West, Inc. No Fault Yes
TotTurf Yes
Xgrass Yes
Rubber Designs Yes
ForeverLawn Yes

Playpower LT Farmington, Inc. N/A Yes/No
. Playcraft Systems/Robertson Industries Yes

Play Space Services, Inc. -

Playspace Services Yes

Robertson Industries, Inc. Totturf by RSS Yes/No

GROUP 3 - Fabric Shade Structures (Replace and replacement, remove and re-install in event of a declared emergency such a

hurricane)
BIDDER Manufacturer Will Quote
Advanced recreational Concepts, LLC Bal Fabrlcs. yes
Playspace Services Yes
Industrial Shadeports, Inc. Industrial Shadeports Inc. Yes
Lanier Plans, Inc. dba Korkat Superior Recreational Products Yes
Creative Shades Yes
Leadex Corporation No equal Design Yes
Shade Systems Yes
PlayCore Wisconsin dba GameTime GameTime - GTShade Yes
Playmore West, Inc. USA Shade Yes/No
Playpower LT Farmington, Inc. N/A Yes/No
Play Space Services, Inc. Ball Fabrlcs_ Yes
' Playspace Services Yes
Robertson Industries, Inc. No Bid N/A

Additional Information & Services

Provide Utility

Provide signed and sealed

Provide compaction testing

BIDDER Locates (hourly) engineered drawings (each) (each)
Advanced recreational Concepts, LLC $ 16250 $ 1,000.00 1,800.00
Industrial Shadeports, Inc. $ 225.00| $ 1,250.00 850.00
Lanier Plans, Inc. dba Korkat $ 120.00 Normal Retail $150.00/hour
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Bid No. FY21-080
Purchasing Agent: Edgar Lugo

Bid Title: Playground Equipment, Surfacing,

and Fabric Shade Structures

Bid Opened: 4/16/2020

Leadex Corporation $ 500.00 | $ 3,500.00 1,500.00
PlayCore Wisconsin dba GameTime $2,000.00/site $ 1,200.00 2,000.00
Playmore West, Inc. $ 500.00 | $ 1,500.00 2,000.00
Playpower LT Farmington, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Play Space Services, Inc. $ 16250 | $ 1,000.00 1,800.00
Robertson Industries, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

REMARKS:

BIDS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED BY: Edgar Lugo, Procurement & Warehousing Services

RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDER(S) MEETING SPECIFICATIONS TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
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