Procurement & Warehousing Services
Broward County Public Schools

RECOMMENDATION TABULATION

ITB #: FY20-172 Tentative Board Meeting Date™:  2/4/2020
ITB Title: Environmental Sample Analysis # Notified: 797 # Downloaded: 19
# of Responses Rec’d: 3 # of “No Bids™: 0
For: Environmental Health & Safety RFP Opening Date : 12/12/2019
(School/Department)
Fund: Capital Budget Advertised Date: 11/14/2019

POSTING OF Select One RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: Select One Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in the Procurement
& Warehousing Services and www.Demandstar.com on _DECEMBER 17, 2019 @ 3:00 pm and will remain posted for 72 hours. Any person who is
adversely affected by the decision or intended decision shall file a notice of protest, in writing, within 72 hours after the posting of the notice of decision
or intended decision. The formal written protest shall be filed within ten (10) days after the date the notice of protest is filed. Failure to file a notice of
protest or failure to file a formal written protest shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under this chapter. Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes, states
that “The formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based.” Saturdays, Sundays, state holidays and
days during which the District is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period provided. Filings shall be at the office of the
Director of Procurement & Warehousing Services, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351. Any person who files an action
protesting an intended decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a bond, payable to The School Board of
Broward County, Florida, (SBBC), in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of the estimated value of the contract. Failure to post the bond required by
SBBC Policy 3320, Part V111, Purchasing Policies, Section N, within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of the right to protest.

(*) The Cone of Silence, as stated in the ITB, is in effect until it is approved by SBBC. The Board meeting date stated above is
tentative. Confirm with the Purchasing Agent of record for the actual date the Cone of Silence has concluded.

RECOMMENDATION TABULATION

VENDOR NAME(S) GROUP(S) AWARDED

EMSL ANALYTICAL, INC. GROUP 1,2 & 7 -2"? ALTERNATE
GROUP 3 & 6 — 15T ALTERNATE
GROUP 12 & 13 - PRIMARY

EMLAB P&K, LLC d/b/a EUROFINS EMLAB P&K GROUP 1,6,7,8,10 & 11 - PRIMARY
GROUP 2,12 & 14 — 15T ALTERNATE

PROFESSIONAL SERVICE INDUSTRIES, INC. d/b/a INTERTEK-PSI GROUP 1 & 7 - 15T ALTERNATE
GROUP 2, 3,4 & 14 - PRIMARY

IT ISRECOMMENDED THAT THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDER MEETING THE SPECIFICATION,
TERMS AND CONDITIONS. GROUPS 5 & 9 WERE REJECTED OR NO BID RECEIVED, THEREFORE GROUPS 5§ & 9
SERVICES WILL BE REQUESTED AS PER PURCHASING POLICIES 3320.

CONTRACT PERIOD: MARCH 1, 2020 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2023

By: Edgar Lugo Date: 12/17/2019

(Purchasing Agent)

The School Board of Broward County, Florida, prohibits any policy or procedure which results in discrimination on the basis of age, color, disability, gender expression,
national origin, marital status, race, religion, sex or sexual orientation. Individuals who wish to file a discrimination complaint, may call the Executive Director, Benefits & EEO
Compliance at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) may call the Equal Educational Opportunities
(EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.
REVISED: 5/19/2017
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Bid No. FY20-172
Environmental Sample Analysis
Bid Rejection Sheet

Group 3:

Reject Bid from EMLab P&K, LLC d/b/a Eurofins EMLab P&K Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for
Group 3. No bid submitted for item 3.1 - 6 hour & 3 hour. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 3
— AWARD: “..... For items in groups, it is necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the
group must meet specifications in order to be considered for award...... ”?

Group 4:

Reject Bid from EMSL Analytical, Inc. Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for Group 4. No bid submitted
for items 4.2 — 3 hour and 4.3 — 6 hour & 3 hour. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 3— AWARD:
“..... For items in groups, it is necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the group must
meet specifications in order to be considered for award...... ?

Reject Bid from EMLab P&K, LLC d/b/a Eurofins EMLab P&K Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for
Group 4. No bid submitted for items 4.1, 4.2 and 4.3 — 6 hour & 3 hour. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special
Condition 3— AWARD: “..... For items in groups, it is necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all
items in the group must meet specifications in order to be considered for award...... ”?

Group 5:

Reject Bid from EMSL Analytical, Inc. Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for Group 5. No bid submitted
for items 5.2 — 6 hour & 3 hour and 5.3 — 24 hour, 6 hour & 3 hour. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special
Condition 3— AWARD: “..... For items in groups, it is necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all
items in the group must meet specifications in order to be considered for award...... ”

Reject Bid from EMLab P&K, LLC d/b/a Eurofins EMLab P&K Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for
Group 5. No bid submitted. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 3 — AWARD: “..... For items in
groups, it is necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the group must meet specifications
in order to be considered for award...... ”

Reject Bid from Professional Service Industries, Inc. Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for Group 5. No
bid submitted for items 5.2. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 3— AWARD: “..... For items in
groups, it is necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the group must meet specifications
in order to be considered for award...... ”

Group 6:
Reject Bid from Professional Service Industries, Inc. Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for Group 6. No
bid submitted. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 3 — AWARD: “..... For items in groups, it is

necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the group must meet specifications in order to
be considered for award...... ”
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Group 8:

Reject Bid from EMSL Analytical, Inc. Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for Group 8. No bid submitted
for items 8.1 through 8.7 — quickest turnaround time. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 3 —
AWARD: “..... For items in groups, it is necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the
group must meet specifications in order to be considered for award...... ”?

Reject Bid from Professional Service Industries, Inc. Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for Group 8. No
bid submitted for items 8.5 through 8.7. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 3 — AWARD: “.....
For items in groups, it is necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the group must meet
specifications in order to be considered for award...... ?

Group 9:

Reject Bid from EMSL Analytical, Inc. Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for Group 9. No bid submitted
for items 9.1 — quickest turnaround time. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 3 — AWARD: “.....
For items in groups, it is necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the group must meet
specifications in order to be considered for award...... ?

Reject Bid from EMLab P&K, LLC d/b/a Eurofins EMLab P&K Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for
Group 9. No bid submitted. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 3— AWARD: “..... For items in
groups, it is necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the group must meet specifications
in order to be considered for award...... ”

Reject Bid from Professional Service Industries, Inc. Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for Group 9. No
bid submitted. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 3 — AWARD: “..... For items in groups, it is
necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the group must meet specifications in order to
be considered for award...... ”

Group 10:

Reject Bid from EMSL Analytical, Inc. Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for Group 10. No bid submitted
for items 10.1 — quickest turnaround time. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 3— AWARD: “.....
For items in groups, it is necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the group must meet
specifications in order to be considered for award...... ”

Reject Bid from Professional Service Industries, Inc. Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for Group 10. No
bid submitted. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 3 — AWARD: “..... For items in groups, it is
necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the group must meet specifications in order to
be considered for award...... ”

Group 11:

Reject Bid from EMSL Analytical, Inc. Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for Group 11. No bid
submitted. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 3 — AWARD: “..... For items in groups, it is
necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the group must meet specifications in order to
be considered for award...... ”

Reject Bid from Professional Service Industries, Inc. Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for Group 11. No
bid submitted. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 3 — AWARD: “..... For items in groups, it is
necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the group must meet specifications in order to
be considered for award...... ”
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Group 12:

Reject Bid from Professional Service Industries, Inc. Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for Group 12. No
bid submitted. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 3 — AWARD: “..... For items in groups, it is
necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the group must meet specifications in order to
be considered for award...... ”

Group 13:

Reject Bid from EMLab P&K, LLC d/b/a Eurofins EMLab P&K Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for
Group 13. No bid submitted. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 3 — AWARD: “..... For items
in groups, it is necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the group must meet
specifications in order to be considered for award...... ?

Reject Bid from Professional Service Industries, Inc. Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for Group 13. No
bid submitted. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 3 — AWARD: “..... For items in groups, it is
necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the group must meet specifications in order to
be considered for award...... ”

Group 14:

Reject Bid from EMSL Analytical, Inc. Bidder submitted an incomplete bid for Group 14. No bid
submitted. As per the Bid’s Section 4, Special Condition 3 — AWARD: “..... For items in groups, it is
necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the group must meet specifications in order to
be considered for award...... ”
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Bid No. FY20-172
Purchasing Agent: Edgar Lugo

Bid Title: Environmental Sample Analysis

Bid Opened: 12/12/2019

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA

EMLab P&K, LLC d/b/a Eurofins

BID TABULATION SHEET EMSL Analytical, Inc. EMLab P&K Professional Service Industries, Inc.
Group Description
GROUP 1 - ASBESTOS 72 hour 24 hour 6 hour 3 hour 72 hour 24 hour 6 hour 3 hour 72 hour 24 hour 6 hour 3 hour
1.1 |PLM - 40 CFR Part 763, Appendix A, Subpart F, Section 1 $8.00 $10.00 $15.00 $30.00 $7.00 $9.00 $9.45 $14.00 $6.00 $7.50 $10.00 $15.00
1.2 |PLM by Point Count - re-analysis by Point Count Method $18.00 $24.00 $35.00 $50.00 $15.00 $20.00 $22.00 $24.00 $15.00 $17.00 $25.00 $35.00
1.3 |PCM - NIOSH 7400 procedure $7.00 $9.00 $14.00 $28.00 $5.00 $7.00 $7.25 $11.00 $5.00 $6.00 $8.00 $12.00
1 [Sub-total $33.00 $43.00 $64.00 $108.00 $27.00 $36.00 $38.70 $49.00 $26.00 $30.50 $43.00 $62.00
1 |Total group price $248.00 $150.70 $161.50
GROUP 2 - ASBESTOS 72 hour 24 hour 6 hour 3 hour 72 hour 24 hour 6 hour 3 hour 72 hour 24 hour 6 hour 3 hour
2.1 |PLM - 40 CFR Part 763, Appendix A, Subpart F, Section 1 $8.00 $10.00 $15.00 $30.00 $7.00 $9.00 $9.45 $14.00 $6.00 $7.50 $10.00 $15.00
2.2 |PCM - NIOSH 7400 procedure $7.00 $9.00 $14.00 $28.00 $5.00 $7.00 $7.25 $11.00 $5.00 $6.00 $8.00 $12.00
2  |Sub-total $15.00 $19.00 $29.00 $58.00 $12.00 $16.00 $16.70 $25.00 $11.00 $13.50 $18.00 $27.00
2 |Total group price $121.00 $69.70 $69.50
GROUP 3 - ASBESTOS 72 hour 24 hour 6 hour 3 hour 72 hour 24 hour 6 hour 3 hour 72 hour 24 hour 6 hour 3 hour
3.1 |TEM (AIR) - 40 CFR Part 763, Appendix A, Subpart E $45.00 $65.00 $95.00 $200.00 $30.00 $45.00f No Bid No Bid $33.00 $40.00 $65.00 $120.00
3 |Sub-total $45.00 $65.00 $95.00 $200.00 $30.00 $45.00 $0.00 $0.00 $33.00 $40.00 $65.00 $120.00
3 |Total group price $405.00 $258.00
GROUP 4 - ASBESTOS 72 hour 24 hour 6 hour 3 hour 72 hour 24 hour 6 hour 3 hour 72 hour 24 hour 6 hour 3 hour
4.1 |TEM (AIR) - 40 CFR Part 763, Appendix A, Subpart E $45.00 $65.00 $95.00 $200.00 $30.00 $45.00] No Bid No Bid $33.00 $40.00 $65.00 $120.00
4.2 |TEM (DUST) - Micro-vac method ASTM D-5755 $85.00 $115.00 $175.00 No Bid $78.00 $68.00 No Bid No Bid $75.00 $85.00 $125.00 $200.00
4.3 |TEM (bulk) $40.00 $65.00 No Bid No Bid $32.00 $45.00f No Bid No Bid $35.00 $40.00 $45.00 $65.00
4 |Sub-total $170.00 $245.00 $270.00 $200.00 $140.00 $158.00 $0.00 $0.00 $143.00 $165.00 $235.00 $385.00
4  |Total group price $928.00
GROUP 5 - INORGANIC 72 hour 24 hour 6 hour 3 hour 72 hour 24 hour 6 hour 3 hour 72 hour 24 hour 6 hour 3 hour
Lead Paint/Air/Soil/Wipe (AAS) - NIOSH Method 7082 - Atomic Absorption
5.1 |Spectroscopy $7.00 $10.00 $15.00 $25.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.00 $6.00 $10.00 $15.00
5.2 |Paint/Air/Soil/Wipe (ICP) $45.00 $65.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lead (TCLP) Wastestream - Toxicity Charasteristic Leaching Procedure (TCLP)
5.3 |EPA Method 1311/6010B per EPA 40 CFR 261 TCLP $65.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $70.00 No Bid No bid No bid
5 Sub-total $117.00 $75.00 $15.00 $25.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00 $6.00 $10.00 $15.00
5 |Total group price
GROUP 6 - INORGANIC Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT** Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT** Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT**
6.1 |Lead, Water/Soil - Mast Spectrometry by EPA Method 200.8 $55.00 72 hours $65.00] 24 hours $22.50 5-day $39.38 2-day No bid No bid No bid No bid
6.2 |Copper, Water/Soil - Mast Spectrometry by EPA Method 200.8 $55.00 72 hours $65.00| 24 hours $22.50 5-day $39.38 2-day No bid No bid No bid No bid
6.3 |Other metals, Water/Soil - Mast Spectrometry by EPA Method 200.8 $15.00 72 hours $10.00] 24 hours $22.50 5-day $39.39 2-day No bid No bid No bid No bid
6 Sub-total $125.00 N/A $140.00 N/A $67.50 N/A $118.15 N/A No bid No bid No bid No bid
6 |Total group price $265.00 $185.65
GROUP 7 - MICROBIOLOGICAL ANALYSIS 72 hour 24 hour 6 hour 3 hour 72 hour 24 hour 6 hour 3 hour 72 hour 24 hour 6 hour 3 hour
7.1 |Fungi Direct Exam (Tape/bulk) - Identification to genus level $25.00 $30.00 $40.00 $65.00 $19.00 $20.00 $24.00 $27.00 $20.00 $25.00 $30.00 $45.00
7.2 |Spore Trap Fungi (Air) - Non-viable, identification and enumeration to genus level $25.00 $30.00 $40.00 $65.00 $19.00 $20.00 $24.00 $27.00 $25.00 $35.00 $50.00 $60.00
7 Sub-total $50.00 $60.00 $80.00 $130.00 $38.00 $40.00 $48.00 $54.00 $45.00 $60.00 $80.00 $105.00
7 |Total group price $320.00 $180.00 $290.00
GROUP 8 - MICROBIOLOGICAL ANALYSIS Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT** Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT** Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT**
8.1 [Fungi, Direct Exam & Culture (Swab) *** $70.00 2 weeks No Bid No Bid $95.00] 14 days $95.00 14 days $35.00| 6-10 days $40.00 5 days
8.2 |Fungi, Direct Exam & Culture (Rodac) *** $70.00 2 weeks No Bid No Bid $95.00f 14 dyas $95.00 14 dyas $35.00f 6-10 days $40.00 5 days
8.3 |Fungi, Direct Exam & Culture (Wipe) *** $70.00 2 weeks No Bid No Bid $95.00f 14 dyas $95.00 14 dyas $35.00] 6-10 days $40.00 5 dyas
8.4 [Cultural Fungi (Air) *** $45.00 2 weeks No Bid No Bid $75.00] 14 dyas $75.00 14 dyas $35.00| 6-10 days $40.00 5 days
8.5 |E. coli (water) $40.00 5 days No Bid No Bid $32.00[ 72 hours $42.00 Next-day No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8.6 |E. coli (swab) $40.00 2 days No Bid No Bid $32.00f 72 hours $42.00 Next-day No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8.7 |Total Coliform $40.00 2 days No Bid No Bid $32.00f 72 hours $42.00 Next-day No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 Sub-total $375.00 N/A $0.00 N/A $456.00 N/A $486.00 N/A $140.00 N/A $160.00 N/A
8 |[Total group price $942.00
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Bid No. FY20-172
Purchasing Agent: Edgar Lugo

Bid Title: Environmental Sample Analysis

Bid Opened: 12/12/2019

Identification and enumeration to genus level and species level (Aspergillus,
*** |Penicillium, Cladosporium, Stachybotrys)
GROUP 9 - MICROBIOLOGICAL ANALYSIS Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT** Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT** Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT**
9.1 |MRSA (swab) $130.00|2 weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 |Sub-total $130.00|N/A $0.00|N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 [Total group price [ NoBd |
GROUP 10 - MICROBIOLOGICAL ANALYSIS Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT** Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT** Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT**
10.1 [Legionella (culture) $130.00 2 weeks No Bid No Bid $75.00] 10-14 days $75.00f 10-14 days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10.2 [Legionella (PCR) $165.00 3 days $195.00| 2 days $112.00] 72 hours $150.00 24 hours No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 |Sub-total $295.00 N/A $195.00 N/A $187.00 N/A $225.00 N/A No Bid N/A No Bid N/A
10 [Total group price 8412.00 — Nmd ]
GROUP 11 - ORGANIC SAMPLE ANALYSIS Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT** Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT** Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT**
Semi-volatile petroleum hydrocarbons - Polycyclic Aromatic Hydrocarbons
11.1 [(PAHSs) via EPA Method 610 or 601/602 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $123.50 5-day $152.00 3-day No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11.2 [Volatile Organic Compounds - EPA Method 8260B (BTEX/MTBE) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $84.50 5-day $104.00 3-day No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11.3 |TRPH - Total Recoverabl;e Petroleum Hydrocarbons (TRPH) via FL-Pro Method No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.00 5-day $80.00 3-day No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11.4 |SPLP - Synthetic Precipitation LeaCHING Procedure (SPLP) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.50 5-day $45.50 5-day No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TCLP - Toxicity Characteristic Leaching Procedure (TCLP) EPA Method
11.5 [1311/6010B per EPA 40 CFR 261 TCLP No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.50 5-day $45.50 5-day No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 |Sub-total No Bid N/A No Bid N/A $364.00 N/A $427.00 N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 _[Total group price $791.00 [ NoBd |
GROUP 12 - ORGANIC SAMPLE ANALYSIS Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT** Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT** Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT**
12.1 |PCB (air) $65.00 1 week $95.00] 3days $130.00 5-day $100.00 3-day No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12.2 [PCB (wipe) $65.00 1 week $95.00] 3days $200.00 5-day $140.00 3-day No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12.3 [PCB (bulk) $65.00 1 week $95.00] 3 days $200.00 5-day $140.00 3-day No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12.4 [PCB (sail) $65.00 1 week $95.00f 3dyas $200.00 5-day $140.00 3-day No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 |Sub-total $260.00 N/A $380.00 N/A $730.00 N/A $520.00 N/A No Bid N/A No Bid N/A
12 |Total group price $640.00 $1,250.00 _
GROUP 13 - ORGANIC SAMPLE ANALYSIS Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT** Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT** Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT**
13.1 |Formaldehyde (air) $60.00 1 week $150.00] 2 days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13.2 |Formaldehyde (bulk) $320.00 1 week $635.00] 2 days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 |Sub-total $380.00 N/A $785.00 N/A No Bid N/A No Bid N/A No Bid N/A No Bid N/A
13 _|[Total group price $1,165.00 [ NeBd [ NoBd ]
GROUP 14 - OTHER Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT** Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT** Cost* TAT* Cost** TAT**
14.1 [Hourly rate for sample collection No Bid N/A No Bid N/A $100.00 N/A $100.00 N/A $65.00 N/A $85.00 N/A
14 |Sub-total No Bid N/A No Bid N/A $100.00 N/A $100.00 N/A $65.00 N/A $85.00 N/A
14_[Total group price [ NoBd 1] $200.00 150.00
* Provide the standard turn around time (TAT) allowable for the analysis/method
**  |Provide cost and timeframe of the quickest turn around time (TAT) allowable for the analysis/method.
Hl |

Primary
1st Alternate
2nd Alternate

REMARKS:
BIDS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED BY: Edgar Lugo, Procrement & Warehousing Services and Alison D. Witoshynsky, Environmental Health & Safety
RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDER(S) MEETING SPECIFICATIONS TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
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