The School Board of Broward County, Florida
Procurement & Warehousing Services

I'TB No.: 16-014R

Description:  HVAC-R PARTS AND SUPPLIES

TERM CONTRACT®

For: PHYSICAL PLANT OPERATIONS

Fund: DEPARTMENT’S OPERATING BUDGET

POSTING OF ITB RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION:
Warehousing Services and www.Demandstar.com on

JULY 14, 2015 @ 3:00 P.M.

Tentative Board Meeting Date®:  SEPTEMBER 16. 2015

Notified: 704 Downloaded

ITB Rec'd: 8 No Bids:

27

I'TB Opening: JUNE 16. 2015

Advertised Date:  JUNE 1. 2015

Award Amount:  $4.075.000 (PER CONTRACT PERIOD)

ITB Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in Procurement &
. and will remain posted for 72 hours. Any person

who is adversely affected by the decision or intended decision shall file a notice of protest, in writing, within 72 hours after the posting of the notice of
decision or intended decision. The formal written protest shall be filed within ten (10) days after the date the notice of protest is filed. Failure to file a
notice of protest or failure to file a formal written protest shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under this chapter. Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida
Statutes, states that “The formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based.” Saturdays. Sundays,
state holidays and days during which the school district administration is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period
provided. Filings shall be at the office of the Director of Procurement & Warehousing Services. 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323,
Sunrise, Florida 33351. Any person who files an action protesting an intended decision shall post with the School Board. at the time of filing the formal
written protest, a bond. payable to The School Board of Broward County. Florida. (SBBC). in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of the estimated
value of the contract. Failure to post the bond required by SBBC Policy 3320, Part VIII. Purchasing Policies. Section N. within the time allowed for

filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of the right to protest.

(*) The Cone of Silence, as stated in the ITB, is in effect until this bid is approved by SBBC. The School Board meeting date stated

above is a tentative date. Confirm with the Purchasing Agent of record for the actual date the Cone of Silence has concluded.

RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION

VENDOR’S NAME

*ALLIED CONTROLS. INC.
(M/WBE: WHITE FEMALE. APOPKA. FL)

B & D INDUSTRIAL/B & D TECHNOLOGIES

JOHNSON CONTROLS, INC.

SOUTHEAST FLORIDA PARTS d/b/a JOHNSTONE SUPPLY

MECHANICAL SUPPLIES CORP.
TRANE US INC.

WORLD ELECTRIC SUPPLY

*CERTIFIED MAWBLE VENDOR

/
By: v/

ITEM (S) AWARDED

20.28.33.46.48.72.92

92

91

1.5.6.7.11.16.17.18.22.29.31.34.36.37.38.47.49.50.51.52.55.56.62.63.

64.67.68.71.73.74.76.77.78.79.81.84.87.88.90,92
92
2.3.4.8.9.10.12.13.14.15.19.21.23.24.30.53.86

39.59.89.92

Date: 07/13/2015

yd y
U (qylchasing Agent)

The School Board of Broward County. Florida. prohibits any policy or procedure which results i discrimmation on the basis of

“age. color. disability, gender expression.

national origin_ marital status. race. religion. sex or sexual orientation. Individuals who wish to file a discrimimation complaint. may call the Executive Director. Benefits & EEO
Compliance at 754-321-2150 or Teletvpe Machme (TTY) at 754-321-2138

Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) may call the Equal Educational Opportunities
(EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletvpe Machie (TTY ) at 7534-321-2158

REVISED: 2/13/14




PAGE 2

ITEMS 25.26.27.32.3540.,41.42.,43.44,45,5457.58.60.61.65.66.69.70.75.80.82.83.85: NO BIDS RECEIVED. ITEMS WILL NOT BE REBID. ITEMS
WILL BE PURCHASED ACCORDING TO STANDARD PURCHASING PROCEDURES.

ITEM 92: RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE BIDDERS WHO OFFERED A SINGLE FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT
AND OTHERWISE COMPLIED WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS. TERMS AND CONDITIONS.

RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDERS MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. TEMS AND CONDITONS.
CONTRACT PERIOD: OCTOBER 1, 2015 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30. 2018.

3
By: X Ag Yy SL 7. — Date: 07/13/2015

(V4 (I@ﬁmsing Agent)
The School Board of Broward County. Florida. prohibits any policy or procedure which results in discrimiation on the basis of age. color. disability. gender expression.
national onigim. marital status. race. religion. sex or sexual orientation. Individuals who wish to file a discrimination complamt. mav call the Executive Director. Benefits & EEO
Comphance at 754-321-2150 or Teletvpe Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158

Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabihities Act (ADA) mav call the Equal Educational Opportunities
(EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletvpe Machme (TTY) at 754-321-2158
REVISED 2/13/14



Bid 16-014R
HVAC-R Parts and Supplies
Summary of Bid Rejections and Results of Tied Bids

item 33

Tie bid received from two vendors. General Condition 48 states that when identical prices are recaived
from two or more vendors and all factors are equal, priority for award shall be given to the vendors in

sequence. Allied Controls, Inc. breaks the tie as a Broward County-Certified Minority/Women Business
Enterprise.

Item 63

Tie bid received from two vendors. General Condition 48 states that when identical prices are received
from two or more vendors and all factors are equal, priority for award shall be given to the vendors in
sequence. Southeast Florida Parts d/b/a Johnstone Supply breaks the tie as the Broward County vendor,
other than a Minority/Women Business Enterprise vendor.




Bid No. 16-014R
Purchasing Agent: Greg Jackson

Bid Title: HYAC-R Paris and Supplies

Big Opened: 6/16/15

' THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA
B&D Industrial/B&D
BID TABULATION SHEET AccuAir, inc. Allied Controls, Inc. Technologies
Bid Unit Bid Price Bid Unit Bid Price Bid Umit td Frice
Description Quantity | Unit Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension
1 [Contactor A/C 3P40A 24V Packard, Inc. #C340A 300 ea |]NOEBID NO BID NO EID NOBID NO BID NG BID
2 |Dryer, Liguid Line, 3/8" SWT, 8 cu. Alco #EK-0835 472 ea ||NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 |Charging Hose, vellow, &' w/EZ turn filling Uniweld, Inc. 1,530 ea | [INO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID NO BID NG BID
4 |Thermmometer, 30/240F, adj. 3.5" stem, aluminum 380 ea NO BID NO BID $ 4382 | $ 16,651.60 | |INO BID NO BID
5 |Vent, Air 3/4" Maid-O-Mist #No. 75 195 ea | jNOBID NO BID NO BID NG BID NOBID NO BID
6 |Run Capacitor, SM370 Packard, Inc. 350 ea [|INCBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 |Capacitor, 10 MFD 440V Packard, Inc. 280 ea ||INO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 |Driercore, A/C, burnout block, Alco #W-48 317 ea |[INO BID NO BID INC BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 |Manifold, 2V, 41 Series Ritchie Eng. #41212 200 ea NO BID NO BID NG BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID
10 |Oil Vacuum Pump 1 Gallon, J/B Industries DVO-24-BX 168 ea NO BID NO BID |NO BID NOQ BID NO BID NO BID
11 |Relay Fan enclosed, Packard Inc. #90-233Q 260 ea NO BID NGO BID NO BID NGO BID ||_N0 BIiD NO BID
12 [Flow Switch, 150 PSI, 225F Xylem #120610 250 ea |F\|o BID NQ BID InO BID NG BID NG BID NC BID
13 [Nipple Brass, 1/4" x 6", LDR Industries #32514X6 280 ea_ ||[NCBID NO BID NO BID NC BID NG BID NO BID
14 |Fan, 3 blade, 30", 27 pitch, staked hub 285 ea ||INCBID NO BID NO BID NO BID INOBID NO BID
15__|Element Oil, refrigerant filter, 3.65 OD X 12.90 150 ea | |INC BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |[NO BID NO BID
16 __|Run Capagcitor, 10M370, Packard Inc. #TOC10 200 ea |NO BID NQ BID INOo BID NG BID NO BID NO BID
17 |Capacitor, 7.5 MFD, 440 Packard Inc. 400 ea ||INOBID NG BID Fo BID NC BID [INO BID NC BID
18 |Sleeve Compression, 3/8" JMF Company #60-6 2,000 ea | ||NC BID NO BID NG BID NG BID NG BID NO BID
19 |Gauge, low side, 2-1/2" JB Industries #M2-250 210 ea | INO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID [noBID NO BID
20 |Thermostat, wicover, DA, unit vent Siebe 180 ea |INO BID NO BID { $163.72 $29,469.60 { [NOBID NO BiD
21 {Transformer 75VA, Packard Inc. #PF52475 130 ea | [INO BID NO BID “_NO BID NQ BID INO BID NOQ BID
22 |Service valve, 1/8" OD C&D Valve #CD3608 330 ea_ | [NO BID NC BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
23 |Brass Air Cock, 1/4” MSC Industries #37013208 230 ea | JNO BIiD NO BID JINO BID NO BID I:No BID NO BID
24 _|Gas leak Detector, 8 0z. Supco #H522008 390 ea_ | iNO BiD NO BID NO BID NO BID NC BID NO BID
SINGLE-FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT

25 _|Alco (Emerson Electric} NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID NC BID
26 |Andover/infinity ||yo BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
27 |Aspera NO BID NOBID NQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
28 1Barbara Coleman {TAC/Schreider Electric) [nO BID NO BID 82% [nO BID NO BID
29 [Bard [ 26.0% 30% [INO BID NO BID
30 {Belimo [NO BID NO BID 59% [NO BID NO BID
31 |Bristol nC BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NC BID
32 |Boston/Fincor [NO BID NG BID NO BID NO BID ||NO BID NO BID
33 [Carrier [nO BID NO EID 40% NO BID NO BID
34 |C&D NQ BID NO BID NG BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID
35 |Cerro NO BID NO BID NOQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BiD
36__|Climate Control NO BID NO BID NO BID NOC BID NO BID NO BID
37 __|Copeland (including Copelametic and Copelaweld) NQ BID NO BID NO BID NOQ BID NO BID NO BID
38 ICPS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
38 |Cutler Hammer NC BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID NC BID NQ BID
40 [Dayton iNO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID NGO BID NO BID
41 |Dunham-Bugh NG BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ING BID NO BID
42 |Dynaflow INnO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
43 |Embracco |NO BID NQ BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID NQ BID
44 |Engelhard NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NC BID NO BID
45 |Eubanks i{NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
45 |Evapeo NG BID NO BID 12% [[NO BID NO BID




Bid No. :16-0‘_14R Bid Title: HYAC-R Parts and Supplies Bid Opened: 6/16/15
Purchasing Agent: Greg Jackson

- THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA
=== B&D Industrial/B&D
Vﬁ BID TABULATION SHEET AccuAir, Inc. Allied Controis, Inc. Technologies
Bid Unit Bid Price Bid Unit Bid Price Bid Unit id Price
Hem ) Description Guantity | Unit Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension

47 |Fasco NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
48  |Fumas (Siemens) [NO BID NO BID 58% [INO BID NO BID
49 |General Electric [NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID [ING BID NO BID
50 |Harris NQ BID NC BID NQ BID NO BID [[NO BID NO BID
51 |Heatcraft-Climate Controt NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID H_No BID NO BID
52 |Henry NO BID NC BID NO BID NG BID NO BID NG BID
53 |Honeywell NO BID NO BID 61% I_NO BID NO BID
54 |Hub City NO BID NO BID NC BID NC BID NO BID NC BID
55 |Johnson Controls NO BID NO BID 58% NO BID NO BID
56 |Landis & Staefa (Siemens) NO BID NO BID 58% NO BID NO BID
57 |Lau ‘NO BID NO BID NOC BID NOC BID NO BID NC BID
58 |Lennox NOC BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID
59  |Magnetek-Universal liINO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
60 |Mallory . NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
61 |Marley ||'No BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
62 [Mars lINO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BIiD
63 |McQuay |NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
64__{Mueller Brass NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BiD NG BID NO BID
65  iNibco NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID JINO BID NO BiD
66 |Packard NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID InO BID NO BID
67 _|Parker NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID Ino BID NO BID
68 |Penn INO BID NO BID 59% ||_N0 BID NO BID
69 |Plastron-Action Tubing (Non-Toxic, Food Grade} "_No BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID NO BID
70 {Protec - NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID
71 |Ranco [NC BID NO BID 61% NG BID NO BID
72 |Rheem [NO BID NO BID 30% IINO BID NO BID
73 |Robertshaw (TAC/Schneider Electric) [nO BID NO BID 61% 11_NO BID NO BID
74 _|Siebe |!\|o BID NO BID 61% NG BID NO BID
75 |Sporian NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID I}No BID NO BID
76 |SgquareD NO BID ND BiD 10% NO BID NO BID
77 _|Steveco NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID NG BID NC BID
78 |Supco NO BiD NO BID NO BID NC BID NG BID NQ BID
79 [Superior NO BID NO BID NO BID NOC BID I_NO BID NO BID
80 |[Tara NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID
81 [Tecumseh NO BID NO BID NO BID NOC BID NQO BID NO BID
82 |Thermo Care Mayer/Perma Pipe NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
83 |Themno Plastic (Non-Toxic, Food Grade) NO BID NG BID NO BID NC BID NO BID NO BiD
84 |[TIF INO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
85 |Tower Tech iNOG BID NO BID NO BID NO BID INO BID NO BID
86 |[Trane |_N0 BID NO BID 37% N BID NO BID
87 |Virginia Dryers NO BID NO BID NO BIb NO BID InoBID NO BID
88 |Wagner Diversitech (Plastic Tubing must be Non-Toxic Ino BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID INno BID NO BID
89 _[Westinghouse (Siemens) ||_NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID INO BID NQ BID
90 _|White Rodgers NO BID NO BID 55% NO BID NO BID
99 |York International {Johnson Controls) NC BID NQ BID 11% NO BID NO BID




Bid No. 16-014R

Purchasing Agent: Greg Jackson

Bid Title: HYAC-R Parts and Supplies

Bid Opened: 6/16/15

BID DRAFT WAS APPROVED BY: Greg Jackson, Procurement & Warehousing Services
BIDS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED BY: Greg Jackson, Procurement & Warehousing Services
RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDER(S) MEETING SPECGIFICATIONS TERMS AND CONDITIONS.

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA
B&D Industrial/B&D
- BID TABULATION SHEET Accudir, Ing. Allied Controls, Inc. Technologies
Bid Unit Bid Price Bid Unit Bid Price Bid Unit id Price
Description Quantity | Unit Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension
g2 |ADDITIONAL MANUFACTURERS
A |Most Current Manufacturer's List Price, Catalog and Date NO BID NO BID Trerice 25% Citel 20%
8  |Most Current Manufacturer's List Price, Catalog and Date Ino BID NO BID Siemens 58% ABE LVP 10%
C  |Most Current Manufacturer's List Price, Catalog and Date NG BID NO BID Veris 30% fNO BID NO BID
D [Most Current Manufacturer’s List Price, Catalog and Date NG BID NO BID BAG 20% NG BID NQ BID
E |Most Current Manufacturer's List Price, Catalog and Date [INO BID NO BID Kele 30% [nO BID NO BID
F  |Most Current Manufacturer’s List Price, Catalog and Date JINO BID NO BID KMC 50% [noBiD NO BID
G |Most Current Manufacturer's List Price, Catalog and Date [[NO BID NQ BID McDonnell & 10% iNO BID NQ BID
REMARKS:




Bid No. 16-014R

Purchasing Agent: Greg Jackson

Bid Title: HVAC-R Parts and Supplies

Bid Opened: 6/16/15

- THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA
=== Southeast Florida Parts
¥, iy BID TABULATION SHEET Johnson Controls, Inc. Mechanical Supplies Corp. d/b/a Johnstone Supply
Bid Unit Bid Price id Unit id Price id Unit d Price
Item Description Quantity | Unit " Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension
1 [Contactor A/C 3P40A 24V Packard, Inc. #C340A 300 ea | |NO BID NO EID [NO BID NO BID $ 10.25]$  3,075.00
2 |Dryer, Liquid Line, 3/8" SWT, 8 cu. Alco #EK-083S 472 ea |[NCBID NG BID lIno BID NG BID $ 1426 | $ 6,730.72
3 [Charging Hose, yellow, 8' w/EZ tumn filling Uniweld, Inc. 1,530 es ||_NO BID NQ BID ||_NO BID NO BID 3 2340 | $ 35,802.00
4 |Thermometer, 30/240F, adj. 3.5" stem, aluminum 380 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3585 % 13,623.00
5 |Vent, Air 3/4" Maid-O-Mist #No. 75 195 ea |INOBID NOBID [Ino BID NO BID 3 3290 %  6.415.50
6 |Run Capacitor, SM370 Packard, Inc. 350 ea | [NOBID NO BID [no BID NO BID 3 1.001$  350.00
7 |Capacitor, 10 MFD 440V Packard, Inc. 280 ea | |[NO BID NO BID [Ino BID NO BID $ 185]8 _ 518.00
8 |Driercore, A/C, bumout block, Alco §W-48 317 ea UNO BID NO BID iNG BID NG BID $ 3027 [§  9,595.59
9 [Manifold, 2V, 41 Series Ritchie Eng. #41212 200 ea “_NO BID NO BID !*NO BID NO BID $ 5870 [$ 11.740.00
10 |Oil Vacuum Pump 1 Gallon, J/B industries DVO-24-BX 168 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3 19.90 | §  3,343.20
11 |Relay Fan enclosed, Packard Inc. #90-293Q 260 ea |[INOBID NO BID {NO BID NO BID 3 52083  1,352.00
12 |Flow Switch, 150 PSI, 225F Xylem #120610 250 ea | INO BID NO BID iNO BID NO BID $ 15245 % 38,11250
13 [Nipple Brass, 1/4" x 6", LDR Industries #32514X6 290 ea | [INOBID NO BID iNnOBID NO BID $ 475 $ 1,877.50
14 |Fan, 3 blade, 30", 27 pitch, staked hub 285 ea | INOBID NO BID ||_NO BID NO BID ING BID NO BID
15 {Element Gil, refrigerant fitter, 3.65 OD X 12.90 190 ea | [[NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOC BID NO BID
18 {Run Capacitor, 10M370, Packard Inc. #TOC10 200 ea |[NOBID NO BID {NOBID NO BID 1290$  258.00
17 |Capacitor, 7.5 MFD, 440 Packard Inc. 400 ea | [INO BID NO BID [INO BID NO BID 1.19 476.00
18 |Sleeve Compression, 3/8" JMF Comparny #60-6 2,000 ca | [INO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 01018  200.00
19 |Gauge, low side, 2-1/2" JB Industries #M2-250 210 ea |[INC BID NO-BID INOBID NO BID $ 12.85 [ $§  2,719.50
20 |Thermostat, w/cover, DA, unit vent Siebe 180 ea_ | [[NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID $ 174.22 | $ 31,359.60
21 {Transformer 75VA, Packard Inc, #PF52475 130 ea_ | [[NOBID NO BID "'No BID NO BID $ 20.70 [§  2,691.00
22 |Senice valve, 1/8" OD C&D Valve #CD3608 330 ea | [[NOBID NO BID NoBID NO BID $ 1538 504.80
23 |Brass Air Cock, 1/4" MSC Industries #37013208 230 ea l_NO BID NO BID [INC BID NO BID $ 1795 §  4,128.50
24  |Gas leak Detector, 8 oz. Supco #HS22008 390 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3 44018 1,716.00
SINGLE-FIXED PERCENTAGE PISCOUNT ‘
25 |Alco (Emerson Electric) NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID ING BID NO BID
26 |Andover/Infinity [INO BID NO BID Fuo BID NQ BID INO BID NO BID
27 _|Aspera “_NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
28 |Barbara Coieman (TAC/Schneider Electric) NO BID NO BID |[NO BID NQ BID 61.5%
28 |Bard [[NO BID NO BID INC BID NO BID 38%
30 [Belimo [[NO BID NO BID [INO BID NO BID 61%
31 |Bristol liNO BID NO BID I 50% 51%
32 IBoston/Fincor NO BID NO BID [nO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
33 [Carrier ]NO BID NO BID 40% [NC BID NO BID
34 |ca&D iNO BID NO BID INO BID NO BID I 21%
35 |Cerro inoBID NO BID [INO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36 |Climate Control iNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 51%
37 |Copeland (including Copelametic and Copelaweld) [[NO BID NO BID 50% 5%
38 |CPS INC BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 16%
39 [Cutler Hammer [INO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID 51%
40 [Dayton NO EID NO BID NOBID NQ BID NO BID NO BID
41 |Dunham-Bush NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID [nC BID NOC BID
42 |Dynaflow NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO EID NO BID
43 |Embracco NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID INO BID NO BID
44 {Engefhard [NnOoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID [NO BID NO BID




Bid No. 16-014R
Purchasing Agent: Greg Jackson

Bid Title: HYAC-R Parts and Supplies

Bid Opened: 6/16/15

v THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA
E_:.,-“ "-'?,:-._:_: Southeast Florida Parts
—V L BID TABULATION SHEET Johnson Controls, Inc, Mechanical Suppties Corp. d/b/a Johnstone Supply
id Uit Bid Frice Bid Unit ’_EB.ld Price Bid Unit Bid Price
Item Description Quantity | Unit Price Extension Price Extension’ Price Extension
45 |Eubanks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BIP NO BID NO BID
46 |Evapco NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
47 |Fasco NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 51%
48 [Fumnas (Siemens) iNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 51%
49 |Generai Electric jnO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 51%
50 |Hamis [N BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID 10%
51 |Heatcraft-Climate Control [INC BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 51%
52 |Henry [INC BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 20%
53 |Honeywell [INO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 61.5%
54 {Hub City NG BID NQ BID NO BiD NO BiD NG BID NO BID
55 [Johnson Controls 50% 15% 61%
56 |Landis & Stasta (Siemens) [NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 61.5%
57 _|Lau [[nO BID NO BID lfzo BID NQ BID NO BiD NO BID
58 |Lennox [nO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID NO BID
59 |Magnetek-Universal NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID H_No BID NO BID
60 |Mallory NO BID NQ BID NOC BID NG BID NO BID NO BID
61 |Mariey NO BiD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BiD NO BID
62 |Mars NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 51%
63 |McQuay NO BID NO BID 15% 15%
64 |Mueller Brass NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID 29%
65 |Nibeo NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
66 [Packard NO BID NO BID NO EID NO BID NO BID NO BID
67 |Parker NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 30%
68 |Penn ' NO BID NO BID NO BID NOC BID 61%
68  |Plastron-Action Tubing {Non-Toxic, Food Grade) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID NG BID
70 |Protec ' NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BiD
71 |Ranco NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID “61.5%
72 |Rheem NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
73 |Robertshaw (TAC/Schnieider Electric) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 61.5%
74 |Siebe NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 61.5%
75 |Sporlan NO BID NO BiD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
76 |Square-D NO BiD NO BID NO BID NO BID 61.5%
77 |Steveco NO BID NO BID JINO BID NO BID 56%
78 |Supco HNO BID NO BID Iino BID NO BID 20%
78 |Superior ENO BID NO BID [INO BID NO BID - 35%
80 |Tara iINO BID NO BID [no BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
81 [Tecumseh [no BID NO BID 50% i 56%
82 |Therma Care Mayer/Perma Pipe InoBID- NO BID InoBiD NO BID NO BID NQ BID
83 [Thenmo Plastic (Non-Toxic, Food Grade) INO BID NO BID INoBiD NO BID }NO BID NO BID
84 |TIF InoBID NO BID Ino BID NO BID 13.2%
85 |Tower Tech [Ino BID NO BID 1}1\10 BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
86 |[Trane NG BID NO BID NO BID NO BiD NO BID NO BID
87 |Virginia Dryers IIno BID NO BID iNO BID NO BID 30%
BB |Wagner Diversitech (Plastic Tubing must be Non-Toxic NG BID NO BID IIno BID NO BID 63%
89  |Westinghouse (Siemens) NG BID NO BID INO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID




Bid No. 16-014R

1 Bid Title: HYAC-R Parts and Supplies
Purchasing Agent: Greg Jackson

Bid Opened: 6/16/15

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA -

Southeast Florida Parts
BID TABULATION SHEET Johnson Controls, Inc. Mechanical Supplies Corp. d/b/a_Johnstone Supply
Bid Unit Bid Price B'la'Uﬁ'rt__EEia'Prlce Bid Unit Bid Price
Description Quantity | Unit Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension
90 [White Rodgers INCBID NO BID INO BID NO BID 56%
91 |York Intemational (Johnson Controls) 25% 15% NO BID NO BID

92 |ADDITIONAL MANUFACTURERS - -
A |Most Current Manufacturer's List Price, Catalog and Date NO BID Danfoss - 25% rParagon Time 45%

s [ i
B Most Current Manufacturer's List Price, Catalog and Date NO BID NO BID Johngtone Su 67%
C  [Most Current Manufacturer's List Price, Catalog and Date NO BID : NO BID Robinair Traddg 13.2%
D |Most Current Manufacturer's List Price, Catalog and Date NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
E  [Most Current Manufacturer's List Price, Catalog and Date NQ BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID
F_ |Most Current Manufacturer's List Price, Catalog and Date NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID

REMARKS: '

BID DRAFT WAS APPROVED BY: Greg Jackson, Procurement & Warehousing Services
BIDS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED BY: Greg Jackson, Procurernent & Warehousing Services
RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDER(S) MEETING SPECIFICATIONS TERMS AND CONDITIONS.




Bid No, 16-014R

Bid Title: HVAC-R Parts and Supplies
Purchasing Agent: Greg Jackson

Bid Opened: 6/16/15

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA
BID TABULATION SHEET Trane US, Inc. World Electric Supply
Bid Unit Bid Price Bid Unit Eiﬂ'g'ﬁoe Bid Unit Bid Price
Description Quantity | Unit Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension
1 Contactor A/C 3P40A 24V Packard, Inc. #C340A 300 ea 3 1428 | $ 4,284.00 NO BID NQO BID
2  |Dryer, Liquid Line, 3/8" SWT, 8 cu. Alco #EK-0835 472 ea 3 1284 | $ 6,060.48 NO BID NO BID
3 |Charging Hose, yellow, 6' w/EZ turn filtling Uniweld, Inc. 1,530 ea $ 22.81 1 § 34,889.30 NO BID NO BID
4 Thermometer, 30/240F, adj. 3.5" stem, aluminum 380 ea 5 30.00 § § 11,400.00 NO BID NO BID
5 Vent, Air 3/4" Maid-O-Mist #No. 75 195 ea $ 3765 % 7,341.75 NO BID NO BID
[3] Run Capacitor, SM370 Packard, Inc. 350 ea $ 106 |$ 371.00 | NO BID NC BID
7 Capacitor, 10 MFD 440V Packard, Inc. 280 ea b 199§ 557.20 | [INO BID NQ BID
8 |Driercore, A/C, bumout block, Alco #W-48 317 ea 3 1843 $ 584231 ] |[NOBID NO BID
9 Manifold, 2V, 41 Series Ritchie Eng. #41212 200 ea $ 43741 % B,748.00 ||N0 BID NO BID
10 |Oil Vacuum Pump 1 Gallon, J/B Industries DVO-24-BX 168 ea ] 1821 1§ 3,058.28{ [NO BID NO BID
11 Relay Fan enclosed, Packard Inc. #90-2930Q 260 ea 5 616 | $ 1,601.680 ||NO BID NO BID
12 Flow Switch, 150 PSI, 225F Xylem #120610 250 ea $  149.26 | $ 37,315.00 | INO BID NO BID
13 {Nipple Brags, 1/4" x 6", LDR Industries #32514X6 290 ea $ 3.38F$  980.20 | INOBID NO BID
14 JFan, 3 blade, 30", 27 pitch, staked hub 285 ea $ 80.45 | § 22,928.25 ] [[NO BID NO BID
15 |Element Qil, refrigerant filter, 3.65 OD X 12.90 190 ea $ 180.24 | § 84,245.60 | |[NO BID NO BID
18 |Bun Capacitor, 10M370, Packard Inc. #T0OC10 200 ea % 164 % 328.00 F&O BID NO BID
17 |Capacitor, 7.5 MFD, 440 Packard Inc. 400 ea $ 1.791%  716.00 | |[NOBID NO BID
18 [Sleeve Compression, 3/8" JMF Company #60-6 2,000 ea $ 0.20 1§ 400.00 | [INO BID NO BID
19 |Gauge, low side, 2-1/2" JB Industries #M2-250 210 ea $ 9550 % 2,005.50] [INOBID NO BiD
20 |Thermostat, w/icover, DA, unit vent Siebe 180 ea $ 165.90 | § 29,862.00 | [INO BID NO BID
21 |Transformer 75VA, Packard Inc. #PF52475 130 ea $ 18.78 $ 2,441.46] [[NOBID NO BID
22  |Service valve, 1/8" OD C&D Valve #CD3608 330 ea 3 168 [§ 554.40 [ |[NOBID NO BID
23 |Brass Air Cock, 1/4" MSC Industries #37013208 230 ea ] 11.89 1 5 _2.734.70 § [[NO BID NO BID
24 |Gas 'eak Detector, 8 oz. Supco #H522008 320 ea $ 3951% 1,540.50F {INOBID NO BID
SINGLE-FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT :
25 |Alco (Emerson Electric) NQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
26 Andover/Infinity NQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
27 |Aspera NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID
28 |Barbara Coleman (TAC/Schneider Electric) NQO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
29 |[Bard NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 [Belimo 62.50%] || NO BID NO BID
31 |Bristol NO BID NO BID NC BID NO BID
32 {Boston/Fincor NG BID NOBID NO BID NO BIB
33 [Carrier ING BID NO BID NO BID NO BiD
34 IC&D |NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
35 |Cerro NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36 |Climate Control INO BID NO BID NO BiD NQ BID
37 |Copeland (including Copelametic and Copelaweld) |NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
38 |CPS NG BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
39 |Cutler Hammer [noED NO BID 65%
40  |Dayton INno BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID
41 |Dunham-Bush InoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
42  |Dynaflow INO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID
43 |Embracco INO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID
44  |Engelhard NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




Bid No. 16-014R
Purchasing Agent: Greg Jackson

Bid Title: HVAC-R Parts and Supplies

Bid Opened: 6/16/15

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA
BID TABULATION SHEET Trane US, Inc. World Electric Supply
Bid Unit Bid Price Bid Unit Bid Price id Unit Bid Price
Description Quantity | Unit Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension
45 |Eubanks NO BID NC BID NQ BID NC BID
46 |Evapco I'NO BID NQ BID NQ BID NQ BID
47 |Fasco NG BID NO BID 45%
48 |Furnas {Siemens) [INO BID NO BID 55%
49 1General Electric ||_NO BiD NO BID 45%
50 |Harris NO BID NC BID NO BID NO BID
51 [Heatcraft-Climate Control NO BID NC BID NC BID NQ BID
52 |Henry NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
53 |Honeywell 62.50% 60%
54  |Hub City NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID
55 lJohnson Controls NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
56 |Landis & Staefa (Siemens) NQ BID NQ BID NG BID NO BID
57 |Lau NQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
58 iennox NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
58 |Magnetek-Universal NO BID NO BID 55%
60 |Mallory [Ino BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
61 [Marley ||_NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
62 |Mars NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
63 {McQuay [INC BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
64  1Mueller Brags |NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
85 [Nibco NO BID NO BID NOQ BID NO BID
66 |Packard WNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
67 {Parker HNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
68 |Penn iINO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
62 _|Piastron-Action Tubing (Non-Toxic, Food Grade} 1'&0 BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
70 |Protec NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
71 |Ranco NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID
72 {Bheem ll_NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
73 |Robertshaw (TAC/Schneider Electric) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
74 |Siebe lINC BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
75 |Sporlan INQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
76  |Square-D NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
77 |Steveco ’:NO BID NO BID NO BID NOQ BID
78 |Supco NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
79 |Superior NG BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
80 |Tara [INO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
81 [Tecumseh NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
82 |Themno Care Mayer/Perma Pipe NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID
83 [Thermo Plastic (Non-Toxic, Food Grade) NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID
84 |TIF [FG BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
85 |Tower Tech NO BID NO BIE NC BID NO BID
86 |Trane 45% NO BID NO BID
87 |Virginia Dryers NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
88 |Wagner Diversitech (Plastic Tubing must be Non-Toxic NC BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
89 |Westinghouse (Siemens) NC BID NO BID 55%
90  [White Rodgers [Ino BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
91 |York international (Johnson Contrals) HNO BID NO BiD NO BID NO BID




Bid No. 16-014R

Bid Title: HVAC-R Parts and Supplies : Bid Opened: 6/16/15
Purchasing Agent: Greg Jackson
THE $SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA
BID TABULATION SHEET Trane US, Inc. World Electric Supply
] Bid Unit Bid Price Bid Unit Bid Price Bid Unrt Bid Price
Description Quantity | Unit Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension
g2 |ADDITIONAL MANUFACTURERS
A [Most Current Manufacturer's List Price, Catalog and Date NO BID NO BID Baldor #501 53%
B |Most Current Manufacturer's List Price, Catalog and Date [[NO BID NO BID Wegg #US10 49%
C [Most Current Manufacturer's List Price, Catalog and Date NO BID NG BID INO BID NG BID
D NQ BID “_NO BID NO BID IINno BID
E NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID -
F NO BID INO BID NQ BID “-NO BID
REMARKS:
BID DRAFT WAS APPROVED BY: Greg Jackson, Procurement & Warehousing Services
BIDS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED BY: Greg Jackson, Procurement & Warehousing Services
RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDER(S) MEETING SPECIFICATIONS TERMS AND CONDITIONS.




