The School Board of Broward County, Florida
Procurement & Warehousing Services

ITB No.: 16-029R Tentative Board Meeting Date*: ~ AUGUST 18, 2015

Description:  LAMPS, BALLASTS, BATTERY PACKS AND Notified: 762 Downloaded 37
RELATED ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES
TERM CONTRACT ITB Rec’d: 9 No Bids:

For: MATERIALS LOGISTICS AND PPO STOCKROOM ITB Opening: MAY 26, 2015

Fund: DEPARTMENTS’ OPERATING BUDGET Advertised Date: MAY 12, 2015

Award Amount:  $1.161,686.00 (PER CONTRACT AWARD)

POSTING OF ITB RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: ITB Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in Procurement &

Warehousing Services and www.Demandstar.com on JUNE 25, 2015 @ 3:00 p.m. , and will remain posted for 72 hours. Any person
who is adversely affected by the decision or intended decision shall file a notice of protest, in writing, within 72 hours after the posting of the notice of
decision or intended decision. The formal written protest shall be filed within ten (10) days after the date the notice of protest is filed. Failure to file a
notice of protest or failure to file a formal written protest shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under this chapter. Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes,
states that “The formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based.” Saturdays, Sundays, state holidays
and days during which the school district administration is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period provided. Filings shall
be at the office of the Director of Procurement & Warehousing Services, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351. Any
person who files an action protesting an intended decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a bond, payable
to The School Board of Broward County, Florida, (SBBC), in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of the estimated value of the contract. Failure to post
the bond required by SBBC Policy 3320, Part VIII, Purchasing Policies, Section N, within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of

the right to protest.

(*) The Cone of Silence, as stated in the ITB, is in effect until this bid is approved by SBBC. The School Board meeting date stated
above is a tentative date. Confirm with the Purchasing Agent of record for the actual date the Cone of Silence has concluded.

RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION
VENDOR’S NAME ITEM (S) AWARDED

*NORTHGATE LIMITED. INC. A
(M/WBE: WHITE FEMALE, SARASOTA, FL)

*INNOVATIVE SOFTWARE SOLUTION, INC. B.C.D,E
(M/WBE: AFRICAN-AMERICAN, MARGATE, FL)

*CERTIFIED M/WBE VENDORS

RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDERS MEETING SPECIFICIATIONS, TERMS AND CONDITIONS.

IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT FOR THE REASONS STATED ON THE ATTACHED BID REJECTION SHEET, THE BID AS STATED, EITHER
IN ITS ENTIRETY OR FOR THE PARTICULAR ITEM LISTED, BE REJECTED FOR NOT COMPLYING WITH THE BID REQUIREMENTS.

CONTRACT PERIOD: AUGUST 19, 2015 THROUGH AUGUST 18, 2018.

By: /ﬁ/“i{}?ﬁ;} /2 ‘ ,}3 {M"E = Date: 06/25/2015

(Purtfiasing Agent)
The School Board of Broward County. Florida. prohibits any policy or procedure which results in discrimination on the basis of age. color. disability. gender expression.
national origin. marital status. race. religion. sex or sexual orientation. Individuals who wish to file a discrimination complaint. may call the Executive Director, Benefits & EEO
Compliance at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) may call the Equal Educational Opportunities
(EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

REVISED: 2/13/14



Bid No. 16-029R
Buyer/Purchasing Agent: Greg Jackson

Bid Title: Lamps, Ballasts, Battery Packs and Related Electrical Supplies

Bid Opened:5/28/2015

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA
Florida Clear Energy, LLC, HD Supply Power Solutions, Innovative Software Solution, Mayer Electric Supply
BID TABULATION SHEET Pembroke Pines, FL Pompano Beach, FL Inc., Coral Springs, FL Company, Inc., Tampa, FL
Bid Unit Bid Price Bid Price Bid Unit El'g'P'Fﬁ:e_ | Bid Unit Bid Price
Description Quantity [ Unit Price Extension Bid Unit Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension
A |LAMPS
1 Lamp Fluorescent FO28/841XP/SS/ECO Sylvania 22179 | 172,260 ea $3.40 | $585,684.00 || $ 2365 (3% 407,394.90 210 $ 361,746.001 $ 1.79 | $ 308,345.40
2 |Lamp Fluorescent F25T12/CW/RS/SS Sylvania 23472 150 ea $3.50 $525.00 || $ 2431% 364.50 120 $ 180.00 | $ 295§ 442.50
3 |Lamp High-Pressure Sodium LU70/MED Sylvania 67504 840 ea $8.75 $7,350.00 || $ 9.865 | $ 8,286.60 5.06|$ 4,250.40 || $ 7.08 % 5,947.20
4 Lamp High-Pressure Sodium LU/50/MEDSylvania 67502 200 ea $8.50 $1,700.00 || $ 11.825 | $ 2,365.00 506 | % 1,012.00 || $ 8.11 | ¢ 1,622.00
5 |Lamp High-Pressure Sodium LU400/ECO Sylvania 67533 | 1,600 ea $10.25 $16,400.00 )| $ 10473 1 $ 16,756.80 5.06 | $ 8,096.00 || $ 62213 9,952.00
6 |Lamp High-Pressure Sodium LU1000 Sylvania 67307 510 ea $26.79 | $13,662.90 | $ 33.784 | $ 17,229.84 21401 $ 10,914.00 | $ 2511 1% 12,806.10
7 |Lamp Compact Fluorescent CF5DS/841 Sylvania 21278 600 ea 1.60 $960.00 |[ $ 1892 1% 1,135.20 1.02]$ 612.00 || $ 1161 $ 696.00
8 |Lamp Compact Fluorescent CF7DS/841 Sylvania 21274 600 ea 51.60 $960.00 | $ 1892 | $ 1,135.20 1.02]$ 612.00 || $ 12118 726.00
9 |Lamp Compact Fluorescent CF9DS/841 Sylvania 21270 1,300 ea $1.60 $2,080.00 || $ 1892 | % 2,459.60 1.021$ 1,326.00 || $ 124 1% 1,612.00
10 |Lamp Compact Fluorescent CF13DS/841 Sylvania 21134 3,150 ea $1.60 $5,040.00 || $ 15518 4,882.50 1.02 1% 3,213.00 || $ 12418 3,906.00
11 |REMOVED FROM BID 2,352 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 |Lamp Projector STTV ENX-87.5 Sylvania 54916 912 ea $8.50 $7,752.00 NO BID NO BID 573 1% 522576 | $ 6.05% 5,517.60
13 |Lamp Projector STTV _BHC/DYV-5 Sylvania 54835 96 ea $6.45 $619.20 NO BID NO BID 670 | $ 643.20 | $ 12.00 | $ 1,152.00
14 [Lamp Projector STTV EYB-87.5 Sylvania 54455 120 ea 57.05 $846.00 || $ 1014 | $ 1,216.80 4971 9% 596.40 || $ 9.001 9% 1,080.00
15 |Lamp Metal Halide M1000/U Sylvania 64468 1,140 ea $18.62 | $21,226.80( $ 33.784 | $ 38,513.76 1895|¢% 21,603.00| $ 20.00 [ $ 22,800.00
Total ltem A (1 - 15 inclusive) $664,805.90 || INCOMPLETE | INCOMPLETE $420,029.76 $376,604.80
B |BALLASTS
1 Ballast Electronic 1 or 2FT8 type instant start 120/277V 12,900 ea $10.79 | $139,191.00 | $ 9.771% 126,033.00 || $ 695|% 8965500/ % 737 1% 95,073.00
2 |Ballast Electronic 3 or 4FT8 type instant start 120/277V 6,500 ea $13.89 | $90,285.00 || $ 15271 1% 99,261.50 || $ 895|% 58,175.00 9.48 61,620.00
3 |Ballast Electronic 2F40T12 120/277V Advance 2,720 ea $314.65 | $39,848.00 || $ 14.946 | $ 40,653.12 || $ 9.95|% 27,064.00( % 9.50 25,840.00
Total ltem B (1 - 3 inclusive) $269,324.00 $  265,947.62 $ 174,894.00 $ 182,533.00
C |BATTERY
1 Battery Sealed Lead Acid 12V 7.0Ah 84Whr 6-cell F1 9,275 ea $17.50 | $162,312.50 || $ 1758 | $ 163,054.50 || $ 9.95|% 92286.25( $ 15751 % 146,081.25
2  |Battery Rechargeable Sealed Lead Acid 18V 18.0Ah 216 1,850 ea $47.99 | $88,781.50 |f $ 4753 | $ 87,930.50 || $ 25.451% 47,082.50 | $ 44000 | $ 81,400.00
Total ltem C ( 1 - 2 inclusive) $251,094.00 $  250,985.00 $ 139,368.75 $ 227,481.25
D |ELECTRICAL
1 Electrical Box 4" square 1-1/2" deep 1/2" and 3/4" Kos 1,800 ea NO BID NO BID ) 048 1% 864.00 0401 9% 720.00 NO BID NO BID
2 Electrical Box $" square 2-1/8" deep 1/2" and TKOs 2,400 ea NO BID NO BID 5 0741 % 1,776.00 || § 0.59 1,416.00 NO BID NO BID
3 Knockout Seal 1/2" Raco 1042 or Bridgeport 1691 900 ea NO BID NO BID ) 01419 126.00 | $ 0101 9% 90.00 NO BID NO BID
4 |EMT Conduit 1/2" x 10' length (priced per length) 4,000 ea NO BID NO BID b 23119% 9,240.00 || $ 176 | $ 7,040.00 NO BID NO BID
5 |EMT Conduit 3/4" x 10' length (priced per length) 1,375 ea NO BID NO BID b 3.83 5,266.25 1 $ 374 (% 5,142.50 NO BID NO BID
6 |EMT Conduit Strap 1/2" Bridgeport 920-S 4,000 ea NO BID NO BID b 0.04 % 160.00 || $ 0.033 132.00 NO BID NO BID
7 __|EMT Conduit Strap 3/4" Bridgeport 921-S 2,000 ea NO BID NO BID b 0.06 | $ 120.00 | $ 0.052 | $ 104.00 NO BID NO BID
8 |EMT Conduit Hanger w/bolt rigid/IMC 1/2" 850 ea NO BID NO BID b 0151 % 12750 | $ 01321 $% 112.20 NO BID NO BID
9 |EMT Set Screw Connector steel uninsulated throat 1/2" 4,000 ea NO BID NO BID b 0.131$ 520.00 |1 $ 0.091% 360.00 NO BID NO BID
10 |EMT Set Screw Connector steel uninsulated throat 3/4" 400 ea NO BID NO BID $ 0221% 88.00 || $ 01518 60.00 NO BID NO BID
11 |EMT Set Screw Coupling steel 1/2" 3,100 ea NO BID NO BID 3 0.13|$% 403.00 (1 $ 0114 $ 353.40 NO BID NO BID
12 |EMT Set Screw Coupling steel 3/4" 1,200 ea NO BID NO BID $ 0191 8% 228.0011 $ 016 | $ 192.00 NO BID NO BID
13 |Connector Flex Conduit/Liquid-Tight malleable Iron tite 2,400 ea NO BID NO BID b 077 | $ 1,848.00 || $ 08419 2,016.00 NO BID NO BID
14 |Connextor Flex Conduit/Liquid-Tight malleable iron 90 800 ea NO BID NO BID 3 099|$% 792001 $ 1471 $ 1,176.00 NO BID NO BID
15 |1-Hole Strap rigid 1/2" Bridgeport 901-S 2,500 ea NO BID NO BID $ 0.06 | $ 150.00 0.06 | $ 150.00 NO BID NO BID
16 |1-Hole Strap rigid 3/4" Bridgeport 902-S 600 ea NO BID NO BID $ 012 (% 72.00 [ $ 010 % 60.00 NO BID NO BID
17 |Plaster/Mud Ring 4" square center blanked 5/8" raised 900 ea NO BID NO BID b 037]% 333.00 039(% 351.00 NO BID NO BID
18 |Cover Flat 4" Square Steel Box 1/2" KO in center 1,900 ea NO BID NO BID b 0281 % 532.00 || $ 022]% 418.00 NO BID NO BID
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Bid No. 16-029R Bid Title: Lamps, Ballasts, Battery Packs and Related Electrical Supplies Bid Opened:5/28/2015
Buyer/Purchasing Agent: Greg Jackson

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA
Northgate Limited, Inc., Ti Electric USA, Inc., West
BID TABULATION SHEET Discount Light Depot d/b/a MCOR Lighting, Laguna Hills, CA Sarasota, FL Palm Beach, FL
Bid Unit gld Price 5% Pref. Pref. Price Bid Unit Bid Price Bid Unit Bid Price
Description Quantity | Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension

A LAMPS
1 Lamp Fluorescent FO28/841XP/SS/ECO Sylvania 22179 | 172,260 ea [|$ 204[|$ 35141040 % 2142 |$ 368,980.92| % 1.70 | $ 292,842.00 || $ 1.94 | $ 334,184.40
2 |Lamp Fluorescent F25T12/CW/RS/SS Sylvania 23472 150 ea [I$ 204 1% 306.00 | $ 2142 1% 321301 $ 2801 9% 420.00 | $ 1.30 | ¢ 195.00
3 Lamp High-Pressure Sodium LU70/MED Sylvania 67504 840 ea $ 487 | $ 4,090.80 | $ 51141 % 429534 || $ 6.73|$ 565320 % 442 1% 3,712.80
4 Lamp High-Pressure Sodium LU/50/MEDSylvania 67502 200 ea b 487 1% 97400 | $ 5114 (% 1,022.70 | $ 7711% 154200 % 4.42 ] ¢ 884.00
5 Lamp High-Pressure Sodium LU400/ECO Sylvania 67533 1,600 ea ) 487 1% 7,792.00 | $ 51141 % 8,181.60 (| $ 591 1% 9,456.00 3% 5.27 8,432.00
6 Lamp High-Pressure Sodium LU1000 Sylvania 67307 510 ea b 2057 | $ 10,490.70 | $ 21.599 | $ 11,015.24 2385 % 12,163.50( $ 2199 $ 11,214.90
7 Lamp Compact Fluorescent CF5DS/841 Sylvania 21278 600 ea b 1.01 18 606.00 | $ 1.061 19 636.30 1101 $ 660.00 || $ 1.08 (% 648.00
8 |Lamp Compact Fluorescent CF7DS/841 Sylvania 21274 600 ea ) 101 (3 606.00 | $ 1.061 1% 636.30 || $ 1151 % 690.00 || $ 1.08 1% 648.00
9 |Lamp Compact Fluorescent CF9DS/841 Sylvania 21270 1,300 ea ) 101 (8 1,313.00 | $ 1.061 1% 1,378.65 || $ 1.18 1%  1,534.00] % 1.08 1 $  1,404.00
10 [Lamp Compact Fluorescent CF13DS/841 Sylvania 21134 3,150 ea $ 10118 3,18150 | $ 1.061($ 3,340.58 || $ 11818 3,717.00| $ 1.08[$ 3,402.00
11 |REMOVED FROM BID 2,352 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 |Lamp Projector STTV_ENX-87.5 Sylvania 54916 912 ea |I$ 5251% 4,788.00 | $ 551318 5027401 $ 1278 $ 11,65536 [ $ 651 1% 5937.12
13 [Lamp Projector STTV BHC/DYV-5 Sylvania 54835 96 ea [I$ 6.00 | 4 576.00 | $ 6.300 | $ 604.80 || $ 1150 | $  1,104.00 ) $ 6751 9% 648.00
14 |[Lamp Projector STTV EYB-87.5 Sylvania 54455 120 ea b 5.00($% 600.00 | $ 5250 1% 630.00 | $ 1290 | $ 1,548.00) % 5001]% 600.00
15 |Lamp Metal Halide. M1000/U Sylvania 64468 1,140 ea $ 18.22 | $ 20,77080 | $ 19.131 21,809.34 || $ 19.00 | $ 21,660.00 || $ 18.10 | $ 20,634.00

Total Item A (1 - 15 inclusive) $ 407,505.20 $ 427,880.46 $ 364,645.06 $ 392,544.22
B |BALLASTS
1 Ballast Electronic 1 or 2FT8 type instant start 120/277V 12,900 ea 78019 100,620.00 8190 | $ 105,651.00 )| $ 750 1% 96,750.00 || $ 7.00 | $ 90,300.00
2 Ballast Electronic 3 or 4FT8 type instant start 120/277V 6,500 ea b 9.00$ 58,500.00 9.450 | $ 61,425.00 | $ 9.00 | $ 58,500.00 || $ 9.06 [ $ 58,890.00
3 Ballast Electronic 2F40T12 120/277V Advance 2,720 ea b 960 | % 26,112.00 | $ 10.080 | $ 2741760 )1 $ 1020 | $ 27,744.00 || $ 884 [ $ 24,044.80

Total Item B (1 - 3 inclusive) $ 185,232.00 $  194,493.60 $ 182,994.00 $ 173,234.80
C |BATTERY
1 Battery Sealed Lead Acid 12V 7.0Ah 84Whr 6-cell F1 9,275 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 10.56 | $ 97,944.00
2 |Battery Rechargeable Sealed Lead Acid 18V 18.0Ah 216 1,850 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 26.10 | $ 48,285.00

Total Item C (1 - 2 inclusive) $ 146,229.00
D |ELECTRICAL
1 Electrical Box 4" square 1-1/2" deep 1/2" and 3/4" Kos 1,800 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID b 046 | $ 828.00
2 |Electrical Box $" square 2-1/8" deep 1/2" and TKOs 2,400 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID b 076 | $ 1,824.00
3 [Knockout Seal 1/2" Raco 1042 or Bridgeport 1691 900 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 0.13 117.00
4 |EMT Conduit 1/2" x 10' length (priced per length) 4,000 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ) 214 1% 8560.00
5 |EMT Conduit 3/4" x 10' length (priced per length) 1,375 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID b 371 (% 5,101.25
6 |EMT Conduit Strap 1/2" Bridgeport 920-S 4,000 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ) 004 1% 160.00
7 |EMT Conduit Strap 3/4" Bridgeport 921-S 2,000 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ) 0.06 | $ 120.00
8 EMT Conduit Hanger w/bolt rigid/IMC 1/2" 850 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 0.141% 119.00
9 EMT Set Screw Connector steel uninsulated throat 1/2" 4,000 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 011 1% 440.00
10 |EMT Set Screw Connector steel uninsulated throat 3/4" 400 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ) 017 [ $ 68.00
11 |EMT Set Screw Coupling steel 1/2" 3,100 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID b 0.1418% 434.00
12 |EMT Set Screw Coupling steel 3/4" 1,200 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ) 02118 252.00
13 [Connector Flex Conduit/Liquid-Tight malleable Iron tite 2,400 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 0.99 2,376.00
14 [Connextor Flex Conduit/Liquid-Tight malleable iron 90 800 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID b 1.01 1% 808.00
15 |1-Hole Strap rigid 1/2" Bridgeport 901-S 2,500 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 0061$% 150.00
16 |1-Hole Strap rigid 3/4" Bridgeport 902-S 600 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 01118% 66.00
17 [Plaster/Mud Ring 4" square center blanked 5/8" raised 900 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 035 % 315.00
18 [Cover Flat 4" Square Steel Box 1/2" KO in center 1,900 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 0251 8% 475.00
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Bid No. 16-029R

Bid Title: Lamps, Ballasts, Battery Packs and Related Electrical Supplies

Buyer/Purchasing Agent: Greg Jackson

Bid Opened:5/28/2015

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA Vehicle Maintenance
Program, Inc., Boca Raton, World Electric Supply,
BID TABULAT'ON SHEET FL Pompano Beach, FL
Bid Unit Bid Price Bid Unit Bid Price
Description Quantity | Unit Price Extension Price Extension

A |LAMPS
1 Lamp Fluorescent FO28/841XP/SS/ECO Sylvania 22179 | 172,260 ea [$ 1.88 | $ 323,848.80 || $ 1.85| % 318,681.00
2 Lamp Fluorescent F25T12/CW/RS/SS Sylvania 23472 150 ea |I$ 628 | $ 942.00 $ 16419% 246.00
3 Lamp High-Pressure Sodium LU70/MED Sylvania 67504 840 ea [I'$ 4.85 ] ¢ 4,074.00 || $ 6.50 | $ 5,460.00
4 Lamp High-Pressure Sodium LU/50/MEDSylvania 67502 200 ea b 594 1% 1,188.00 | $ 650 9% 1,300.00
5 |Lamp High-Pressure Sodium LU400/ECO Sylvania 67533 | 1,600 ea |I$ 7141]1$ 11,376.00}| $ 6.90 | $ 11,040.00
6 Lamp High-Pressure Sodium LU1000 Sylvania 67307 510 ea || $ 21211$ 10,817.10| & 2050 | $ 10,455.00
7 |Lamp Compact Fluorescent CF5DS/841 Sylvania 21278 600 ea |I$ 1.0719% 642.00 || § 12518% 750.00
8 Lamp Compact Fluorescent CF7DS/841 Sylvania 21274 600 ea |I$ 1.07($ 642.00 | $ 1251 % 750.00
9 Lamp Compact Fluorescent CF9DS/841 Sylvania 21270 1,300 ea ) 10419 1,352.00 || $ 12519 1,625.00
10 |Lamp Compact Fluorescent CF13DS/841 Sylvania 21134 3,150 ea $ 1111 $ 3,496.50 || $ 095 % 2,992.50
11 |REMOVED FROM BID 2,352 ea NO BID NO BID
12 |Lamp Projector STTV ENX-87.5 Sylvania 54916 912 ea b 53519 4,879.20 |l § 6.00 | $ 5,472.00
13 |Lamp Projector STTV _BHC/DYV-5 Sylvania 54835 96 ea |I$ 4751% 456.00 || $ 62518 600.00
14 |Lamp Projector STTV EYB-87.5 Sylvania 54455 120 ea b 4991 % 598.80 || $ 7.001$% 840.00
15 |Lamp Metal Halide M1000/U Sylvania 64468 1,140 ea b 1878 | $ 21,409.20 || $ 16.00 | $ 18,240.00

Total Item A (1 - 15 inclusive) $ 385,721.60 $ 378,451.50
B |BALLASTS
1 Ballast Electronic 1 or 2FT8 type instant start 120/277V 12,900 ea || NOBID NO BID $ 7201 $ 92,880.00
2 Ballast Electronic 3 or 4FT8 type instant start 120/277V 6,500 ea NO BID NO BID b 8.15]$% 52,975.00
3 Ballast Electronic 2F40T12 120/277V Advance 2,720 ea NO BID NO BID $ 9.751% 26,520.00

Total Item B (1 - 3 inclusive) $ 172,375.00
C |BATTERY
1 Battery Sealed Lead Acid 12V 7.0Ah 84Whr 6-cell F1 9,275 ea NO BID NO BID $ 1150 | $ 106,662.50
2 Battery Rechargeable Sealed Lead Acid 18V 18.0Ah 216 1,850 ea NO BID NO BID $ 32.00 | $ 59,200.00

Total Item C ( 1 - 2 inclusive) $ 165,862.50
D |ELECTRICAL
1 Electrical Box 4" square 1-1/2" deep 1/2" and 3/4" Kos 1,800 ea NO BID NO BID $ 088 9% 1,584.00
2 Electrical Box $" square 2-1/8" deep 1/2" and TKOs 2,400 ea NO BID NO BID $ 1.04(9% 2,496.00
3 Knockout Seal 1/2" Raco 1042 or Bridgeport 1691 900 ea NO BID NO BID b 02219% 198.00
4 EMT Conduit 1/2" x 10" length (priced per length) 4,000 ea NO BID NO BID b 2181 9% 8,720.00
5 |EMT Conduit 3/4" x 10' length (priced per length) 1,375 ea NO BID NO BID b 377 1% 5,183.75
6 |EMT Conduit Strap 1/2" Bridgeport 920-S 4,000 ea NO BID NO BID $ 0.05 200.00
7 EMT Conduit Strap 3/4" Bridgeport 921-S 2,000 ea NO BID NO BID 3 0.08 160.00
8 EMT Conduit Hanger w/bolt rigid/IMC 1/2" 850 ea NO BID NO BID $ 0.25 212.50
9 |EMT Set Screw Connector steel uninsulated throat 1/2" 4,000 ea NO BID NO BID $ 011 19% 440.00
10 |EMT Set Screw Connector steel uninsulated throat 3/4" 400 ea NO BID NO BID 3 0.20 | ¢ 80.00
11 |EMT Set Screw Coupling steel 1/2" 3,100 ea NO BID NO BID 3 0.12 | § 372.00
12 |EMT Set Screw Coupling steel 3/4" 1,200 ea NO BID NO BID g 0201$ 240.00
13 |Connector Flex Conduit/Liquid-Tight malleable Iron tite 2,400 ea NO BID NO BID b 180 $ 4,320.00
14 [Connextor Flex Conduit/Liquid-Tight malleable iron 90 800 ea NO BID NO BID $ 1741 $ 1,392.00
15 |1-Hole Strap rigid 1/2" Bridgeport 901-S 2,500 ea NO BID NO BID $ 0.06 | $ 150.00
16 | 1-Hole Strap rigid 3/4" Bridgeport 902-S 600 ea NO BID NO BID $ 0.10 | { 60.00
17 |Plaster/Mud Ring 4" square center blanked 5/8" raised 900 ea NO BID NO BID $ 077 1% 693.00
18 |Cover Flat 4" Square Steel Box 1/2" KO in center 1,900 ea NO BID NO BID $ 062]% 1,178.00
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Bid No. 16-029R Bid Title: Lamps, Ballasts, Battery Packs and Related Electrical Supplies Bid Opened:5/28/2015
Buyer/Purchasing Agent: Greg Jackson

A THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA
i Y Florida Clear Energy, LLC, HD Supply Power Solutions, Innovative Software Solution, Mayer Electric Supply
L7 ﬁ BID TABULATION SHEET Pembroke Pines, FL Pompano Beach, FL Inc., Coral Springs, FL Company, Inc., Tampa, FL
Bid Unit Bid Price Bid Price Bid Unit Bid Price Bid Unit Bid Price
Item Description Quantity | Unit Price Extension Bid Unit Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension
19 |Compression Coupling steel rigid/IMC 1/2" 1,200 ea NO BID NO BID $ 0.15 180.00 || $ 1.86 2,232.00 NO BID NO BID
20 |Lampholder Fluorescent low-profile slide on Medium bi-pin| 2,200 ea NO BID NO BID $ 13318 2,926.00 || $ 087 1% 1,914.00 NO BID NO BID
21 |Lampholder Fluorescent tall profile slide-on Medium bi-pin | 1,520 ea NO BID NO BID ) 13418 2,036.80 || $ 08719% 1,322.40 NO BID NO BID
22 |Electrical Tape vinyl black 3/4" x 66'/roll 3M Scotch 33+ 2,000 ea NO BID NO BID b 4238 1% 8,476.00 | $ 33019 6,600.00 NO BID NO BID
23 |Fuseholder inline 2-lead 12A 300VAC Bussmann HLR-2A | 2,700 ea NO BID NO BID $ 16518 4,455.00 || $ 0.79 | ¢ 2,133.00 NO BID NO BID
24  |Fuseholder inline non-breakaway midget 30A 600V 900 ea NO BID NO BID b 728 1% 6,5652.00 || $ 5421 % 4,878.00 NO BID NO BID
25 |Fuse inline 1-piece fast-acting 3A 300V Littelfuse LGR-3 10,000 ea NO BID NO BID ) 052|% 5,200.00 || $ 080 (% 8,000.00 NO BID NO BID
26 |Fuse Fluorescent 2A 300VAC Bussmann GLR-2 900 ea NO BID NO BID 0521% 468.00 || $ 080]% 720.00 NO BID NO BID
27 _|Duplex Receptacle commercial grade ivory 2-pole 3-wire 1,300 ea NO BID NO BID b 1151 % 1,495.00 || $ 076 1% 988.00 NO BID NO BID
28 |GFCI Receptacle commercial grade ivory 2-pole 3-wire 1,100 ea NO BID NO BID 878 [ $ 9,658.00 720 % 7,920.00 NO BID NO BID
29 [Reducing Washer 3/4 X 1/2" for rigig/IMC Bridgeport 1061 1,000 ea NO BID NO BID b 0.04 (% 40001 $ 0.054 (% 54.00 NO BID NO BID
30 [Cable Ties 11-1/2" (292mm) black 50Ib tensile length 1,350 ea NO BID NO BID b 30.26 | $ 40,851.00 4951 % 6,682.50 NO BID NO BID
31 |Twirl Nuts 1/4" B-line TN 224 1,000 ea NO BID NO BID b 1.7565 | $ 1,756.50 || $ 12318 1,230.00 NO BID NO BID
32 |Prismatic Lens acrylic clear 125" thickness nominal 2 x 4 800 ea NO BID NO BID $ 13.438 | $ 10,750.40 ) $ 247 1% 1,976.00 NO BID NO BID
33 |Wire Nuts orange 600V Ideal 30-073 1,400 ea NO BID NO BID $ 6.4213 8,989.82 1| $ 5351 % 7,490.00 NO BID NO BID
34 [Cover Nylon Ivory 1-toggle 1-gang standard size 1,000 ea NO BID NO BID $ 21.62 21,620.001 $ 016 | $ 160.00 NO BID NO BID
35 |Cover Nylon Ivory 1-duplex receptacle 1-gang standard 2,200 ea NO BID NO BID $ 21.62 47,564.00 || $ 016 | $ 352.00 NO BID NO BID
Total Item D (1 - 35 inclusive) $  195,664.27 $ 74,545.00
E |EMERGENCY LIGHTS
1 Emergency Lighting Unit krypton 2-lamp type 9W 120/277 | 2,770 ea $79.49 | $220,187.30 | $ 78717 1% 218,046.09| $ 19.48 | $ 53,959.60 || $ 64.70 | $ 179,219.00
2 |Exit Sign w/Battery Back-Up LED Lamp Type 0.71W 2,000 ea $49.99 | $99,980.00 || $ 41892 | $ 83,784.00 || $ 1948 | $  38,960.00 || $ 37.30 | $ 74,600.00
3 |Combo Light/Exit Sign w/Battery Back-Up LED/krypton 400 ea $97.89 $39,156.00 || $ 952711 % 38,108.40 || $ 36.35|$% 14,540.00 || $ 75.45 30,180.00
Total ltem E (1 - 3 inclusive) $359,323.30 $ 339,938.49 $ 107,459.60 $ 283,999.00
REMARKS:

BID DRAFT WAS APPROVED BY: Greg Jackson, Procurement & Warehousing Services;

BIDS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED BY: Greg Jackson, Procurement & Warehousing Services;
RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDER(S)

MEETING SPECIFICATIONS TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
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Bid No. 16-029R
Buyer/Purchasing Agent: Greg Jackson

Bid Title: Lamps, Ballasts, Battery Packs and Related Electrical Supplies

Bid Opened:5/28/2015

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA
Northgate Limited, Inc., Ti Electric USA, Inc., West
BID TABULATION SHEET Discount Light Depot d/b/a MCOR Lighting, Laguna Hills, CA Sarasota, FL Palm Beach, FL
Bid Unit id Price 5% Pref. Pref. Price Bid Unit Bid Price Bid Unit Bid Price
Description Quantity | Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Price Extension Price Extension
19 |Compression Coupling steel rigid/IMC 1/2" 1,200 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2.881% 3,456.00
20 {Lampholder Fluorescent low-profile slide on Medium bi-pin| 2,200 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 064 |$ 1,408.00
21 |Lampholder Fluorescent tall profile slide-on Medium bi-pin | 1,520 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 0.68 | { 1,033.60
22 |Electrical Tape vinyl black 3/4" x 66'/roll 3M Scotch 33+ 2,000 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3 331 |$% 6,620.00
23 |Fuseholder inline 2-lead 12A 300VAC Bussmann HLR-2A 2,700 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2321$% 6,264.00
24 |Fuseholder inline non-breakaway midget 30A 600V 900 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 880 |% 7,920.00
25 [Fuse inline 1-piece fast-acting 3A 300V Littelfuse LGR-3 10,000 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID b 0.88 | $ 8,800.00
26 |Fuse Fluorescent 2A 300VAC Bussmann GLR-2 900 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 0881% 792.00
27 |Duplex Receptacle commercial grade ivory 2-pole 3-wire 1,300 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 215]1% 2,795.00
28 |GFCI Receptacle commercial grade ivory 2-pole 3-wire 1,100 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 11.211$ 12,331.00
29 |Reducing Washer 3/4 X 1/2" for rigig/IMC Bridgeport 1061 | 1,000 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 00418 40.00
30 |Cable Ties 11-1/2" (292mm) black 50Ib tensile length 1,350 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 13.33 | $ 17,995.50
31 [Twirl Nuts 1/4" B-line TN 224 1,000 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 068 1% 680.00
32 |Prismatic Lens acrylic clear 125" thickness nominal 2 x 4 800 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID g 11.95]%  9,560.00
33 |Wire Nuts orange 600V Ildeal 30-073 1,400 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 782 1% 10,948.00
34 |Cover Nylon Ivory 1-toggle 1-gang standard size 1,000 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 042 1% 420.00
35 |Cover Nylon Ivory 1-duplex receptacle 1-gang standard 2,200 ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 0421 9% 924.00
Total Item D (1 - 35 inclusive) $ 114,200.35
E |EMERGENCY LIGHTS
1 Emergency Lighting Unit krypton 2-lamp type 9W 120/277 | 2,770 ea 2550 | $ 70,635.00 {$ 267751 $ 74,166.75 59.69 | $ 165,341.30 || NO BID NO BID
2  |Exit Sign w/Battery Back-Up LED Lamp Type 0.71W 2,000 ea II'$ 1875 % 37,500.00 | { 19.688 | $ 39,375.00 33.64 | $ 67,280.00 || NO BID NO BID
3 |Combo Light/Exit Sign w/Battery Back-Up LED/krypton 400 ea [$ 40.00 | $ 16,000.00 [ $ 42.000 | $ 16,800.00 73.21 | $ 29,284.00 || NO BID NO BID
Total ltem E (1 - 3iinclusive) $  124,135.00 $ 130,341.75 $ 261,905.30
REMARKS:

BID DRAFT WAS APPROVED BY: Greg Jackson, Procurement & Warehousing Services;

BIDS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED BY: Greg Jackson, Procurement & Warehousing Services;
RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDER(S)

MEETING SPECIFICATIONS TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
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Bid No. 16-029R

Bid Title: Lamps, Ballasts, Battery Packs and Related Electrical Supplies

Buyer/Purchasing Agent: Greg Jackson

Bid Opened:5/28/2015

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA Vehicle Maintenance
Program, Inc., Boca Raton, World Electric Supply,
BID TABULATION SHEET FL Pompano Beach, FL
Bid Unit Bid Price Bid Unit Bid Price
Description Quantity | Unit Price Extension Price Extension
19 |Compression Coupling steel rigid/IMC 1/2" 1,200 ea NO BID NO BID $ 410 | ¢ 4,920.00
20 {Lampholder Fluorescent low-profile slide on Medium bi-pin| 2,200 ea NO BID NO BID $ 1501 % 3,300.00
21 |Lampholder Fluorescent tall profile slide-on Medium bi-pin | 1,520 ea NO BID NO BID 3 1501 % 2,280.00
22 |Electrical Tape vinyl black 3/4" x 66'/roll 3M Scotch 33+ 2,000 ea NO BID NO BID $ 37518 7,500.00
23 |Fuseholder inline 2-lead 12A 300VAC Bussmann HLR-2A 2,700 ea NO BID NO BID b 1701 $ 4,590.00
24 |Fuseholder inline non-breakaway midget 30A 600V 900 ea NO BID NO BID 10.00 | $ 9,000.00
25 [Fuse inline 1-piece fast-acting 3A 300V Littelfuse LGR-3 10,000 ea NO BID NO BID b 0831% 8,300.00
26 |Fuse Fluorescent 2A 300VAC Bussmann GLR-2 900 ea NO BID NO BID b 0.83 | § 747.00
27 |Duplex Receptacle commercial grade ivory 2-pole 3-wire 1,300 ea NO BID NO BID $ 0.86 | § 1,118.00
28 |GFCI Receptacle commercial grade ivory 2-pole 3-wire 1,100 ea NO BID NO BID $ 7.40 | § 8,140.00
29 |Reducing Washer 3/4 X 1/2" for rigig/IMC Bridgeport 1061 | 1,000 ea NO BID NO BID b 0.02 | § 20.00
30 |Cable Ties 11-1/2" (292mm) black 50Ib tensile length 1,350 ea NO BID NO BID $ 400 | % 5,400.00
31 | Twirl Nuts 1/4" B-line TN 224 1,000 ea NO BID NO BID $ 0.36 | § 360.00
32 |Prismatic Lens acrylic clear 125" thickness nominal 2 x 4 800 ea NO BID NO BID b 10.00 | ¢ 8,000.00
33 [Wire Nuts orange 600V Ideal 30-073 1,400 ea NO BID NO BID b 4.001$ 5,600.00
34 |Cover Nylon Ivory 1-toggle 1-gang standard size 1,000 ea NO BID NO BID $ 017 1% 170.00
35 |Cover Nylon Ivory 1-duplex receptacle 1-gang standard 2,200 ea NO BID NO BID b 034 1% 748.00
Total Item D (1 - 35 inclusive) $ 9787225
E [EMERGENCY LIGHTS
1 Emergency Lighting Unit krypton 2-lamp type W 120/277 | 2,770 ea NO BID NO BID b 63.00 | $ 174,510.00
2 Exit Sign w/Battery Back-Up LED Lamp Type 0.71W 2,000 ea NO BID NO BID 3 3350 ($ 67,000.00
3 |Combo Light/Exit Sign w/Battery Back-Up LED/krypton 400 ea || NO BID NO BID b 76.00 | $ 30,400.00
Total Item E (1 - 3 inclusive) $ 271,910.00

REMARKS:

BID DRAFT WAS APPROVED BY: Greg Jackson, Procurement & Warehousing Services;

BIDS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED BY: Greg Jackson, Procurement & Warehousing Services;

RECOMMEND THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE ABOVE LOW BIDDER(S)

MEETING SPECIFICATIONS TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
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