## The School Board of Broward County, Florida Procurement & Warehousing Services

ITB No.:	16-012N	Tentative Board N		LY 28, 2015	
Description:	ART EQUIPMENT	Notified:	237	Downloaded:	20
	TERM CONTRACT	ITB Rec'd:	2	No Bids:	0
For:	VARIOUS LOCATIONS	ITB Opening:	APRIL 28, 2015		
Fund:	(School/Department) VARIOUS FUNDS	Advertised Date:	APRIL 13, 2015		
		Award Amount:	\$900,000		
decision or internotice of protest states that "The and days during be at the office person who files to The School B the bond require the right to prote	y affected by the decision or intended decision shall file a reded decision. The formal written protest shall be filed with or failure to file a formal written protest shall constitute a way formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts which the school district administration is closed shall be expected of the Director of Procurement & Warehousing Services, an action protesting an intended decision shall post with the oard of Broward County, Florida, (SBBC), in an amount expected by SBBC Policy 3320, Part VIII, Purchasing Policies, Seest.  of Silence, as stated in the ITB, is in effect until this lative date. Confirm with the Purchasing Agent of re	thin ten (10) days after the aiver of proceedings under and law upon which the pexcluded in the computation 7720 West Oakland Park Be School Board, at the time qual to one percent (1%) of action N, within the time allowing bid is approved by SBB bid is approved by SBB.	date the notice of prothis chapter. Section 1 rotest is based." Saturn of the 72-hour time; Boulevard, Suite 323, of filing the formal with the estimated value of lowed for filing a bon C. The School Boa	otest is filed. Failure 20.57(3)(b), Florida days, Sundays, state period provided. Fil Sunrise, Florida 33 ritten protest, a bond of the contract. Failu d shall constitute a	e to file a a Statutes, c holidays ings shall 351. Any I, payable re to post waiver of
	RECOMMENDAT	ΓΙΟΝ/TABULATIO	ON		
VEND	OR'S NAME	ITEM(S) AWARDED			
Commo	ercial Art Supply	2, 5, 10(A-B), 11,			
DGS E	ducational Products	1, 3, 6, 9(A-B)			
AND PROCEDUITEM 7, 8: NO PURCHASING IT IS RECOMM IN THEIR ENTI	OS WERE RECEIVED. THESE ITEMS WILL BE PURCH JRES.  ACCEPTABLE BIDS WERE RECEIVED. THESE IT POLICIES AND PROCEDURES.  EDNED THAT, FOR THE REASON(S) STATED ON TH RETY, ARE FOR THE PARTICULAR ITEMS LISTED E MENDED THAT THE AWARD BE MADE TO THE RIOD: SEPTEMBER 1, 2015 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2	TEMS WILL BE PURCH E ATTACHED BID REJE BE REJECTED FOR NOT ABOVE LOW BIDDER	HASED IN ACCORE ECTION SHEET, THE COMPLYING WITH	DANCE WITH STA E BIDS RECEIVED H BID REQUIREM	ANDARD  , EITHER ENTS.
Ву:	ala Ippensehnidt (Purchasing Agent)	Ļ	Date: 06/03/20	15	

The School Board of Broward County, Florida, prohibits any policy or procedure which results in discrimination on the basis of age, color, disability, gender expression, national origin, marital status, race, religion, sex or sexual orientation. Individuals who wish to file a discrimination complaint, may call the Executive Director, Benefits & EEO Compliance at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

Bid Title: Art Equipment

Bid No.: 16-012N Buyer/Purchasing Agent: Carla Depperschmidt

X	THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA	LORI	DA								
3	BID TABULATION SHEET				Commerci	Commercial Art Supply			DGS Educ	DGS Educational Products	
				Bid Unit	Bid Price		Pref.Price	Bid Unit	Bid Price		Pref Price
Item	$\neg$	£	Unit	Price	Extension	Unti Price	Extension	Price	Extension	Unti Price	Extension
-	Bin, Clay with Weding Board	2 ea		\$ 1,280.00	\$ 2,560.00			\$ 1,188.00	\$ 2,376.00		
2	Cutter, Mat	2 ea		\$ 495.00	00.066 \$			\$ 559.00	1118.00		
				İ				1	•		
8	Cutter, Paper & Board Rotary	90 ea		\$ 427.89	\$ 38,510.10			\$ 419.00	\$ 37,710.00		
4	Sink Unit	+									
∢	Sink Unit - 28' High	2 ea		No Bid	No Bid			Pio ON	7:0 ° N		
В	Sink Unit - 36' High			No Bid	No Bid			No Bid			
	Total Bid Item 4 (A-B)	H		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid		
L	7000			- 1					1		
0	Nack, Drying	8 ea		\$ 1,899.00	\$ 15,192.00			\$ 2,150.00	\$ 17,200.00		
9	Wheel, Electric Potter's with Stool & Splash-Pan	5.		No Bio	No Big			\$ 4500,00			
								4 1,666.00	\$ 6,440.00		
7	Table, Art										
∢	Table, Art - Elementary School	18 ea		No Bid	No Bid			\$ 975.00	\$ 17 550 00		
В	iol	25 ea		No Bid	No Bid			\$ 975.00	1		
O	loo	10 ea		No Bid	No Bid			1	1		
	Total Bid Item 7 (A-C)			No Bid	No Bid			1	1		
c		+									
0		1									
∢ (	Kiln, Electric	2 ea		No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid		
20		4 sets	ts	No Bid	No Bid			No Bid	No Bid		
0		48 sets	ts	No Bid	No Bid			\$ 38.00	\$ 1,824.00		
	Total Bid Item 8 (A-C)	1		No Bid	No Bid				\$ 1,824.00		
σ	Cabinat	1	İ								
٥	Cabinet Dang-Proof										
В	Cabinet: Drying	7 7		4 779 00	4,580.00			\$ 2,088.00	\$ 4,176.00		
	Total Bid Item 9 (A-B)	-	Ī		1				- 1		
	11	+							\$ 11,372.00		
10	Cabinet Storage	1									
A	Cabinet Storage, Flammable One Shelf	2 ea		1	s				3 296 00		
മ	Cabinet Storage, Flammable Two Shelf	2 ea		\$ 1,500.00	\$ 3,000.00			\$ 1,948.00	3.896.00		
	Total Bid Item 10 (A-B)	H			\$						
=	Box, Light	8 ea		\$ 415.00	\$ 3,320.00			\$ 534.00	\$ 4,272.00		
		-									
REMARKS:	KKS: AFT WAS APPROVED BY: Donna Havnes- Art Sunervisor K-12 Carla Den	rogere	midt Durch	Agon Agon							
RIDS RF	BIOS RECEIVED WERE EVALUATED BY: Donna Havines, Art Supervisor, K-12, Calla Deppelschmidt,	pperson	Mildt, ruicie	, Purchasing Agent	:						

## ITB 16-012N ART EQUIPMENT BID REJECTION SHEET

## Item 7

Reject bid from <u>DGS Educational Products</u>. Section 5, Bid Summary Sheet, bid specifications states, "Base consists of tapered pedestal legs fitted into feet and perpendicular top bracing..." Descriptive literature for Item 7 is for straight leg table (A2) which does not meet bid specifications.

## Item 8

Reject bid from <u>DGS Educational Products</u>. Special Conditions 3 states, "For items in groups, it is necessary to bid on every item in the group, and all items in the group must meet specifications in order to be considered for award." Bidder only bid on one item in this group.