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G19550 4020294 TIRE-NEW,255/70R22.5 H G661HSA 756-165-337 $ 301.65 $236.74 27% $371.61 -19% $301.56 0% $288.00 5% $241.24 25%
G19556 4020303 TIRE-NEW, 195-70R14 Conquest 768-827-827 $ 60.19 $69.68 -14% $85.83 -30% $61.44 -2% NO BID $70.68 -15%
G19558 4020307 TIRE-NEW, 195-65R15 187-405-016 N/A $68.87 $90.87 $63.90 NO BID $69.87
G19559 4030110 TIRE-NEW, 225-50R17 EAGLE RSA 732 515 500 $ 119.19 $103.91 15% $128.39 -7% $119.19 0% NO BID $102.91 16%
G19570 4020311 TIRE-NEW, 215/75R15P 795-654-910 N/A $82.71 $99.56 $62.50 NO BID $84.71
G19599 4020320 TIRE-NEW, 27-950 X 15 TRACTOR 310-490-511  N/A $206.06 NO BID $239.62 NO BID $206.06
G19607 4020335 TIRE-NEW, 8-14.5 BIAS (11/32) 141-678-320 N/A NO BID NO BID $123.46 NO BID $87.45
G19614 4020352 TIRE-NEW, 225/60R-16 LOAD V 732-354-148  $ 95.52 $90.31 6% $108.71 -12% $84.21 13% NO BID $92.31 3%
G19616 4020355 TIRE-NEW,1000X20 BIAS-TRAILERS N/A NO BID $0.00 NO BID NO BID $196.11
G19624 4020371 TIRE-NEW, P235-70R16 WRL SR-A OWL 183-407-418 $ 117.14 $101.34 16% $121.29 -3% $237.00 -51% NO BID $102.34 14%
G19626 4020376 TIRE-NEW, P205-75R14 (10/32) 772-096-105 N/A $74.68 $76.55 $117.14 NO BID $61.70
G19627 4031850 TIRE-NEW, ST235/80R16E 762-394-406 $ 125.69 $184.56 -32% $264.46 -52% $72.76 73% NO BID NO BID
G19628 4020378 TIRE-NEW, 8R19.5 (14/32) G647 139-699-704 N/A $108.61 $161.61 $251.67 NO BID $184.56
G19630 4020383 TIRE-NEW,LT245-75R16 (14/32) WRL HT 744-395-900 $ 133.30 NO BID NO BID $133.30 0% NO BID $110.11 21%
G19631 4020387 TIRE-NEW,215 60R 16 ASSURANCE 736-276-285 $ 77.15 $84.99 -9% $101.90 -24% $70.00 10% NO BID $85.99 -10%
G19633 4020394 TIRE-NEW,1000R15 RADIAL 16/32 N/A NO BID NO BID $250.58 NO BID NO BID
G19634 4020395 TIRE-NEW,LT245/75R-17 E 748-636-189 $ 173.47 $119.62 45% $161.61 7% $156.28 11% NO BID $121.12 43%
G19636 4020400 TIRE-NEW, 245/70R 19.5 G159 N/A $237.84 $270.69 $337.47 NO BID $241.84
G19637 4020403 TIRE-NEW, 235-55R17 POLICE 732-002-500 $ 111.90 $103.38 8% $124.23 -10% $112.27 0% NO BID $105.38 6%
G19639 4020407 TIRE-NEW, P205-75R15 (10/32) 772-694-105 N/A NO BID $75.39 $62.50 NO BID NO BID
G19639T 4020410 TIRE-NEW, 205-75-15 TRAILER N/A NO BID NO BID $76.99 NO BID NO BID
G19640 4020411 TIRE-NEW, 225-75R15 (11/32) N/A $87.83 $113.50 $92.02 NO BID $89.83
G19640T 4020414 TIRE-NEW, ST225-75R-15 TRAILER 762-173-406 $ 91.75 $66.79 37% NO BID $91.75 0% NO BID $86.06 7%
G19641 4020415 TIRE-NEW,LT 235-75R15 (12/32) 727-699-950 N/A $102.17 $134.22 $123.13 NO BID $103.67
G19642 4020418 TIRE-NEW, LT235-85R16 (14/32) 744-825-802 N/A $113.30 $169.56 $128.71 NO BID $114.80
G19643 4020422 TIRE-NEW, LT215-85R16 (13/32) 744-820-802 N/A $102.02 $168.10 $132.25 NO BID $103.52
G19644 4020426 TIRE-NEW, 195-75R14 (10/32) 772-854-105 N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
G19648 4020436 TIRE-NEW,10R22.5 G G661 HSA 138-948-337 $ 342.68 $283.06 21% $354.28 -3% $322.12 6% $310.00 11% $290.06 18%
G19649 4020440 TIRE-NEW,11R22.5 G G661 HSA 138-953-337  $ 342.68 $259.45 32% $385.46 -11% $322.12 6% $353.45 -3% $261.95 31%
G19654 4020452 TIRE-NEW,LT225/75R16E (13/32) 744-830-900 $ 123.39 $109.53 13% $153.21 -19% $122.50 1% NO BID $111.53 11%
G19660 4020467 TIRE-NEW, P255-70R16 {12/32} 132-840-494 N/A $112.11 $142.34 $118.96 NO BID $114.11
G19661 4020468 TIRE-NEW,275-70R-22.5{275-80R} 756 073903 N/A $257.51 $392.98 $315.27 $325.00 $262.51
G19663 4032850 TIRE-NEW,245/65R/17 N/A $96.27 $138.42 $128.00 NO BID $98.27
G19664 4032940 TIRE-NEW, 225-70R-15 FD RANGER 183-482-418 $ 92.18 $85.98 7% $96.61 -5% $92.50 0% NO BID $87.98 5%
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